ORDINANCE NO. 1738

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY
OF SAN CLEMENTE, CALIFORNIA, AMENDING TITLE
15 CHAPTERS 15.05, 15.08, 15.11, 15.12, 15.14, 15.16,
15.17, 15.18, 1520, 15.22, 1523 AND TITLE 8
CHAPTER 8.16 OF THE SAN CLEMENTE MUNICIPAL
CODE AND, ADOPTING BY REFERENCE THE 2022
CALIFORNIA  BUILDING  STANDARDS CODE
(CALIFORNIA CODE OF REGULATIONS, TITLE 24),
CONSISTING IN PART OF THE 2022
ADMINISTRATIVE CODE, THE 2022 CALIFORNIA
BUILDING CODE, THE 2022 CALIFORNIA
RESIDENTIAL CODE, THE 2022 CALIFORNIA
ELECTRICAL CODE, THE 2022 CALIFORNIA
MECHANICAL CODE, THE 2022 CALIFORNIA
PLUMBING CODE, THE 2022 CALIFORNIA FIRE
CODE, THE 2022 CALIFORNIA GREEN BUILDING
STANDARDS CODE, THE 2022 CALIFORNIA ENERGY
CODE, THE 2022 CALIFORNIA HISTORICAL
BUILDING CODE, THE 2022 CALIFORNIA EXISTING
BUILDING CODE, AND THE 2022 CALIFORNIA
REFERENCED STANDARDS CODE, TOGETHER WITH
CERTAIN ADDITIONS, AMENDMENTS AND
DELETIONS

WHEREAS, Health & Safety Code Section 17958 mandates that the City of San
Clemente (“City”) adopt ordinances or regulations imposing the requirements of certain
uniform industry codes adopted by the State pursuant to Health & Safety Code Section
17922; and

WHEREAS, the State of California is mandated by Health & Safety Code Section 17922
to impose the same requirements as are contained in the uniform codes. The State
adopts and publishes codes every three years for building and construction throughout
the State (hereinafter referred to collectively as “Codes”); and

WHEREAS, the California Building Standards Commission recently adopted the 2022
Edition of the California Building Standards Code; and

WHEREAS, pursuant to Government Code section 50022.1 et seq., the City may adopt
by reference the California Building Standards Code, 2022 Edition as provided in Title
24 of the California Code of Regulations and other codes; and

WHEREAS, Health & Safety Code Section 17958.5 and 18941.5 permit the City to
adopt the California Building Standards Code and to make such changes or



Ordinance No. 1738 Page 2

modifications to the Codes as are reasonably necessary because of local climatic,
geological, or topographical conditions; and

WHEREAS, the Building Official and Director of Community Development have
recommended that changes and modifications be made to certain Codes and have
advised that said changes and modifications to the California Building Code, 2022
Edition: the California Residential Code, 2022 Edition; the California Electrical Code,
2022 Edition; the California Mechanical Code, 2022 Edition; the California Plumbing
Code, 2022 Edition; and the Existing Building Code, 2022 Edition are reasonably
necessary due to local conditions in the City of San Clemente and have further advised
that the remainder of said changes and modifications are of an administrative or
procedural nature, or concern themselves with subjects not covered by the Code or are
reasonably necessary to safeguard life and property within the City of San Clemente.
Also the various parts of the California Building Standards Code shall also be adopted
by ordinance to include the 2022 California Administrative Code, the 2022 California
Energy Code, the 2022 California Green Building Standards Code, the 2022 California
Historical Building Code, and the 2022 California Referenced Standards Code with no
local amendments.

The California Fire Code, 2022 Edition changes and modifications developed by Orange
County Fire Authority are included in this ordinance.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED by the City Council for the City of San
Clemente as follows:

The City of San Clemente adopts the following parts of the 2022 California Building
Standards Codes with certain local additions, amendments, and deletions, amending
the San Clemente Municipal Code,

Title 15 Buildings and Construction
Chapter 15.08 Building Code
Chapter 15.12 Electrical Code
Chapter 15.16 Mechanical Code
Chapter 15.20 Plumbing Code
Chapter 15.22 Residential Code
Chapter 15.23 Existing Building Code

Title 15 Building and Construction, the remaining parts of the 2022 California Building
Standards Codes that the City is not amending.

Chapter 15.05 Administrative Code

Chapter 15.11 Energy Code

Chapter 15.14 Green Building Standards Code

Chapter 15.17 Historical Building Code

Chapter 15.18 Referenced Standards Code

Title 8 Health and Safety
Chapter 8.16 Fire Code Amended by Orange County Fire Authority




Ordinance No. 1738 Page 3

Section 1. Recitals. The recitals above are each incorporated by reference and
adopted as findings by the City Council.

Findings. Based on the foregoing and the below findings, the City Council of the
City of San Clemente does hereby find that the proposed amendments to each of
the sections of the 2022 Edition of the California Building Standards Code to be
amended, added, modified, changed, or deleted are reasonably necessary for
reasons of local climatic, geologic, and topographic conditions as set forth in
“Exhibit A” of this Ordinance. The City Council finds and determines there is a
need to adopt the changes or modifications to the Codes because of local climatic,
topographical, and geological conditions as follows:

Section 2. Findings. The City Council finds and determines there is a need to
adopt the changes or modifications to the Codes because of local climatic,
topographical, and geological conditions as follows:

l. Climatic Conditions

A.

The jurisdiction of San Clemente is located in a semi-arid Mediterranean type
climate. It annually experiences extended periods of high temperatures with
little or no precipitation. Hot, dry (Santa Ana) winds, which may reach speeds
of 70 m.p.h. or greater are also common to the area. These climatic conditions
cause extreme drying of vegetation and common building materials. Frequent
periods of drought and low humidity add to the fire danger. This predisposes
the area to large destructive fires (conflagration). In addition to directly
damaging or destroying buildings, these fires also disrupt utility services
throughout the area.

The climate alternates between extended periods of drought and brief flooding
conditions. Flood conditions may affect the local fire authority’s ability to
respond to a fire or emergency condition. Floods also disrupt utility services to
buildings and facilities within the City.

. Water demand in this densely populated area far exceeds the quantity

supplied by natural precipitation; and, although the population continues to
grow, the already-taxed water supply does not. California is projected to
increase in population by nearly 10 million over the next quarter of a century
with 50 percent of that growth centered in Southern California. Due to storage
capacities and consumption and a limited amount of rainfall, future water
allocation is not fully dependable. This necessitates the need for additional on-
site fire protection features.

These dry climatic conditions and winds contribute to the rapid spread of even
small fires originating in high-density housing or vegetation. These fires
spread very quickly and create a need for increased levels of fire protection.



Ordinance No. 1738 Page 4

The added protection of fire sprinkler systems and other fire protection
features will supplement normal fire department response by providing
immediate protection for the building occupants and by containing and
controlling the fire spread to the area of origin. Fire sprinkler systems will also
reduce the use of water for firefighting by as much as 50 to 75 percent.

These climatic conditions are applicable to amendments to the 2022
California Building Code Sections 901.2, 903.2, 903.2.8, 1505.1, and to the
2022 California Fire Code Sections 903, 1201, 2808, 4906.3.

Topographical Conditions:

A.

Natural slopes of 15 percent or greater generally occur throughout the City.
The elevation change caused by the hills creates the geological foundation on
which communities within the City are built and will continue to build. With
much of the populated flatlands already built upon, future growth will occur on
steeper slopes and greater constraints in terrain.

Traffic and circulation congestion is an artificially created, obstructive
topographical condition, which is common throughout the City.

These topographical conditions combine to create a situation, which places
fire department response time to fire occurrences at risk, and makes it
necessary to provide automatic on-site fire-extinguishing systems and other
protection measures to protect occupants and property.

These topographical conditions are applicable to amendments to 2022
California Building Code Sections 3109.2, the 2022 California Residential
Code Sections R313., R404.2, R602, R1001, the 2022 California Fire Code
Sections 305, 307, 903, 1201, 2808, 4909.

Geological Conditions:

A.

The City is a densely populated area that has buildings constructed over
and/or near a vast and complex network of faults that are believed to be
capable of producing future earthquakes similar or greater in size than the
1994 Northridge and the 1971 Sylmar earthquakes. Earthquake faults run
along the northeast and southwest boundaries of Orange County. The
Newport-Inglewood Fault, located within Orange County was the source of the
destructive 1933 Long Beach earthquake (6.3 magnitude) which took 120 lives
and damaged buildings in an area that ran from Laguna Beach to Marina Del
Rey to Whittier. In December 1989, another earthquake occurred in the City of
Irvine at an unknown fault line. Regional planning for reoccurrence of
earthquakes is recommended by the State of California, Department of
Conservation.

Previous earthquakes have been accompanied by disruption of traffic flow and
fires. A severe seismic event has the potential to negatively impact any
rescue or fire suppression activities because it is likely to create obstacles
similar to those indicated under sections above. With the probability of strong
aftershocks there exists a need to provide increased protection for anyone on
upper floors of buildings. The October 17, 1989, Santa Cruz earthquake
resulted in one major fire in the Marina District (San Francisco). When



Ordinance No. 1738 Page 5

combined with the 34 other fires locally and over 500 responses, the
department was taxed to its fullest capabilities. The Marina fire was difficult to
contain because mains supplying water to the district burst during the
earthquake. This situation creates the need for both additional fire protection
and automatic on-site fire protection for building occupants. The State
Department of Conservation noted, in their 1988 report (Planning Scenario on
a Major Earthquake on the Newport Inglewood Fault Zone, page 59),
“unfortunately, barely meeting the minimum earthquake standards of building
codes places a building on the verge of being legally unsafe.”

C. Road circulation features located throughout the City also make amendments
reasonably necessary. There are major roadways, highways and flood control
channels that create barriers and slow response times. Hills, slopes, street
and storm drain design accompanied by occasional heavy rainfall, cause
roadway flooding and landslides and at times may make an emergency access
route impassable.

D. Soils throughout the City possess corrosive properties that reduce the
expected usable life of water services when metallic pipes come in contact
with these soils.

E. Expansive soils throughout the City combined with predominant hillside
conditions, groundwater and occasional flooding raise the potential for ground
slippage, ground erosion, slope failure and building damage.

F. Portions of Orange County contain active or former oil production fields.
These areas contain a variety of naturally occurring gasses, liquids and
vapors. These compounds present toxicity or flammability hazards to building
occupants. Evaluation of these hazards and the risks they pose to
development is necessary implement for appropriate mitigation.

G. Due to the topographical conditions of sprawling development separated by
waterways and narrow and congested streets and the expected infrastructure
damage inherent in seismic zone described above, it is prudent to rely on
automatic fire sprinkler systems to mitigate extended fire department response
time and keep fires manageable with reduced fire flow (water) requirements for
a given structures. Additional fire protection is also justified to match the
current resources of firefighting equipment and personnel within the Orange
County Fire Authority.

H. These geological conditions are applicable to amendments to the 2022
California Building Code Sections 1502.4, 1505, tbl 1807.1.6, 1904, the 2022
California Electrical Code Section 300.5 the 2022 California Mechanical Code
Sections 504.3, 1308, the 2022 California Plumbing Code Sections 604.2,
609.3,610.8, 701.1, 1208.5.3.1, the 2022 California Residential Code Sections
R402.2, R404.2, R602.

Furthermore the City Council finds that the proposed amendments to the various codes
meets the State mandate for local medifications to the State Standard Building Codes
being more restrictive and reasonably necessary because of local climatic, geological or
topographical conditions.



Ordinance No. 1738 Page 6

Additional amendments are found to be either administrative or procedural in nature or
to concern themselves with subjects not covered in the Codes. They are necessary for
administrative clarification, and do not modify a building standard pursuant to California
Health & Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.7, and/or 18941.5. These administrative
amendments establish administrative standards for the effective enforcement of the
building standards in the City. The changes made include provisions making each of
said Codes compatible with other codes enforced by the City and fee schedules.

A copy of this Ordinance adopting the 2022 California Building Standards Code, as
amended, shall be filed with the California Building Standards Commission by the City
Clerk of the City of San Clemente.

Section 3. CEQA Findings. The City Council finds that this ordinance is not
subject to the requirements of California Environmental Quality Act (‘CEQA") for the
following reasons:

A. This Ordinance is not a “project” within the meaning of State CEQA
Guidelines, section 15378, because it has no potential for resulting in
direct or indirect physical change in the environment.

B. This Ordinance is exempt under section 15061(b)(3), the general rule
exemption, because it can be seen with certainty that there is no
possibility that this code amendment will have a significant effect on the
environment.

Code Amendments. Based on the foregoing, the City Council of the City of San
Clemente does hereby find that the proposed amendments to the 2022 Edition of
the California Building Standards Code are reasonably necessary for reasons of
local climatic, geologic, and topographic conditions as set forth in “Exhibit A" of this
Ordinance. The following amendments are made to the below-listed sections,
subdivisions, and subsections of Title 15 of the San Clemente Municipal Code:

Section 4.
“Section 15.05.010 2022 Administrative Code Adopted
Where Filed, is hereby amended to read as follows:
The 2022 California Administrative Code is hereby adopted
and a copy held for public review in the Building
Division.
Chapter 15.08. 2022 Building Code is hereby amended as follows:

Chapter 15.08 BUILDING CODE



Ordinance No. 1738 Page 7

15.08.010 Building Code Adopted — Where filed.

15.08.020 Division |l of Chapter 1 amended — administration.

15.08.025 Chapter 2 amended — Definitions.

15.08.030 Chapter 4 amended — Special Detailed Requirements
Based on Use and Occupancy.

15.08.035 Chapter 7A amended — Materials and Construction
Methods for Exterior Wildfire Exposure.

15.08.040 Chapter 9 amended — Fire Protection Systems.

15.08.050 Chapter 15 amended — Roof Assemblies and Rooftop
Structures.

15.08.060 Chapter 18 amended — Soils and Foundations.

15.08.070 Chapter 31 amended — Special Construction.

15.08.080 Reserved.

15.08.090 Reserved.

15.08.100 Construction of Off-Street Parking Lots.

Section 15.08.010 Building Code Adopted — Where filed.

For the purpose of prescribing regulations for erection,
construction, enlargement, alteration, replacement, repair,
improvement, removal, movement, conversion, demolition,
use and occupancy, equipment, height, location,
maintenance, and areas of every building or structure or any
appurtenances connected or attached to such building or
structure in the City, the California Building Code (“CBC"),
2022 Edition, based on the 2021 International Building Code
as published by the International Code Council, including
Chapter 1 and Appendix |, is hereby adopted, as modified in
this Chapter. A copy is on file for public examination in the
City's Building Division Office.

15.08.020 Division Il of Chapter 1 amended —
Administration.

Division Il of Chapter 1 of CBC is hereby amended as
follows:

A. Subsection 101.1 is hereby amended to read in its
entirety as follows:

101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the
San Clemente Building Code, hereinafter referred to
as “this code.”



Ordinance No. 1738

Subsection 101.2 is hereby amended to read in its
entirety as follows:

101.2 Scope. The provisions of this code shall apply
to the construction, alteration, relocation,
enlargement, replacement, repair, equipment, use
and occupancy, location, maintenance, removal and
demolition of every building or structure or any
appurtenances connected or attached to such
buildings or structures.

Exception: Detached one- and two-family
dwellings and multiple single-family dwellings
(townhouses) not more than three stories above
grade plane in height with a separate means of
egress and their accessory structures not more
than three stories above grade plane in height,
shall comply with the California Residential Code.

The provisions of these codes shall apply to and
affect all of the territory of the City of San
Clemente, except work located primarily in a
public way, public utility towers and poles,
mechanical equipment not specifically regulated in
these codes, hydraulic flood control structures,
facilities for the production, generation, storage or
transmission of water or electrical energy by a
local agency, and except as exempted by these
codes.

C. Section 101.2.1 Appendices is amended to add a

se

ntence to read: Appendix | Patio Covers is adopted by

reference.

D. Subsection 101.4. is hereby amended to read in its
entirety as follows:

E. A

101.4 Referenced codes. The other codes listed in
Sections 101.4.1 through 101.4.7 and referenced
elsewhere in this code shall be considered part of the
requirements of this code to the prescribed extent of
each such reference.

new Subsection 101.4.8 is hereby added to Section

101 to read in its entirety as follows:

Page 8



Ordinance No. 1738

101.4.8 Green Code. The provisions of the California
Green Building Standards Code shail apply to design
and consiruction of buildings for sustainability.

F. Subsection 105.2 is hereby amended by delefing items
1 through 13 under the heading “Building” and replacing
them with the following:

Building:

1

o2

One-story detached accessory buildings and
structures wused as tool and storage sheds,
playhouses and similar uses and structures such
as portable shade cloth structures, provided the
floor area does not exceed 120 square feet or a
wall height of 3 feet. Such structures must comply
with the setback and height requirements of the
City Zoning Ordinance and the Fire Code.

Fenwves not over 6 feel high. Masonry fences
under 42 inches in height above finish grade.

QOil derricks.

Retaining walls that are not over 4 feet in height
measured from the bottom of footing to the top of
wall unless supporting a surcharge, impounding
Class [, Il or IIIA liquids, or if on & slope less than 1
in 3. Retaining walls on slopes greater than 1in 3
are required to be reviewed by engineering and
planning divisions to determine if permitting is
required,

Water tanks supported directly on grade if the
capacity does not exceed 5,000 gallons and the
ratio of height to diameter or width does not
exceed 2:1 and not on or within 7 feet of a
descending slope.

Detached decks, platforms or similar structures
not exceeding 200 square feel in area, walkways,
sidewalks and driveways that are not more than
30 inche:s above adjacent grade, and not over any
basement or story below, and are not part of a

Page 9



Ordinance No. 1738

H.

required exit means of egress, and are not part of
an accessible route.

7. Painting, papering, tiling (except shower
enclosures), carpeting, cabinets, counter tops and
similar finish work that does not involve electrical,
mechanical or plumbing work.

8. Temporary motion picture, television and theater
stage sets and scenery when approved by special
use permit.

9. Prefabricated swimming pools accessory to a
Group R-3 occupancy that are less than 18 inches
deep, do not exceed 5,000 gallons and are
installed entirely above ground.

10.Shade cloth structures constructed for nursery or
agricultural purposes, not including service
systems that meet zoning requirements.

11.Swings and other playground equipment
accessory to detached one- and two-family
dwellings.

12.Window awnings supported by an exterior wall
that do not project more than 54 inches from the
exterior wall and do not require additional support
of Group R-3 and U occupancies.

13.Non-fixed and movable fixtures, cases, racks,
counters and partitions not over 5 feet 9 inches in
height.

14. Ground mounted Radio and television antenna,
and flagpoles not higher than the setback from the
property line and not more than 20 feet (20) feet in
height measured from grade. Small dish receivers
mounted on Residential uses.

Unless otherwise exempted, separate plumbing,
electrical and mechanical permits will be required for
the above-exempted items.

Page 10

Subsection 105.3 #8 is here by added to read in its entirety as

follows:



Ordinance No. 1738

8.

Electric Vehicle Charging Stations shall be expedited

per AB 1236. The checklist derived from the Zero-
Emission Vehicles in California posted on the City web
site may be used to apply for permits and may be
submitted electronically. HOA approval not required.

I. Subsection 105.3.2 is hereby amended to read in its

entirety as follows:

105.3.2 Time limitation of application. An
application for a permit for any proposed work shall
be deemed to have been abandoned 12 months after
the date of filing, unless such application has been
pursued in good faith or permit has been issued;
except that the building official is authorized to grant
one or more extensions of time for additional periods
not exceeding 90 days each. The extension shall be
requested in writing and justifiable cause
demonstrated. The total period of application
extensions granted shall not exceed an additional 18
months. In order to renew action on an application
after expiration, the applicant shall resubmit plans and
pay a new plan check fee.

Subsection 105.5 is hereby amended to read in its
entirety as follows:

105.5 Expiration. Every permit issued shall become
invalid unless the work on the site authorized by such
permit is commenced within 12 months after its
issuance, or if the work authorized on the site by such
permit is suspended, abandoned, or if an inspection is
not requested within a period of 180 days and an
approved inspection that shows work is progressing.

Any permittee holding an unexpired permit may apply
for an extension of the time within which work may
commence under that permit when the permittee is
unable to commence work within the time required.
The extension shall be requested in writing prior to
the permit expiring and show justifiable cause
demonstrating that circumstances beyond the control
of the permittee have prevented action from being
taken. Pursuant to this paragraph, the Building
Official or his/her designee is authorized to grant, in

Page 11



Ordinance No. 1738

K.

writing, one or more extensions of time for a period
not more than 180 days. The completion of
construction shall not extend beyond the timeframes
mandated in Section 105.8 of this code even with
such extension.

Before such work can be recommenced after a permit
expires, a new permit shall first be obtained, and a fee
therefore shall be one half the amount required for a
new permit for such work, provided no changes have
been made or will be made in the original plans and
specifications for such work, and provided further that
such suspension or abandonment has not exceeded
one year. In order to renew action on a permit after
this one year time period, the permittee shall pay a
new full permit fee.

A new Subsection 105.8 is hereby added to Section
105 to read in its entirety as follows:

105.8 Completion of construction. Notwithstanding
subsection 105.5 above, all construction shall be
completed by the owner, owner's agent, or the
permittee and approved by the City within the
following time frame:

a. New residential buildings construction . . . 24 months

b. Residential room additions and remodels . . .

12 months

Tenant improvements . . . 12 months
Pools/spas . . . 12 months

Patio covers and similar structures . . . 6 months
Fences and/or retaining walls . . . 6 months

@=0ao

6 months
h. All other minor alterations . . . 6 months

Upon written request of the owner or permittee, the
Building  Official and/or  his/her  designated
representative may extend the period for completion
of construction for a period not to exceed one
hundred eighty (180) days. The written request must
demonstrate that (1) due to circumstances beyond the
owner's or permittee's control, construction could not
be completed in the required construction period; (2)
that reasonable progress has been made; (3) that the
condition of the property presents no health or safety
hazard; and (4) that the continued delay will not

Water heaters, water softeners, and air conditioners . . .

Page 12



Ordinance No. 1738

L.

M.

create any unreasonable visual or physical detriment
to the neighborhood. Any extension beyond one
hundred eighty (180) days must be approved by the
City Manager.

A new Subsection 105.9 is hereby added to Section
105 toread in its entirety as follows.

105.9 Maintenance of property during
construction. During construction, all property shall
be maintained in a reasonably clean and well-kept
manner. All lumber and building materials shall be
neatly piled or stacked in a safe manner and stored in
the rear yard of the residential property or inside the
building construction perimeter, except that building
materials may be stored in a front yard for a period
not to exceed thirty (30) days. A waiver of this
requirement may be obtained from the Building
Official or his/her designated representative if the
construction is screened from view from adjacent
occupied or public property with fencing materials
approved by city zoning and building regulations. Any
building that is left unsecured by the absence of doors
or windows during construction shall secure those
openings or provide fencing to prevent unauthorized
entry.

A new Subsection 107.2.9 is hereby added to Section
107 to read in its entirety as follows:

107.2.9 Soil report. A Soil Report shall be submitted
with all permit applications for new construction and
additions.  Soil Reports shall be prepared by a
professional engineer licensed by the State to prepare
such reports. The Building Official may waive this
requirement if he/she finds that the scope of work
applied for does not necessitate a soil report.

Subsection 107.3 is hereby amended to add a second
paragraph that reads as follows:

When submittal documents are required by Section
107.1, a plan review fee shall be paid at the time of
submitting the submittal documents for plan review.
Said plan review fees are separate fees from the
permit fees specified in Section 109.2 and are in

Page 13



Ordinance No. 1738 Page 14

addition to the permit fees. Said plan review fee shall
be as set forth in the City Council Fee Resolution.

0. Subsection 107.5 is hereby amended to add a second
paragraph that reads as follows:

The approved plans, permit application, inspection
card and other construction documents required by
the Building Official shall be imaged after the final
inspection and will be a permanent record in the City.
The applicant shall pay the cost of imaging at the time
of permit.

P.  Subsection 109.2 is hereby amended by adding a
sentence at the end to read as follows:

The fee for each permit shall be as set forth in the
City Council Fee Resolution unless otherwise
specified by the code.

Q. Subsection 109.3 is hereby amended to add a second
paragraph that reads as follows:

The Building Official shall make the determination of
value or valuation under any provisions of this code.
The valuation shall be determined by using rational
methods established by the Building Official that
reasonably establish the construction value or the
contract price of the actual construction cost. The
value of work to be used in computing the Building
Permit and Building Plan Review fees shall be the
total value of all construction work for which the
permit is issued, as well as all finish work, painting,
roofing, electrical, plumbing, heating, air conditioning,
elevators, fire extinguishing systems and any other
permanent equipment.

R. Subsection 109.4 is hereby amended to add a second
paragraph that reads as follows:

An investigation fee, in addition to the permit fee. The
investigation fee shall be equal to the amount of the
permit fee required by this code. The payment of
such investigation fee shall not exempt any person
from compliance with all other provisions of this code
nor from any penalty prescribed by law.



Ordinance No. 1738

S.

Subsection 109.6 is hereby amended to read in its
entirety as follows:

109.6 Refunds. The building official is authorized to
establish a refund policy. The building official may
authorize refunding of any fee paid hereunder which
was erroneously paid or collected as provided below.

The building official may authorize refunding of not
more than 80 percent of the permit fee paid when no
work has been done under a permit issued in
accordance with this code.

The building official may authorize refunding of not
more than 80 percent of the plan review fee paid
when an application for a permit for which a plan
review has been paid is withdrawn or canceled before
any plan reviewing is done.

The building official shall not authorize refunding of
any fee paid except on written application filed by the
original permittee not later than 180 days after the
date of payment.

Subsection 109.7 is hereby added to Section 109 to
read in its entirety as follows:

109.7 Deposit. The Building Official may require a
deposit or bond from the applicant for a certain project
or work in order to secure the request of final
inspection approvals from the applicant or the
repairing of damaged City properties during the period
of construction. The deposit money will be refunded
to the applicant when the final inspections are
approved or the damages are repaired to the
satisfaction of the City. The deposit amount shall not
be more than twice the permit fee.

Subsection 110.7 is hereby added to Section 110 to
read in its entirety as follows:

110.7 Re-inspections. A re-inspection fee may be
assessed for each inspection or re-inspection when
such portion of work for which an inspection is

Page 15



Ordinance No. 1738

requested is not complete or when previous
corrections are not corrected.

This subsection is not to be interpreted as requiring
re-inspection fees the first time a job is rejected for
failure to comply with requirements of this Code, but
as controlling the practice of calling for inspections
before the job is ready for such inspection or re-
inspection.

Re-inspection fees may be assessed when the
inspection record card is not posted or otherwise
made available on the work site, or when the
approved plans are not readily available to the
inspector, or for failure to provide access on the date
for which inspection is requested.

To obtain a re-inspection, the applicant shall pay the
re-inspection fee as established by the City Council
Fee Resolution. In instances where re-inspection
fees have been assessed, no additional inspection of
work will be performed until the required re-inspection
fees have been paid.

15.08.025 Chapter 2 amended — Definitions.

Chapter 2 of CBC is hereby amended as follows:

A. The definition of “Bedroom” is added to Section 202 to
read as follows:

Bedroom. A room, space, or area used for sleeping.
A bedroom may also be determined by having a
privacy door, an emergency escape and rescue
opening, smoke alarms, a closet, location, minimum
ceiling height and floor areas, and design typically
found for bedrooms. Indicating on building plans other
designated uses does not permit the elimination of the
habitation and life safety measures the code
established for sleeping areas.

B. The definition of “Kitchen or Kitchenette” in Section 202 is
hereby amended to read as follows:

Kitchen or Kitchenette. A room, space, or area for the
preparation and cooking of food. The installation of
equipment, appliances, kitchen sink, garbage disposal,

Page 16



Ordinance No. 1738

240 volt outlets, gas piping, refrigerator, dedicated
20amp outlets, exhaust hood, counters, under or over
counter cabinetry. Singly or a combination of any may
be used to identify a kitchen use.

C. The Definition of Spark Amesker in Section 202 is hereby

amended to read as follows:

SPARK ARRESTER. A listed device constructed of
noncombustible material specifically for the purpose
of preventing embers from the burning of solid fuel
from leaving the flue. All fireplaces that burm solid fuel
in accordance with California Building Code Chapter
28 shall be provided a spark arresiter. (note: no new
fireplaces buming solid fuel are permitted)

The Definition of “Swimiming Pool” in Section 202 is
hereby amended to read as follows:

SWIMMING POOL. Any structure intended for
swimming, recreational bathing or wading that
conlains water over 18 inches deep. This includes in-
ground, above-ground and on-ground pools; hot tubs;
spas and fixed-in-place wading pools.

15.08.030 Chapter 4 amended — Special Detailed
Requirements Based on Use and Occupancy.

Chapter 4 of CBC is hereby amended as follows:

A.

Subsection 406.24 Floor Surfaces. is hereby
amended by restating the second sentence as
follows, and by deleting exception #1:

The area of floor used for the parking of automobiles
or other vehicles shall be sloped to facilitate the
moverment of liquids to a drain or toward the main
vehicle entry doorway. A drainage system equipped
with a trench drain or floor drains leading to an
approved oil separator discharging to sewers in
accordance with the California Plumbing Code except
garages of R-3 occupancies.

15.08.035 Chapter TA amended — Materials and
Construction Methods for Exterior Wildfire Exposure.

Page 17



Ordinance No. 1738 Page 18

Chapter 7A of CBC is hereby amended as follows:

Subsection 710A.3.3 is hereby amended to read in its
entirety as follows:

710A.3.3 Detached accessory structures within 50
feet of an applicable building shall comply with the
requirements of this section.

15.08.040 Chapter 9 amended — Fire Protection
Systems.

Chapter 9 of CBC is hereby amended as follows:

Subsection 901.2 Fire protection systems is hereby
amended by adding:

Technical changes to this chapter are found in the
amendments to the California Fire Code as amended
including the referenced standards.

Subsection 903.2 is hereby amended to read in its entirety
as follows:

903.2 Where required. Approved automatic sprinkler
systems in buildings and structures shall be provided in the
locations described in this section and in Section 903.2 of
the California Fire Code as amended by the City of San
Clemente when one of the following conditions exists:

1. New buildings: In addition to the requirements of
section 903.2.1 through 903.2.19, approved
automatic sprinkler systems in new buildings,
structures and change of use shall be provided as
follows (Exception: Group R Detached one- two-
family dwellings and townhouses as required by
section 903.2.8):

i) Throughout all Groups A, |, E, and H
Occupancies

ii) Throughout all Group B, F, M, and S
Occupancies exceeding 1,000 square feet

iiyThroughout all Group U-1 Occupancies
exceeding 6,000 square feet



Ordinance No. 1738

For the purposes of this section, fire walls shall not
define separate buildings.

2. Alteration: When the floor area of the Alteration
within any two-year period exceeds 75% of area of
the existing structure and the alteration includes
structural modifications other than seismic upgrade.

3. Addition: Sprinkler protection shall be provided
throughout the entire building when:

1. Existing unsprinklered building less than
5,000 ft2: where 20% or more is added and
the gross floor areas exceed 5,000 square
feet.

2. Existing unsprinklered building equal or
greater than 5,000 ft>> where more than
1,000 ft?is added.

3. Fire sprinklers shall be provided in additions
to an existing building that has fire
sprinklers installed.

4. Change of use when required by that
use.

Subsection 903.2.8 is hereby amended to read in its entirety

as follows:

903.2.8 Group R. An automatic sprinkler system
installed in accordance with Subsection 903.3 of
Section 903 of this code and Subsection 903.3 of
Section 903 of the California Fire Code as amended
by the City of San Clemente shall be provided
throughout all buildings with a Group R fire area as
follows:
1. All new Group R occupancies, including the
attached garages
2. All existing Group R occupancies and U-1
garages when the total floor area is increase by
50% of the existing area over a 2-year period
3. All existing Group R occupancies and U-1
garages when the total area is increased by 750
square feet or more over a 2-year period
4. All existing Group R occupancies and U-1
garages when an additional story is added to the
structure regardless of the area involved

Page 19



Ordinance No. 1738

.

An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed
throughout any existing Group R Occupancy
building when the floor area of the Alteration or
Combination of an Addition and Alteration, within
any two year period, is 50% or more of area of
the existing structure and where the scope of the
work exposes building framing and facilitates
sprinkler installation and is such that the
Building/Fire Code Official determines that the
complexity of installing a sprinkler system would
be similar as in a new building.

Any addition to existing building that has fire
sprinklers installed.

Exceptions:

1.

Existing Group R-3 occupancies converted to
Group R-3.1 occupancies not housing
bedridden clients, not housing non-ambulatory
clients above the first floor and not housing
clients above the second floor.

Existing Group R-3 occupancies converted to
Group R-3.1 occupancies housing only one
bedridden client and complying with CBC
Section 425.8.3.3.

Pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section
13113 occupancies housing ambulatory
children only, none of whom are mentally ill or
mentally retarded, and the buildings or portions
thereof in which such children are housed are
not more than two stories in height, and
buildings or portions thereof housing such
children have an automatic fire alarm system
activated by approved smoke detectors.
Pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section
13143.6 occupancies licensed for protective
social care which house ambulatory clients
only, none of whom is a child (under the age of
18 years), or who is elderly (65 years of age or
over).

When not used in for an increase in height or area, an
automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance
with Section 903.3.1.2 shall be allowed in Group R-
2.1 occupancies.

Page 20



Ordinance No. 1738

15.08.050 Chapter 15 amended — Roof Assemblies and
Rooftop Structures.

Chapter 15 of CBC is hereby amended as follows:

A.

Subsection 1502.4 is hereby added by adding a
paragraph to read as follows:

Water that accumulates on a roof shall be effectively
drained and conveyed from the roof to a storm drain,
street gutter, or other locations approved by the
Building Official. Such water shall be conveyed
through gutters, leaders, associated piping or other
non-erodible surface drainage devices as approved
by the Building Official. For any minor or small roofs,
the Building Official may exempt this requirement.

Table 1505.1 in Subsection 1505.1 is hereby
amended to read as follows:

TABLE 1505.12

MINIMUM ROOF COVERING CLASSIFICATION

FOR TYPES OF CONSTRUCTION

Page 21

1A

=] [HA 1B A 1B [\ VA

VB

A

A A A A A A A

A

a. Unless otherwise required in accordance with Chapter 7A.

Subsections 1505.1.1, 1505.1.2, 1505.1.3 are hereby
deleted and replaced with a new Subsection 1505.1.1
to read in its entirety as follows:

1505.1.1 Roof Coverings. The roof covering or
roofing assembly on any new structure regulated by
this code shall be Class A fire retardant roof minimum
as classified in CBC Section 1505.2. Non-
combustible roof covering may be applied in
accordance with the manufacturer's requirements in
lieu of a fire retardant roofing assembly. Wood
roofing materials are prohibited unless pressure
treated and approved for fire retardant of Class A
minimum. For existing structure when ten percent
(10%) or more of the total roof area is re-roofed within
any one-year period, shall have a Class A fire
retardant roof covering for entire roof area. For
existing structure when less than ten percent (10%) of



Ordinance No. 1738

15.08.060 Chapter 18 amended — Soils and Foundations.

the total roof area is re-roofed within any one-year
period, shall have a fire retardant roof covering class
equal to or greater than the existing roof covering and
not less than Class B.

Chapter 18 of CBC is hereby amended as follows:

Subsection 1807.1.6 is hereby amended to read in its
entirety as follows:

1807.1.6 Prescriptive design of concrete and
masonry foundation walls. Concrete and masonry
foundation walls that are laterally supported at the top
and bottom shall be permitted to be designed and
constructed in accordance with this section.
Prescriptive design of foundation walls shall not be
used for structures assigned to Seismic Design
Category D, except for detached garages, sheds,
detached decks, and additions 200 sq. ft. or less.
Structures within 7 feet of a descending slope may be
required to have engineered foundation systems.

15.08.070 Chapter 31 amended—Special Construction.

Section 3109 Swimming Pools, Spas and Hot Tubs is hereby
amended as follows:

3109.2 California swimming pool safety act
(statewide) is amended as follows:

115921 (c) “Enclosure” is amended to read as
follows:

(c) “Enclosure" means a fence, wall, or other barrier
that isolates a pool from access to the home and
access from adjacent properties and public ways.

115922 (a) is amended to read as follows: With the
exception of item #1, Items #2 through #7 of
115922(a) are unamended.

(a) Except as provided in Section 115925, when a
building permit is issued for the construction of a new
swimming pool or spa or the remodeling of an existing
swimming pool or spa at a private single -family home

Page 22



Ordinance No. 1738

all pools shall be enclosed by an enclosure that meets
the provisions of 115923 and in addition a second
drowning prevention safety feature shall be added.
When the dwelling is a part of the enclosure two
additional safety features from the items # 2 through
#7, inclusive, shall be installed.

115922 (1) is amended to read as follows:
(1) An enclosure that meets the requirements of
Section 115923 and isolates the swimming pool or
spa from the private single family home and access
from adjacent properties and public ways.

115923 (e) is amended by adding to the end: “Where
the barrier is composed of vertical and horizontal
members the maximum distance between the vertical
members shall be 4 inches. The minimum distance
between horizontal members shall be 45 inches to
prevent a climbable condition. Decorative
embellishments shall not cause a climbable condition
and are limited to % inch projection or 60 degree
slope.”

115928 is amended by adding: (d) Sound
Attenuation, to read as follows:

(d) Filters, heating systems, and pumps installed to
serve pool, spa, hot tub, waterfall or any body of
water, shall be enclosed and soundproofed. An
acoustical report prepared by a licensed or approved
acoustical professional can be used to substitute for
sound wall enclosures as long as the report
demonstrates the compliance of the requirements
specified in Chapter 8.48 of the San Clemente
Municipal Code.

Page 23

Section 5. Chapter 15.11. Chapter 15.11 of the San Clemente Municipal Code

“Energy Code” is hereby amended to read as follows:

Chapter 15.11 ENERGY CODE

15.11.010 Energy Code Adopted — Where filed.



Ordinance No. 1738 Page 24

The 2022 California Energy Code and its provisions relating
to the use of all forms of energy and the conservation
thereof is hereby adopted and a copy held for public review
in the Building Division.

Section 6. Chapter 15.12. Chapter 15.12 of the San Clemente Municipal Code
“Electrical Code” is hereby amended to read as follows:

Chapter 15.12 ELECTRICAL CODE

15.12.010 Electrical Code Adopted — Where filed.
15.12.020 Amendments, additions and deletions

15.12.010 Electrical Code Adopted — Where filed.

The City Council of the City of San Clemente hereby adopts
by reference California Code of Regulations Title 24, Part 3,
known and designated as the California Electrical Code,
2022 Edition based on the National Electrical Code (NEC),
2020 Edition, as published by the National Fire Protection
Association with the modifications set forth below for the
purpose of prescribing regulations for the installation,
arrangement, alteration, repairing, replacement, remodeling,
or use and other operation of electrical wiring, connections,
fixtures and other electrical appliances on premises within
the City. The provisions of this code shall constitute the
electrical code regulations of the City. The California
Electrical Code is on file for public examination in the City's
Building Division office.

15.12.020 Amendments, additions and deletions.

A. A new Section 90.0 of Article 90 of the California
Electrical Code is hereby added to read in its entirety
as follows:

90.0 Administration and Fees.

Administrative provisions contained in Division Il of
Chapter 1 of the California Building Code and
California Residential Code, as amended by the City
of San Clemente, shall apply to the California
Electrical Code, as adopted and amended by the City
of San Clemente.



Ordinance No. 1738 Page 25

B. A new Subdivision (L) is hereby added to Section
300.5 of Article 300 of Chapter 3 of the California
Electrical Code to read in its entirety as follows:

(L) Underground utilities required. Overhead
wiring shall not be installed outside on private
property.  The building official, as a condition
precedent to the issuance of a building permit, shall
require all utility services located within any lot to be
installed underground if:

(a) The property is to be developed with a new or
relocated main building

For purposes of this section, “main building” shall
mean a building in which is conducted the principal
use of the lot or building site on which such building is
located.

The owner or developer of the property shall be
responsible for complying with the requirements of
this section and shall provide all the necessary
facilities on the property to receive such services from
the supplying utilities. If the building official
determines that application of this requirement causes
extraordinary hardship, the building official may
modify or delay the imposition of the undergrounding
requirement upon approval of property owner's
application therefore. If the building official
determines to delay the installation of the
requirement, he may require a recorded agreement
guaranteeing the future performance of the work,
together with adequate performance security in the
form of a cash, surety bond, or letter of credit.

For purposes of this section, appurtenances and
associated equipment, such as, but not limited to,
surface-mounted transformers, pedestal-mounted
terminal boxes and meter cabinets, and concealed
ducts in an underground system may be placed
above ground.

Section 7. Chapter 15.14. Chapter 15.14 of the San Clemente Municipal



Ordinance No. 1738 Page 26

Code, “Green Building Standards Code” is hereby amended to read
as follows:

Chapter 15.14 GREEN BUILDING STANDARDS CODE

15.14.010 Green Building Standards Code Adopted -
Where filed.

The 2022 California Green Building Standards Code and its
provisions relating to the sustainability of construction
resources and the conservation thereof is hereby adopted
and a copy held for public review in the Building Division.

Section 8. Chapter 15.16. Chapter 15.16 of the San Clemente Municipal Code,
“Mechanical Code” is hereby amended to read as follows:

Chapter 15.16 MECHANICAL CODE

15.16.010 Mechanical Code Adopted — Where filed.
15.16.020 Amendments, additions and deletions

15.16.010 Mechanical Code Adopted — Where filed.

The City Council of the City of San Clemente hereby adopts
by reference California Code of Regulations Title 24, Part 4,
known and designated as the California Mechanical Code,
2022 Edition based on the 2021 Uniform Mechanical Code
as published by the International Association of Plumbing
and Mechanical Officials with the modifications set forth
below for the purpose of prescribing regulations for the
design, construction, installation, quality of materials,
location, operation and maintenance or use of heating,
ventilating, cooling, refrigeration systems, incinerators and
other heat-producing appliances in the City. The provisions
of this code shall constitute the mechanical code regulations
of the City. The California Mechanical Code is on file for
public examination in the City’s Building Division office.

15.16.020 Amendments, additions and deletions.
A. Sections 104.4.3, and 104.5 of Division Il of Chapter 1

of the California Mechanical Code are hereby deleted
and replaced by the following:



Ordinance No. 1738 Page 27

104.5 Administration and Fees. Administrative and
fee provisions contained in Division Il of Chapter 1 of
the California Building Code and California
Residential Code, as amended by the City of San
Clemente, shall apply to the California Mechanical
Code, as adopted and amended by the City of San
Clemente.

B. The first paragraph of Subsection 504.3 of the Section
504 of the California Mechanical Code is hereby
amended to read as follows:

504.3 Domestic Range Hoods and Vents. Kitchen
range hoods shall be installed for cooking facilities
with an approved forced-draft system of ventilation
vented to the outside of the building. Ducts used for
domestic kitchen range ventilation shall be of metal,
or other approved material, and shall have smooth
interior surfaces. Ducts for domestic range hoods
shall only serve cooking appliances. (Balance of the
Subsection to remain unchanged.)

C. Subsection 1308.5 of Section 1308 of California
Mechanical Code is hereby amended by adding the
following sentences to the end of the paragraph:

Approved PE pipe and fittings shall be used in
exterior buried gas piping systems. Ferrous gas
piping is not permitted to be installed underground
unless a soils analysis is provided to show that soil
conditions will not be damaging to the piping material.

Section 9. Chapter 15.17. Chapter 15.17 of the San Clemente Municipal Code
is hereby amended to read as follows:

Chapter 15.17 HISTORICAL BUILDING CODE

15.17.010 Historical Building Code Adopted — Where
filed.

The 2022 California Historical Building Code and its

provisions relating to historic buildings and structures to
preserve historic and cultural buildings is hereby adopted
and a copy held for public review in the Building Division.



Ordinance No. 1738 Page 28

Section 10. Chapter 15.18. of the San Clemente Municipal Code
“Referenced Standards Code” is hereby amended to read as

follows:

Chapter 15.18 REFERENCED STANDARDS CODE

15.18.010 Referenced Standards Code Adopted -
Where filed.

The 2022 California Referenced Standards Code and its
provisions relating to the use of various materials in
construction is hereby adopted and a copy held for public
review in the Building Division.

Section 11. Chapter 15.20. Chapter 15.20 of the San Clemente Municipal Code
“Plumbing Code,” is hereby amended to read as follows:

Chapter 15.20 PLUMBING CODE

15.20.010 Plumbing Code Adopted — Where filed.
15.20.020 Amendments, additions and deletions

15.20.010 Plumbing Code Adopted — Where filed.

The City Council of the City of San Clemente hereby adopts
by reference California Code of Regulations Title 24, Part 5,
known and designated as the California Plumbing Code,
2022 Edition based on the 2021 Uniform Plumbing Code as
published by the International Association of Plumbing and
Mechanical Officials with the modifications set forth below for
the purpose of prescribing regulations for the design, quality
of materials, erection, installation, alteration, repair,
relocation, replacement, addition to, use or maintenance of
plumbing systems in the City including Appendices A, B, C,
D, and |. The provisions of this code shall constitute the
plumbing code regulations of the City. The California
Plumbing Code is on file for public examination in the City's
Building Division office.

15.20.020 Amendments, additions and deletion.
A. Sections 104.4 and 104.5 of Division Il of Chapter 1 of

the California Plumbing Code are hereby deleted and
replaced by the following:



Ordinance No. 1738

104.4 Administration and Fees. Administrative
provisions contained in Division Il of Chapter 1 of the
California Building Code and California Residential
Code, as amended by the City of San Clemente, shall
apply to the California Plumbing Code, adopted and
amended by the City of San Clemente.

Subsection 604.1 of Section 604.0 of the California
Plumbing Code is hereby amended by adding a
sentence to end of the third paragraph to read as
follows:

Ferrous materials are prohibited for water pipe and
fittings when installed in the ground unless a soils
analysis is provided to show that soil conditions will
not be damaging to the piping material. (Balance of
the section to remain unchanged)

Subsection 604.2 of Section 604.0 of the California
Plumbing Code is hereby amended to read in its
entirety as follows:

604.2 Copper tube for water piping shall have a
weight of not less than Type K.

Exceptions:

1. Type L copper tubing may be used for water
piping when piping is underground and not within
the footprint of the building foundation.

2. Type M copper tubing may be used for water
piping when piping is aboveground in, or on, a
building.

Iltem no. (2) in Subsection 609.3 of Section 609.0 of
the California Plumbing Code is hereby amended to
read in its entirety as follows:

(2) Copper water piping installed under concrete floor
slabs within a building or structure shall be
copper tube Type "K” and shall be installed
without joints where possible. Where joints are
permitted, they shall be brazed and fitting shall
be wrought copper. Such copper tubing shall be
placed in a sand bed a minimum of three inches

Page 29



Ordinance No. 1738

(3") in depth, and properly protected penetrates
concrete and similar materials.
(Balance of the section to remain unchanged)

Subsection 610.8 of Section 610.0 of the California
Plumbing Code is hereby amended by deleting the
last paragraph and replacing it with the following:

No building supply pipe shall be less than one inch
(17) in diameter unless a design or calculations are
submitted and approved by Administrative Authority.
Each main building shall have a minimum of two
three-quarter-inch (3/4”) hose bibs; one located
readily accessible to the front yard and one to the
back yard.

ltem no. (7) is hereby added to Section 701.1 of the
California Plumbing Code to read as follows:

(7) Cast iron shall not be used for drainage and waste
piping when installed in the ground unless a soils
analysis is provided to show that soil conditions
will not be damaging to the piping material.

Subsection 1208.5 of Section 1208 of California
Plumbing Code is hereby amended by adding the
following sentences to the end of the paragraph:

Approved PE pipe and fittings shall be used in
exterior buried gas piping systems. Ferrous gas
piping is not permitted to be installed underground
unless a soils analysis is provided to show that soil
conditions will not be damaging to the piping material.

Page 30

Section 12. Chapter 15.22. Chapter 15.22 of the San Clemente Municipal Code

“Residential Code” is hereby amended to read as follows:

Chapter 15.22 RESIDENTIAL CODE

15.22.010 Residential Code Adopted — Where filed.
15.22.020 Division I of Chapter 1 amended —

Administration.

15.22.025 Reserved.
15.22.030 Chapter 3 amended — Building Planning.
15.22.040 Chapter 4 amended — Foundations.



Ordinance No. 1738 Page 31

15.22.050 Chapter 6 amended — Wall Construction.

15.22.060 Chapter 9 amended — Roof Assemblies.

15.22.070 Chapter 44 amended — Referenced Standards
(NFPA 13, NFPA 13R, NFPA 13D).

15.22.010 Residential Code Adopted — Where filed.

For the purpose of prescribing regulations for erection,
construction, enlargement, alteration, replacement, repair,
improvement, removal, movement, conversion, demolition,
use and occupancy, equipment, height, location,
maintenance, and areas of detached one-—and two-family
residential dwellings, townhomes and structures accessory
thereto in the City, subject to the modifications set forth in
this Chapter, the City Council of the City of San Clemente
hereby adopts by reference California Code of Regulations
Title 24, Part 2.5, known and designated as the California
Residential Code (CRC), 2022 Edition, based on the 2021
International Residential Code as published by the
International Code Council including Appendix H. A copy of
this code is on file for public examination in the City's
Building Division office.

15.22.020 Division Il of Chapter 1 amended — Administration.
Division Il of Chapter 1 of CRC is hereby amended as follows:

A. Subsection R101.1 is hereby amended to read in its
entirety as follows:

R101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as
the California Residential Code, and may be cited as
such and will be referred to herein as “this code”.

B. Subsection R101.2 is hereby amended by adding a
second paragraph to read as follows:

The provisions of this code shall apply to and affect all
of the territory of the City of San Clemente, except
work located primarily in a public way, public utility
towers and poles, mechanical equipment not
specifically regulated in these codes, hydraulic flood
control structures, facilities for the production,
generation, storage or transmission of water or
electrical energy by a local agency, and except as
exempted by these codes.



Ordinance No. 1738

C. Subsection R105.2 is hereby amended by deleting
items 1 through 10 under the heading “Building” and
replacing them with the following:

Building:

1

One-story detached accessory buildings and
structures used as tool and storage sheds,
playhouses and similar uses and structures such
as portable shade cloth structures, provided the
floor area does not exceed 120 square feet or a
wall height of 8 feet. Such structures must comply
with the setback and height requirements of the
City Zoning Ordinance and the Fire Code.

Fences not over 6 feet high. Masonry fences
under 42 inches in height above finish grade.

Oil derricks.

Retaining walls that are not over 4 feet in height
measured from the bottom of footing to the top of
wall unless supporting a surcharge, impounding
Class I, Il or lllA liquids, or if on a slope less than 1
in 3. Retaining walls on slopes greater than 1in 3
are required to be reviewed by engineering and
planning divisions.

Water tanks supported directly on grade if the
capacity does not exceed 5,000 gallons and the
ratio of height to diameter or width does not
exceed 2:1 and not on or within 7 feet of a
descending slope.

Detached decks, platforms or similar structures
not exceeding 200 square feet in area, walkways,
sidewalks and driveways that are not more than
30 inches (762mm) above adjacent grade, and not
over any basement or story below, and are not
part of a required exit means of egress, and are
not part of an accessible route.

Painting, papering, tiling (except shower
enclosures), carpeting, cabinets, counter tops and

Page 32



Ordinance No. 1738

similar finish work that does not involve electrical,
mechanical or plumbing work.

8. Temporary motion picture, television and theater
stage sets and scenery when approved by special
use permit.

9. Prefabricated swimming pools accessory to a
Group R-3 occupancy that are less than 18 inches
deep, do not exceed 5,000 gallons and are
installed entirely above ground.

10.Shade cloth structures constructed for nursery or
agricultural purposes, not including service
systems that meet zoning requirements.

11.8Swings and other playground equipment
accessory to detached one- and two-family
dwellings.

12.Window awnings supported by an exterior wall
that do not project more than 54 inches from the
exterior wall and do not require additional support
of Group R-3 and U occupancies.

13.Non-fixed and movable fixtures, cases, racks,
counters and partitions not over 5 feet 9 inches in
height.

14. Ground mounted Radio and television antenna,
and flagpoles not higher than the setback from the
property line and not more than 20 feet (20) feet in
height measured from grade. Small dish receivers
mounted on Residential uses.

Unless otherwise exempted, separate plumbing,
electrical and mechanical permits will be required for
the above-exempted items.

Subsection R105.3.2 is hereby amended to read in its
entirety as follows:

R105.3.2 Time limitation of application. An
application for a permit for any proposed work shall
be deemed to have been abandoned 360 days after
the date of filing, unless such application has been

Page 33



Ordinance No. 1738

pursued in good faith or permit has been issued;
except that the building official is authorized to grant
one or more extensions of time for additional periods
not exceeding 90 days each. The extension shall be
requested in writing and justifiable cause
demonstrated. = The total period of application
extensions granted shall not exceed an additional 18
months. In order to renew action on an application
after expiration, the applicant shall resubmit plans and
pay a new plan check fee.

Subsection R105.5 is hereby amended to read in its
entirety as follows:

R105.5 Expiration. Every permit issued shall
become invalid unless the work on the site authorized
by such permit is commenced within 12 months after
its issuance, or if the work authorized on the site by
such permit is suspended or abandoned for a period
of 180 days after the time the work commenced.

Any permittee holding an unexpired permit may apply
for an extension of the time within which work may
commence under that permit when the permittee is
unable to commence work within the time required.
The extension shall be requested in writing prior to
the permit expiring and show justifiable cause
demonstrating that circumstances beyond the control
of the permittee have prevented action from being
taken. Pursuant to this paragraph, the Building
Official or his/her designee is authorized to grant, in
writing, one or more extensions of time, for a period
not more than 180 days. The completion of
construction shall not extend beyond the timeframes
mandated in Section R105.10 of this code even with
such extension.

Before such work can be recommenced after a permit
expires, a new permit shall first be obtained, and a fee
therefore shall be one half the amount required for a
new permit for such work, provided no changes have
been made or will be made in the original plans and
specifications for such work, and provided further that
such suspension or abandonment has not exceeded
one year. In order to renew action on a permit after

Page 34



Ordinance No. 1738

this one year time period, the permittee shall pay a
new full permit fee.

A new Subsection R105.10 is hereby added to
Section R105 to read in its entirety as follows.

R105.10 Completion of construction.

Notwithstanding subsection R105.5 above, all

construction shall be completed by the owner, owner's

agent, or the permittee and approved by the City

within the following time frame:

a. New residential buildings construction . . . 24
months

b. Residential room additions and remodels . . . 12

months

Pools/spas . . . 12 months

Patio covers and similar structures . . . 6 months

Fences and/or retaining walls . . . 6 months

Water heaters, water softeners and air

conditioners . . . 6 months

g. All other minor alterations . . . 6 months

=0 oo

Upon written request of the owner or permittee, the
Building  Official and/or  his/her designated
representative may extend the period for completion
of construction for a period not to exceed one
hundred eighty (180) days. The written request must
demonstrate that (1) due to circumstances beyond the
owner's or permittee's control, construction could not
be completed in the required construction period; (2)
that reasonable progress has been made; (3) that the
condition of the property presents no health or safety
hazard; and (4) that the continued delay will not
create any unreasonable visual or physical detriment
to the neighborhood. Any extension beyond one
hundred eighty (180) days must be approved by the
City Manager.

A new Subsection R105.11 is hereby added to
Section R105 to read in its entirety as follows.

R105.11 Maintenance of property during
construction. During construction, all property shall
be maintained in a reasonably clean and well-kept
manner. All lumber and building materials shall be
neatly piled or stacked in a safe manner and stored in
the rear yard of the residential property or inside the

Page 35



Ordinance No. 1738

building construction perimeter, except that building
materials may be stored in a front yard for a period
not to exceed thirty (30) days. A waiver of this
requirement may be obtained from the Building
Official or his/her designated representative if the
construction is screened from view from adjacent
occupied or public property with fencing materials
approved by city zoning and building regulations. Any
building that is left unsecured by the absence of doors
or windows during construction shall secure those
openings or provide fencing to prevent unauthorized
entry.

A new Subsection R106.1.4 is hereby added to
Section R106 to read in its entirety as follows:

R106.1.4 Soil report. A Soil Report shall be
submitted with all permit applications for new
construction and additions. Soil Reports shall be
prepared by a professional engineer licensed by the
State to prepare such reports. The Building Official
may waive this requirement if he/she finds that the
scope of work applied for does not necessitate a soil
report.

Subsection R106.3 is hereby amended to add a
second paragraph that reads as follows:

When submittal documents are required by Section
R106.1, a plan review fee shall be paid at the time of
submitting the submittal documents for plan review.
Said plan review fees are separate fees from the
permit fees specified in Section R108 and are in
addition to the permit fees. Said plan review fee shall
be as set forth in the City Council Fee Resolution.

Subsection R106.5 is hereby amended to add a
second paragraph that reads as follows:

The approved plans, permit application, inspection
card and other construction documents required by
the Building Official shall be imaged after the final
inspection and will be a permanent record in the City.
The applicant shall pay the cost of imaging at the time
of permit.

Page 36



Ordinance No. 1738

Subsection R108.2 is hereby amended by adding a
sentence at the end to read as follows:

The fee for each permit shall be as set forth in the
City Council Fee Resolution unless otherwise
specified by the code.

Subsection R108.3 is hereby amended to add a
second paragraph that reads as follows:

The Building Official shall make the determination of
value or valuation under any provisions of this code.
The valuation shall be determined by using rational
methods established by the Building Official that
reasonably establish the construction value or the
contract price of the actual construction cost. The
value of work to be used in computing the Building
Permit and Building Plan Review fees shall be the
total value of all construction work for which the
permit is issued, as well as all finish work, painting,
roofing, electrical, plumbing, heating, air conditioning,
elevators, fire extinguishing systems and any other
permanent equipment.

Subsection R108.5 is hereby amended to read in its
entirety as follows:

R108.5 Refunds. The building official is authorized to
establish a refund policy. The building official may
authorize refunding of any fee paid hereunder which
was erroneously paid or collected as provided below.

The building official may authorize refunding of not
more than 80 percent of the permit fee paid when no
work has been done under a permit issued in
accordance with this code.

The building official may authorize refunding of not
more than 80 percent of the plan review fee paid
when an application for a permit for which a plan
review has been paid is withdrawn or canceled before
any plan reviewing is done.

The building official shall not authorize refunding of
any fee paid except on written application filed by the

Page 37



Ordinance No. 1738

original permittee not later than 180 days after the
date of payment.

Subsection R108.6 is hereby amended to add a
second paragraph that reads as follows:

An investigation fee, in addition to the permit fee, shall
be collected whether or not a permit is then or
subsequently issued. The investigation fee shall be
equal to the amount of the permit fee required by this
code. The payment of such investigation fee shall not
exempt any person from compliance with all other
provisions of this code nor from any penalty
prescribed by law.

A new Subsection R108.7 is hereby added to Section
R108 to read in its entirety as follows:

R108.7 Deposit. The Building Official may require a
deposit from the applicant for a certain project or work
in order to secure the request of final inspection
approvals from the applicant or the repairing of
damaged City properties during the period of
construction. The deposit money will be refunded to
the applicant when the final inspections are approved
or the damages are repaired to the satisfaction of the
City. The deposit amount shall not be more than
twice the permit fee.

A new Subsection R109.5 is hereby added to Section
R109 to read in its entirety as follows:

R109.5 Re-inspections. A re-inspection fee may be
assessed for each inspection or re-inspection when
such portion of work for which an inspection is
requested is not complete or when previous
corrections are not corrected.

This subsection is not to be interpreted as requiring
re-inspection fees the first time a job is rejected for
failure to comply with requirements of this Code, but
as controlling the practice of calling for inspections
before the job is ready for such inspection or re-
inspection.

Page 38



Ordinance No. 1738 Page 39

Re-inspection fees may be assessed when the
inspection record card is not posted or otherwise
made available on the work site, or when the
approved plans are not readily available to the
inspector, or for failure to provide access on the date
for which inspection is requested.

To obtain a re-inspection, the applicant shall pay the
re-inspection fee as established by the City Council
Fee Resolution. In instances where re-inspection
fees have been assessed, no additional inspection of
work will be performed until the required re-inspection
fees have been paid.

15.22.030 Chapter 3 amended — Building Planning.
Chapter 3 of CRC is hereby amended as follows:

A. Table R301.2(1) in Section R301 is hereby amended
to read in its entirety as follows:

SUBJECT TO DAMAGE

l
_ WIND DESIGN , EROM | e
GROUND | | sEismic l - \WINTER | BARRIER ! - AIR MEAN
| SNOW | : | special Wind- | DESIGN | | -' 'DESIGN ~ UNDER- | FREEZING | ANNUAL
Sp ‘ Frost HAZARDS? | :
LOAD | gpeed¢ Topographic | Wind |borne |CATEGORY' | TEMP®  LAYMENT | INDEX' | TEMP!
{ | 0@ i Hat i {
| (mph) | effects | Region' debris | Weathering D:lar?h" Termite® | REQUIRED |
| [ zone™ | T |
ST _ — S _ Lo R oo
| [ | No No - | | Very | ! Footnote |
| | w |
Zero | 110 . No : | Dy or D2 Negligible ; 12 | Heavy 43 No | " Below 0 60
f i

For Sl: 1 pound per square foot = 0.0479 kPa, 1 mile per hour = 0.447 m/s.

a. Weathering may require a higher strength concrete or grade of masonry than necessary to
satisfy the structural requirements of this code. The weathering column shall be filled in with the
weathering index (i.e., "negligible," "moderate" or "severe") for concrete as determined from the
Weathering Probability Map [Figure R301.2(3)]. The grade of masonry units shall be determined
from ASTM C 34, C 55, C 62, C73, C 90, C 129, C 145, C 216 or C 652.

b. The frost line depth may require deeper footings than indicated in Figure R403.1(1). The
jurisdiction shall fill in the frost line depth column with the minimum depth of footing below finish
grade.



Ordinance No. 1738 Page 40

¢. The jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table to indicate the need for protection depending on
whether there has been a history of local subterranean termite damage.

d. The jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with the wind speed from the basic wind speed
map [Figure R301.2(4)]. Wind exposure category shall be determined on a site-specific basis in
accordance with Section R301.2.1.4.

e. Temperatures shall be permitted to reflect local climates or local weather experience as
determined by the building official.

f. The jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with the seismic design category determined from
Section R301.2.2.1.

g. Hazard Maps
FEMA - National Flood Insurance Program (NFIP)

Commuﬁity Con?nﬁnityr . FIRM Panel ' Initial NFIP | .. | Most Recent |
Name | Number | Number | MapDate 1'"'“3' FIRM Date l FIRM Panel |

106059C0507) | ’ !
|06059C0508.

106059C0509J |
106059C0517J |
106059C0526J | |
06059C0527J | =
0805900528 | 06/14/1974 | 12/04/1979 | 12/03/2009
'06059C0529. | .
106059C0536J | |
06059C0537J -
106059C0538) |
06059C0539J | - , ;

San Clemente 060230

FEMA—Federal Emergency Management Agency

NFIP—National Flood Insurance Program

FIRM—Flood Insurance Rate Map

Also see—San Clemente Municipal Code Chapter 15.76—Flood Damage Prevention

i. The jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with the 100-year return period air freezing index
(BF-days) from Figure R403.3(2) or from the 100-year (99%) value on the National Climatic Data
Center data table "Air Freezing Index- USA Method (Base 32°)" at www.ncdc.noaa.gov/fpsf.html.

j.  The jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with the mean annual temperature from the
National Climatic Data Center data table "Air Freezing Index-USA Method (Base 32°F)" at
www.ncdc.noaa.gov/fpsf.html.



Ordinance No. 1738 Page 41

B. A new Subsection R301.9 is hereby added to Section
R301 to read in its entirety as follows:

R301.9 Fuel Modification Requirements for New
Construction. All new structures and facilities
adjoining land containing hazardous combustible
vegetation shall be approved using guidance from the
OCFA Guideline C-05 “Vegetation Management
Guideline — Technical Design for new Construction
Fuel Modification Plans and Maintenance Program.”

c. Table R302.1(2) in Section R302 is hereby amended
by deleting footnote “a” (balance of the Table to
remain unchanged).

D. Subsection R313.1 is hereby amended to read in its
entirety as follows:

R313.1 Townhouse automatic fire sprinklers
systems. An automatic fire sprinkler system designed
and installed per Section R313.3 shall be provided in
Townhouses per Section R313.1.1 and R313.1.2.

R313.1.1 New buildings: An automatic sprinkler
system shall be installed throughout all new
townhouse buildings, including the attached garages.

R313.1.2 Existing buildings: An automatic sprinkler
system shall be installed throughout existing buildings
and their additions, including the attached garages,
when any of the following conditions exist:

1. The total floor area increases by 50% of the
existing area over a two-year period; or

2. The total area increases by 750 square feet or
more over a 2-year period; or

3. An additional story is added to the structure
regardless of the area involved; or

4. The floor area of the alteration or combination of
an addition and alteration, within any two-year
period, is 50% or more of area of the existing
structure and where the scope of the work
exposes building framing and facilitates sprinkler
installation and is such that the Building Official
determines that the complexity of installing a



Ordinance No. 1738

sprinkler system would be similar as in a new
building; or

5. Any addition to an existing building that has fire
sprinklers installed.

Exceptions:

1. Pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section
13113 occupancies housing ambulatory children
only, none of whom are mentally ill or mentally
retarded, and the buildings or portions thereof in
which such children are housed are not more than
two stories in height, and buildings or portions
thereof housing such children have an automatic
fire alarm system activated by approved smoke
detectors.

2. Pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section
13143.6 occupancies licensed for protective
social care which house ambulatory clients only,
none of whom is a child (under the age of 18
years), or who is elderly (65 years of age or over).

Subsection R313.2 is hereby amended to read in its
entirety as follows:

R313.2 One- and two-family dwellings automatic
fire sprinklers systems. An automatic fire sprinkler
system designed and installed per Section R313.3
shall be required in one- and two-family dwellings per
Sections R313.2.1 and R313.2.2.

R313.2.1 New buildings: An automatic sprinkler
system shall be installed throughout all new one- and
two-family dwellings, including the attached garages.

R313.2.2 Existing buildings: An automatic sprinkler

system shall be installed throughout existing buildings

and their additions, including the attached garages,

when any of the following conditions exist:

1. The total floor area is increased by 50% of the
existing area over a 2-year period; or

2. The total area is increased by 750 square feet or
more over a 2-year period; or

3. An additional story is added to the structure
regardless of the area involved; or

Page 42



Ordinance No. 1738

4. The floor area of an alteration or combination of
an addition and alteration, within any two-year
period, is 50% or more of area of the existing
structure and where the scope of the work
exposes building framing and facilitates sprinkler
installation and is such that the Building Official
determines that the complexity of installing a
sprinkler system would be similar as in a new
building; or

5. Any addition to an existing building that has fire
sprinklers installed.

Exceptions:

1. Pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section
13113 occupancies housing ambulatory children
only, none of whom are mentally ill or mentally
retarded, and the buildings or portions thereof in
which such children are housed are not more than
two stories in height, and buildings or portions
thereof housing such children have an automatic
fire alarm system activated by approved smoke
detectors.

2. Pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section
13143.6 occupancies licensed for protective
social care which house ambulatory clients only,
none of whom is a child (under the age of 18
years), or who is elderly (65 years of age or over).

The first paragraph of subsection R313.3.6.2.2 is
hereby deleted and replaced to read as follows:

R313.3.6.2.2 Calculation procedure. Determination
of the required size for water distribution piping shall
be in accordance with the following procedure and
California Fire Code Section 903.3.5.3.

Subsection R322.1 is hereby amended to read as
follows:

R322.1 General. Buildings and structures constructed
in whole or in part in flood hazard areas (including A
or V Zones) as established in Table R301.2(1) shall
be designed and constructed in accordance with the
provisions contained in this section and in accordance

Page 43



Ordinance No. 1738

with Chapter 15.76 of the San Clemente Municipal
Code.

Buildings and structures located in whole or in part in
identified floodways shall be designed and
constructed in accordance with ASCE 24 and in
accordance with Chapter 15.76 of the San Clemente
Municipal Code.

15.22.040 Chapter 4 amended — Foundations.

Chapter 4 of CRC is hereby amended as follows:

A

Subsection R402.2 Concrete is hereby amended by
adding at the end: Due to corrosive soils concrete
shall be 4500 psi Type 5 to protect the reinforcing
from corrosion. Special Inspections are not required
unless part of the structural design.

Subsection R405.1 is hereby amended by deleting
the exception (balance of subsection to remain
unchanged).

15.22.050 Chapter 6 amended — Wall Construction.

Chapter 6 of CRC is hereby amended as follows:

A

Section R602.10.4.1 Mixing Methods is hereby
amended by adding at the end of #1: “The use of the
GB method of bracing as the sole means for bracing
is not permitted. No more than 50% of braced wall
line shall use this method and shall be supplemented
by any of the other bracing methods.

15.22.060 Chapter 9 amended — Roof Assemblies.

Chapter 9 of CRC is hereby amended as follows:

A.

First paragraph of subsection R902.1 is amended to
read in its entirety as follows:

R902.1 Roofing covering materials. Roofs shall be
covered with materials as set forth in Sections R904
and R905. A minimum Class A roofing shall be

Page 44



Ordinance No. 1738

installed in areas designated by this section. Classes
A roofing required by this section to be listed shall be
tested in accordance with UL 790 or ASTM E 108.
(balance of subsection to remain unchanged).

Subsections R902.1.1, R902.1.2, R902.1.3 are
hereby deleted and replaced with a new Subsection
R902.1.1 to read in its entirety as follows:

R902.1.1 Roof Coverings. The roof covering or
roofing assembly on any new structure regulated by
this code shall be Class A fire retardant roof minimum
as classified in CBC Section 1505.2. Non-
combustible roof covering may be applied in
accordance with the manufacturer's requirements in
lieu of a fire retardant roofing assembly. Wood
roofing materials are prohibited unless pressure
treated and approved for fire retardant of Class A
minimum. For existing structure when ten percent
(10%) or more of the total roof area is re-roofed within
any one-year period, shall have a Class A fire
retardant roof covering for entire roof area. For
existing structure when less than ten percent (10%) of
the total roof area is re-roofed within any one-year
period, shall have a fire retardant roof covering class
equal to or greater than the existing roof covering and
not less than Class B.

The first paragraph of Subsection R902.2 is hereby
amended to read as follows:

R902.2 Fire-retardant-treated shingles and
shakes. Fire-retardant-treated wood shakes and
shingles are wood shakes and shingles complying
with UBC Standard 15-3 or 15-4 which are
impregnated by the full-cell vacuum-pressure process
with fire-retardant chemicals, and which have been
qualified by UBC Standard 15-2 for use on Class A.
(balance of subsection to remain unchanged).

Subsection R903.4 Roof Drainage is hereby
amended by adding a second paragraph to read as
follows:

Water that accumulates on a roof shall be effectively
drained and conveyed from the roof to a storm drain,

Page 45



Ordinance No. 1738

street gutter, or other locations approved by the
Building Official. Such water shall be conveyed
through gutters, leaders, associated piping or other
non-erodible surface drainage devices as approved
by the Building Official. For any minor or small roofs,
the Building Official may exempt this requirement.

15.22.065 Chapter 10 amended—Chimneys and
Fireplaces.

Chapter 10 of CRC is hereby amended as follows:

A.

Section R1001.13 is hereby added as follows:

R1001.13 Outdoor gas Fireplaces, Fire Pits, Fire
Rings, or similar devices. Outdoor fireplaces, fire
pits, fire rings, or similar exterior devices shall comply
with this section.

Exception: Barbeques, grills, and other portable
devices intended solely for cooking

Section R1001.13.1 is hereby added as follows:

R1001.13.1 Gas-fueled devices. Outdoor fireplaces,
fire pits and similar devices fueled by natural gas or
liquefied-petroleum gas are allowed when approved
by the Building Department and the device is
designed to only burn a gas flame and not wood or
other solid fuel. At R-3 occupancies, combustible
construction shall not be located within three feet of
an atmospheric column that extends vertically from
the perimeter of the device. Where a permanent
Building Department approved hood and vent is
installed, combustible construction may abut this
column between the bottom of the hood and the vent
opening.

Section R1001.13.2 is hereby added as follows:

R1001.13.2 Devices using wood or fuels other
than natural gas or liquefied-petroleum gas.
Fireplaces burning wood or other solid fuel are not
permitted. Decorative logs in an fireplace shall be
contained within a firebox with an attached chimney.
The opening in the face of the firebox shall have an

Page 46



Ordinance No. 1738

installed and maintained enclosure except exterior
installed units.

Section R1001.13.3 is hereby added as follows:

R1001.13.3 Where prohibited. The burning of wood
and other solid fuels is prohibited. Wood and other
solid fuel burning fires in devices other than existing
permanent fireplaces are not allowed within Wildfire
Risk Areas (WRA) and adopted Fire Hazard Severity
Zones (FHSZ) or in locations where conditions could
cause the spread of fire to the WRA or FHSZ

15.22.070 Chapter 44 amended — Referenced
Standards (NFPA 13R & D).

The Referenced Standards in Chapter 44 of CRC are hereby
amended as follows:

A.

NFPA 13, 2016 Edition, Installation of Sprinkler

Systems is hereby amended as follows:

Section 6.7.3 is hereby revised to read in its
entirety as follows:

6.7.3 Fire department connections (FDC)
shall be of an approved type. The location
shall be approved and be no more than 150
feet from a public hydrant. The FDC may be
located within 150 feet of a private fire hydrant
when approved by the fire code official. The
size of piping and the number of 2%" inlets
shall be approved by the fire code official. If
acceptable to the water authority, it may be
installed on the backflow assembly. Fire
department inlet connections shall be painted
OSHA safety red or as approved. When the
fire sprinkler density design requires more than
500 gpm (including inside hose stream
demand), or a standpipe system is included,
four 24" inlets shall be provided

Page 47



Ordinance No. 1738 Page 48

B. NFPA 13D 2016 Edition Installation of Sprinkler
Systems in One and Two-Family Dwellings and
Manufactured Homes is hereby amended as follows:

1. Section 7.1.2 is hereby revised to read in its
entirety as follows:

7.1.2 The system piping may have a separate
control valve when permitted.

Section 13. Chapter 15.23. Chapter 15.23 of the San Clemente Municipal
Code, “Existing Building Code” is hereby amended to read in its
entirety sa follows:

Chapter 15.23 EXISTING BUILDING CODE

15.23.010 Existing Building Code Adopted -~ Where
filed.

For the purpose of prescribing regulations for erection,
construction, enlargement, alteration, replacement, repair,
improvement, removal, movement, conversion, demolition,
use and occupancy, equipment, height, location,
maintenance, and areas of every building or structure or any
appurtenances connected or attached to such building or
structure in the City, subject to the modifications set forth in
this Chapter., the City Council of the City of San Clemente
hereby adopts by reference California Code of Regulations
Title 24, Part 10, known and designated as the California
Existing Building Code (CEBC), 2022 Edition, based on the
2021 International Existing Building Code as published by
the International Code Council. A copy of this code is on file
for public examination in the City's Building Division Office.

15.23.020 Chapter 3 amended—Provisions For All
Compliance Methods.

A. New Subsections 302.6 and 302.7 are hereby added
to Section 302 to read as follows:

302.6 Requirements. It shall be unlawful for any person to
move any house, building or structure of any kind or

48



Ordinance No. 1738 Page 49

description, except fabricated structures approved by the
Building Official, from any point outside of the City limits of
the City, onto any property or lot within the City limits of the
City of San Clemente. No building or structure shall be
moved or relocated until such building or structure is
approved by the Planning Commission under a Conditional
Use Permit. A permit to relocate the building or structure,
issued by the Building Official to the owner of the premises
to which the particular building or structure is proposed to be
moved, is also required.

302.7 Relocation Permit Fee. Before any application for a
Relocation Permit is accepted for filing, a fee as set forth in
the City Council Fee Resolution shall be paid by the
applicant to the City of San Clemente to cover City's cost for
the investigation of the condition of the building to be moved
and the inspection of the proposed new location. The
application fee herein provided for shall be in addition to the
building permit fee required by this code and any other fee or
charge required by law or ordinance where a main building
and building accessory thereto are to be moved.

Section 14. Fire Code. Chapter 8.16 of the San Clemente Municipal Code, “Fire
Code,” is amended to read as follows:

“Chapter 8.16 FIRE CODE
8.16.010 Fire Code Adopted — Where filed.

The 2022 California Fire Code, based on the International
Fire Code, 2021 Edition, as amended by the State of
California, published by the International Code Council
(ICC), including Appendices listed is hereby adopted by the
City of San Clemente for the purpose of prescribing
regulations governing conditions hazardous to the life and
property from fire or explosion, save and except such
portions as are hereinafter added, deleted, modified or
amended. A copy of this Code is on file in the City's Building
Division office for public inspection and is adopted with the
same force and effect as through set out herein in full.

8.16.020 - Enforcement and Inspections.

The California Fire Code as amended by the City of San
Clemente shall be enforced by the Orange County Fire



Ordinance No. 1738 Page 50

Authority, which shall be operated under the Fire Chief of the
Orange County Fire Authority. The Fire Chief of the Orange
County Fire Authority may detail such members of the fire
authority as inspectors as shall be necessary from time to
time.

8.16.030 - Division Il of Chapter 1 amended—
Administration.

Chapter 1
Scope and Administration

Chapter 1 General Requirements. Adopt Chapter 1 in its
entirety, with the following amendments:

Section 112.4 Violation penalties is hereby revised as
follows:

112.4 Violation penalties. Persons who shall violate
a provision of this code or shall fail to comply with any of the
requirements thereof or shall fail to comply with any issued
orders or notices or who shall erect, install, alter, repair or do
work in violation of the approved construction documents or
directive of the fire code official, or of a permit or certificate
used under provisions of this code, shall be subject to
penalties assessed as prescribed in the OCFA Prevention
Field Services adopted fee schedule. Each day that a
violation continues after due notice has been served shall be
deemed a separate offense.

Section 112.4.2 Infraction and misdemeanor is hereby
added as follows:

112.4.2 _Infraction and misdemeanor. __ Persons
operating or maintaining any occupancy. premises or vehicle
subject to this code that shall permit any fire or life safety
hazard to exist on premises under their control shall be guilty
of an infraction. Persons who fail to take immediate action to
abate a fire or life safety hazard when ordered or notified to
do so by the chief or a duly authorized representative are
quilty of a misdemeanor.

8.16.040 Chapter 2 Definitions is adopted in its entirety as
amended by SFM with the following amendments:



Ordinance No. 1738 Page 51

Sections 202 General Definitions is hereby revised by
adding “OCFA” and “Spark Arrester” as follows:

202 General Definitions

OCFA: Orange County Fire Authority, authority having
jurisdiction.

SPARK ARRESTER. A listed device constructed of
noncombustible material specifically for the purpose of
meeting one of the following conditions:

1. Removing and retaining carbon and other flammable
particles/debris _from the exhaust flow of an _intemal
combustion engine _in _accordance with _California
Vehicle Code Section 38366.

2. Existing Fireplaces that burn solid fuel in accordance
with California Building Code Chapter 28.

8.16.050 Chapter 3 General Requirements. Adopt
Chapter 3 in its entirety with the exception of Sections
308.1.4, 311.5 through 311.5.5, 318, and 319, and with the
following amendments:

Section 304.1.2 Vegetation is hereby revised as
follows:

304.1.2 Vegetation. Weeds, grass, vines or other
growth that is capable of being ignited and endangering
property, shall be cut down and removed by the owner or
occupant of the premises. Vegetation clearance requirement
in Very high fire severity areas shall be in accordance with
Chapter 49. Type, amount, arrangement, and maintenance
of vegetation in a fuel modification area, slope, or similarly
hazardous area using guidance from OCFA Guideline C-05
“Vegetation Management Guideline—Technical Design for
New _ Construction, Fuel _Modification _Plans, _and
Maintenance Program.”

Section 305.6 Hazardous Conditions is hereby added as
follows:

305.6 Hazardous conditions. Outdoor fires burning
wood or other solid fuel are not allowed when any of the

following conditions applies:




Ordinance No. 1738 Page 52

1. when predicted sustained winds exceed 8 MPH and
relative humidity is less than 25%. or a red flag
condition has been declared

2. when an official sign was caused to be posted by the
fire code official. or a public announcement is made

No outdoor fires using any fuel type are permitted when
predicted sustained winds exceed 20 MPH or when such fires
present a hazard as determined by the fire code official.

Section 305.7 Disposal of rubbish is hereby added as
follows:

305.7 Disposal of rubbish. Rubbish, trash or
combustible waste material shall be burned only within an
approved _incinerator _and _in __accordance with Section
307.2.1.

Section 307 Open burning, recreational fires and
portable outdoor fireplaces is hereby revised as follows:

SECTION 307 OPEN BURNING, RECREATIONAL
FIRES, FIRE PITS, FIRE RINGS, AND PORTABLE
OUTDOOR FIREPLACES

Sections 307.6 Outdoor Fireplaces, Fire Pits, Fire Rings,
or similar devices used at Group R Occupancies is
hereby added as follows:

307.6 Outdoor Fireplaces, Fire Pits, Fire Rings, or

similar devices used at Group R Occupancies. Outdoor
fireplaces, fire pits, fire rings, or similar exterior devices used

at Group R occupancies shall comply with this section.

Exception: Barbeques, grills, and other portable
devices intended solely for cooking.

Section 307.6.1 Gas-fueled devices is hereby added as
follows:

307.6.1 Gas-fueled devices. OQutdoor fireplaces, fire
pits _and_similar_devices fueled by natural gas or liquefied-
petroleum gas are allowed when approved by the Building
Department and the device is designed to only burn a gas
flame and not wood or other solid fuel. At R-3 occupancies,




Ordinance No. 1738 Page 53

combustible construction and vegetation shall not be located
within _three feet of an atmospheric column that extends
vertically from the perimeter of the device. At other R
occupancies, the minimum distance shall be ten feet. Where
a permanent Building Department approved hood and vent
is_installed, combustible construction may encroach upon
this column between the bottom of the hood and the vent

opening.

Exceptions:

1. Portable fireplaces and fire rings/pits equipped with a
device to arrest sparks shall be located at least 3’
from combustible construction at R-3 occupancies,

2. Portable fireplaces, and fire pits/rings equipped with a
device to arrest sparks, shall be located at least 15
feet from combustible structures at other R
occupancies.

Section 307.6.2.1 Where prohibited is hereby added as
follows:

307.6.2.1 Where prohibited. The burning of wood and
other solid fuels shall not be conducted within a fuel
modification zone or very high hazard fire severity zone,

Exceptions:

1. Permanent fireplaces that are not located in a fuel
modification zone

2. Where determined by the Fire Code Official that the
location or _design of the device should reasonably
prevent the start of a wildfire.

Section 307.7 Fire Prevention is hereby added as follows:
Section 307.7 Fire Prevention

A. Except as provided in subsection B, authorized in the
San Clemente Municipal Code, or permitted by the City
or the Orange County Fire Authority, no person shall
kindle, build, light, or maintain a fire in:

1. The public right-of-way;
2. Property owned or managed by the City;



Ordinance No. 1738

B.

C.

3. Property that is zoned or designated by the City
as "Open Space," "Public," "Civic Center" or
"Institutional;" or

4. Vacant or unimproved portions of property that
are zoned or designated by the City as "Inland
Canyon," "Coastal Canyon" or "Coastal Bluff."

Enforcement personal may order the immediate
extinguishment of any fire in violation of this
subsection A.

The prohibitions provided in subsection A do not apply
in any public or private park where fires are permitted
so long as all of the following conditions are met:

1. The fire is in a designated fire ring or pit, of a
maximum horizontal distance of 3 feet by 2 feet,
or contained within a commercially
manufactured appliance that is elevated off of
the ground (e.g., a hibachi or barbeque grill);

2. Only wood, charcoal, or paper products are
used as fuel;

3. No painted or chemically treated wood is
burned;

4. All fuel material fits within the inside edge of the
fire ring, pit, or elevated appliance; and

5. The fuel materials do not rise higher than
approximately two (2) feet above the top edge
of the fire ring, pit, or elevated appliance.

6. Hazardous conditions identified in Section 305.6
do not exist.

Enforcement personnel may order the extinguishment
of any fire otherwise permitted under subsection B for
any public safety or welfare reason. Such reasons
include, but are not limited to, the fire's location or
proximity to a hazardous fire area, types of fuel, wind
speed, wind direction, flying embers, or other
hazardous conditions described in Section 305.6 exist.
This section shall be enforced by the Orange County
Fire Authority, the Orange County Sheriff's
Department, and employees designated by the City
Manager in the City's Marine Safety, Code
Compliance, and Park Ranger Divisions (collectively
referred to herein as "Enforcement Personnel”).

Page 54



Ordinance No. 1738 Page 55

Section 324 Fuel Modification Requirements for New
Construction is hereby added as follows:

324 Fuel Modification Requirements for New
Construction. All new structures and facilities adjoining
land containing hazardous combustible vegetation shall be
approved using guidance from OCFA Guideline C-05
“Vegetation Management Guideline — Technical Design for
New Construction Fuel Modification Plans and Maintenance
Program.”

Exception: Single specimens of trees, ornamental
shrubbery or cultivated ground cover such as green
grass, ivy, succulents or similar plants used as ground
covers, provided that they do not form a means of readily

transmitting fire

Section 325 Clearance of brush or vegetation growth
from roadways is hereby added as follows:

325 Clearance of brush or vegetation growth from
roadways.

The fire _code official is_authorized to cause areas
within 10 feet (3048 mm) on_each side of portions of
highways and private streets which are improved, designed or
ordinarily used for vehicular traffic, to be cleared of flammable
vegetation and other combustible growth. Measurement shall
be from the flow-line or the end of the improved edge of the
roadway surfaces.

Exception: Single specimens of trees, ormamental
shrubbery or cultivated ground cover such as green grass,
ivy. succulents or similar plants used as ground covers,
provided that they do not form a means of readily transmitting
fire.

Section 326 Unusual Circumstances is hereby added as
follows:

326 Unusual circumstances. The fire code official
may suspend enforcement of the vegetation management
requirements and require reasonable alternative measures
designed to advance the purpose of this code if determined
that in any specific case that any of the following conditions
exist:

1. Difficult terrain.




Ordinance No. 1738 Page 56

2. Danger of erosion.

3. Presence of plants included in_any state and federal
resources agencies, California_Native Plant Society
and _county-approved list of wildlife, plants, rare,
endangered and/or threatened species.

4. Stands or groves of trees or heritage trees.

5. Other _unusual circumstances that make strict

compliance with the clearance of vegetation provisions
undesirable or impractical.

Section 327 Use of Equipment is hereby added as follows:

327 Use of equipment. Except as otherwise provided
in this section, no person shall use, operate, or cause to be
operated in, upon or adjoining any hazardous fire area any
internal combustion engine which_uses hydrocarbon_fuels,
unless the engine is equipped with a spark arrester as defined
in_Section 202 maintained in effective working order, or the
engine _is_constructed. equipped and maintained for the
prevention of fire.

Exceptions:

1. Engines used to provide motor power for trucks, truck
tractors, buses, and passenger vehicles, except
motorcycles, are not subject to_this section if the
exhaust system is equipped with a muffler as defined
in the Vehicle Code of the State of California.

Turbocharged engines are not subject to this section if
all exhausted gases pass through the rotating turbine
wheel, there is no exhaust bypass to the atmosphere,
and the turbocharger is in good mechanical condition

[

Section 327.1 Use of Equipment and Devices Generating
Heat, Sparks or Open Flames is hereby added as follows:

327.1_Equipment _and devices generating heat,
sparks or open flames. During any time of the year within
very high fire hazard severily zone, within or immediately
adjacent to any forest- or brush-covered land or non-irrigated
grass-covered land__no person shall use or operate any
welding equipment, cutting torches, tar pots, grinding devices,
or other tools or equipment that may produce a spark, fire, or
flame that could result in a wildfire without doing the following:




Ordinance No. 1738 Page 57

1. First clearing away all flammable material__including
snags. from the area around such operation for a
distance of 30 feet or other approved method to reduce
fire_spread into the wildlands. If 30-foot clearing
cannot be achieved, then an alternate method shall be
approved by the AHJ prior to work starting.

2. Maintain one serviceable round point shovel with an
overall length of not less than forty-six (46) inches and
one backpack pump water-type fire extinquisher fully
equipped and ready for use at the immediate area
during the operation.

3. Stop work when winds are 8 MPH or greater during
periods when relative humidity is less than 25%, or a
red flag condition has been declared or public
announcement is_made, when an official _sign was
caused to be posted by the fire code official, or when
such fires present a hazard as determined by the fire
code official.

4. Keep a cell phone nearby and call 911 immediate in
case of fire.

Section 327.2 Spark Arresters is hereby added as follows:

327.2 Spark arresters. Spark arresters shall comply
with Section 202, and when affixed to the exhaust system of
engines or vehicles subject to Section 327 shall not be placed
or mounted in such a manner as to allow flames or heat from
the exhaust system to ignite any flammable material.

8.16.060 Chapter 4 amended—Emergency Planning and
Preparedness.
Chapter 4: Emergency Planning and Preparedness.

Adopt only those sections and subsections adopted by SFM
with the following amendment.

Section 407.5 is revised as follows:

407.5 Hazardous Materials Inventory Statement.
Where required by the fire code official, each application for
a permit shall OCFA's Chemical Classification Guideline in
accordance with Section 5001.5.2.

8.16.070 - Chapter 5 amended—Fire Service Features.




Ordinance No. 1738 Page 58

Chapter 5 Fire Service Features is adopted in its entirety
as amended by SFM with the following amendments:

SECTION 501.1 Scope is revised as follows:

501.1 Scope. Fire service features for buildings,
structures and premises shall be designed with this chapter
and reviewed by the fire code official, _with the
recommendations _of OCFA Guideline B-01, ‘Fire Master
Plan for Commercial & Residential Development.”

Section 510.1 Emergency responder coverage in
new buildings is revised as follows:

510.1 Emergency responder radio coverage in
new buildings. All new buildings shall have approved radio
coverage for _emergency responders within the building
based upon the existing coverage levels of the public safety
communication _systems of the jurisdiction at the exterior of
the building. This section shall not require improvement of
the existing public _safety communication systems. The
Emergency Responder Radio Coverage System shall
comply with the requirements of the Orange County Sheriff's
Department, Communications and Technology Division, and
where the functionality of performance requirements in the
California Fire Code are more stringent, this code.

Exceptions:

1. In buildings or structures where it is determined by the
fire code official that the radio coverage system is not
needed. including but not limited to the following:

a. Existing buildings or structures, unless required by the
Building Official and OCFA for buildings and
structures undergoing _extensive _remodel and/or
expansion.

b. Elevators.

c. Structures that meet all of the following:

i.  Three stories or less, and
ii. Do _not have subterranean storage or parking.
and
ji. Do _not exceed 50,000 square feet on any
single story.

d. Structures that meet all of the following:

i  Residential structures four stories or less, and
ii.  Constructed of wood, and




Ordinance No. 1738 Page 59

ii. Do not have subterranean storage or parking,
and
iv.  Are not built integral to an above ground multi-
story parking structure.
Should a structure that is three stories or less and
50.000 square feet or smaller on any single story
include subterranean storage or parking, then this
ordinance shall apply only to the subterranean areas.
2. In facilities where emergency responder radio
coverage is required and such systems, components
or equipment required could have a negative impact
on the normal operations of the facility, the fire code
official _shall _have the authority to accept an
automatically activated emergency radio coverage

system.

8.16.080 Chapter 9 Fire Protection and Life Safety
Systems is adopted in its entirety with the following addition:

903.3.5.3 Hydraulically calculated systems. The
design of hydraulically calculated fire sprinkler systems shall
not exceed 90% of the water supply capacity.

Exception: When static pressure exceeds 100 psi,
and when required by the fire code official, the fire sprinkler
system shall not exceed the water supply capacity specified
by Table 903.3.5.3.

TABLE 903.3.5.3
Hydraulically Calculated Systems

Design %
75—

80

85

100 110 120 130 140 150 PsI

8.16.090 Chapter 11 Construction Requirements for
Existing Buildings. Adopt only those sections and
subsections adopted by SFM.



Ordinance No. 1738 Page 60

Chapter 25
Fruit and Crop Ripening

8.16.100 Chapter 25 Fruit and Crop Ripening is not
adopted.

Chapter 26
Fumigation and Insecticidal Fogging

8.16.101 Chapter 26 Fumigation and Insecticidal
Fogging is not adopted.

8.16.102 Chapter 28 Lumber Yards and Agro-Industrial,
Solid Biomass and Woodworking Facilities is adopted in
its entirety with the following amendments:

Section 2801.2 Permit is hereby revised as follows:

2801.2 Permit. Permits shall be required as set forth
in Section 105.5 and 105.5.29.

Section 2808.2 Storage site is hereby revised as follows:

2808.2 Storage site. Storage sites shall be level and
on solid ground, elevated soil lifts or other all-weather
surface. Sites shall be thoroughly cleaned, and approval
obtained from the fire code official before transferring wood
products to the site.

Section 2808.3 Size of piles is hereby revised as follows:

2808.3 Size of piles. Piles shall not exceed 15 feet in
height, 50 feet in width, and 100 feet in length.

Exception: The fire code official is authorized to allow
the pile size to be increased where a fire protection plan is
provided for approval that includes, but is not limited to, the
following:

1. Storage yard areas and materials-handling equipment
selection, design and arrangement shall be based
upon sound fire prevention and protection principles.

2. Factor that lead to spontaneous heating shall be
identified in the plan, and control of the various factors
shall be identified and implemented, including



Ordinance No. 1738 Page 61

provisions for monitoring the internal condition of the
pile.

3. The plan shall include means for early fire detection
and reporting to the public fire department; and
facilities needed by the fire department for fire
extinguishment including a water supply and fire
hydrants.

4. Fire apparatus access roads around the piles and
access roads to the top of the piles shall be
established, identified, and maintained.

5. Regular yard inspections by trained personnel shall
be included as part of an effective fire prevention
maintenance program.

Additional fire protection called for in the plan shall be
provided and shall be installed in accordance with this
code. The increase of the pile size shall be based
upon the capabilities of the installed fire protection
system and features.

Section 2808.4 Pile Separation is hereby revised as
follows:

2808.4. Pile separation. Piles shall be separated
from adjacent piles by a_minimum distance of 20 feet.
Additionally. piles shall have a minimum separation of 100
feet from combustible vegetation.

Section 2808.7 Pile fire protection is hereby revised as
follows:

2808.7 Pile fire protection. Automatic sprinkler
protection shall be provided in conveyor tunnels and
combustible enclosures that pass under a pile. Combustible
conveyor systems and enclosed conveyor systems shall be
equipped with an approved automatic sprinkler system.
Oscillating sprinklers with a_sufficient projectile reach are
required to maintain a 40% to 60% moisture content and wet
down burning/smoldering areas.

Section 2808.9 Material-handling equipment is hereby
revised as follows:

2808.9 Material-handling equipment. _All material-
handling _equipment operated by an intemal combustion
engine shall be provided and maintained with an approved




Ordinance No. 1738 Page 62

spark_arrester. Approved material-handling equipment shall
be available for moving wood chips, hogged material, wood
fines and raw product during fire-fighting operations.

Section 2808.11 Temperature control is hereby added as
follows:

2808.11 Temperature control. The temperature shall
be monitored and maintained as specified in Sections

2808.11.1 and 2808.11.2.

Section 2808.11.1 Pile temperature control is hereby
added as follows:

2808.11.1 Pile temperature control. Piles shall be
rotated when internal temperature readings are in excess of
165 degrees Fahrenheit.

Section 2808.11.2 New material temperature control is
hereby added as follows:

2808.11.2 New material temperature control. New
loads delivered to the facility shall be inspected and tested at

the facility entry prior to taking delivery. Material with
temperature exceeding 165 degrees Fahrenheit shall not be
accepted on the site. New loads shall comply with the
requirements of this chapter and be monitored to verify that
the temperature remains stable.

Section 2808.12 Water availability is hereby added as
follows:

2808.12 Water Availability. Facilities with over 2500
cubic feet shall provide a water supply. The minimum fire
flow shall be no less than 500 GPM @ 20 psi for a minimum
of 1 hour duration for pile heights up to 6 feet and 2-hour
duration for pile heights over 6 feet. If there is no water
purveyor, an alternate water supply with storage tank(s) shall
be provided for fire suppression. The water supply tank(s)
shall provide a minimum_capacity of 2500 gallons per pile
(maximum 30,000 qgallons) for piles not exceeding 6 feet in
height and 5000 gallons per pile (maximum 60,000) for piles
exceeding 6 feet in height. Water tank(s) shall not be used
for any other purpose unless the required fire flow is left in
reserve within the tank at all times. An_approved method




Ordinance No. 1738 Page 63

shall be provided to maintain the required amount of water
within the tank(s).

Section 2808.13 Tipping area is hereby added as follows:

2808.13 Tipping areas shall comply with the following:

1. Tipping areas shall not exceed a maximum area of 50
feet by 50 feet.

2. Material within a tipping area shall not exceed 5 feet
in height at any time.

3. Tipping areas shall be separated from all piles by a
20-foot-wide fire access lane.

4. A fire hydrant or approved fire water supply outlet
shall be located within 150 feet of all points along the
perimeter of the tipping area.

5. All material within a tipping area shall be processed
within § days of receipt.

Section 2808.14 Emergency Contact is hereby added as
follows:

2808.14 Emergency Contact  The contact
information _of a responsible person or persons shall be
provided to the Fire Department and shall be posted at the
entrance to the facility for responding units. The responsible
party _should be available to respond to the business in
emergency situation.

Section 2808.15 Maximum Grid of Piles and Rows is
hereby added as follows;

2808.15 Maximum Grid of Piles and Rows, Rows of
Piles shall not exceed 500 feet by 500 feet. Grids shall be
separated by a minimum 50 foot clear space used for no
other purpose.

2808.16 Push-out / Clear area is hereby added as follows:

2808.16 Push-out / Clear area Piles exceeding 20
cubic yards shall be provided with push-out areas. Push-out
areas _shall be maintained clear at all times to allow for the
largest pile to be spread out to a depth of 2 feet in height.
Push-out areas shall be Jocated within 250 feet of all edges
of any pile and shall be located a minimum of 20 feet from

any building.




Ordinance No. 1738 Page 64

8.16.103 Chapter 49 Requirements for Wildland-Urban
Interface Fire Areas is adopted in its entirety with the
following amendment:

Section 4903.3 Fuel Modification Plans is hereby added
as follows:

4903.3 Fuel Modification Plans. Fuel modification
plans shall be reviewed and approved by OCFA for all new
buildings to be built or installed in a Very High Fire Hazard
Severity Zone and identified fuel modification zone. Plans
shall reference the recommendations set forth_in OCFA
Guideline _C-05 “Vegetation Management Guideline —
Technical _Design for New Construction Fuel Modification
Plans and Maintenance Program.” R-3 occupancies may
submit_owner builder plans developed by others with
proficiency in vegetation management.

8.16.104 Chapter 50 Hazardous Materials — General
Provisions is adopted in its entirety as amended by SFM
with the following amendments.

Section 5001.5.2 Hazardous Materials Inventory
Statement (HMIS), is hereby revised as follows:

5001.5.2 Hazardous Materials Inventory Statement
(HMIS). Where required by the fire code official, an
application for a permit shall include. Orange County Fire
Authority’s-Chemical Classification Guideline, which shall be
completed and_approved prior to approval of plans, and/or
the storage, use. or handling of chemicals on the premises.

Section 5003.1.1.1 Extremely Hazardous Substances is
hereby added as follows:

5003.1.1.1_Extremely Hazardous Substances. No
person shall use or store any amount of extremely
hazardous substances (EHS) in excess of the disclosable
amounts (see Health and Safety Code Section 25500 et al)
in a residential zoned or any residentially developed
rope

8.16.105 Chapter 56 Explosives and Fireworks is
adopted in its entirety as amended by SFM with the following
amendments:



Ordinance No. 1738 Page 65

Section 5608.2 Firing is hereby added as follows:

5608.2 Firing. All fireworks display, regardless of
mortar,device,_ or shell size, shall be electrically fired.

Section 5608.3 Application for Permit is hereby added as
follows:

Section 5608.3 Application for Permit. A diagram of
the grounds on which the display is to be held showing the
point at which the fireworks are to be discharqged, the fallout
area based on 100 feet per inch of shell size, the location of
all buildings, roads, and other means of transportation, the
lines _behind which the audience will be restrained, the

location of all nearby trees, telegraph or telephone line, or
other overhead obstructions shall be provided to OCFA.

Chapter 80
Referenced Standards

8016.106 Chapter 80 Referenced Standards is adopted in
its entirety with the following amendments:

NFPA 13, 2022 Edition, Standard for the Installation of
Sprinkler Systems is hereby amended as follows:

Section 16.12.3.3 is hereby revised as follows:

16.12.3.3 Fire department connections (FDC) shall be
of an approved type._ The location shall be approved and be
no more than 150 feet from a public hydrant. The FDC may
be located within 150 feet of a private fire hydrant when
approved by the fire code official. The size of piping and the
number of 2% inlets shall be approved by the fire code
official. If acceptable to the water authority, it may be installed
on the backflow assembly. Fire department inlet connections
shall be painted OSHA safety red or as approved. When the
fire_sprinkler density design requires more than 500 gpm
(including inside hose stream demand), or a standpipe
system is included, four 25" inlets shall be provided.

Section 9.4.3.1 is hereby revised as follows:

9.4.3.1 When fire sprinkler systems are installed in
shell buildings of undetermined use (Spec Buildings) other
than warehouses (S occupancies), fire sprinklers of the quick-




Ordinance No. 1738 Page 66

response type shall _be used. Use is considered
undetermined if a specific tenant/occupant is not identified at
the time the fire sprinkler plan is submitted. Sprinklers in
light hazard occupancies shall be one of the following:

(1) Quick-response type as defined in 3.3.215.4.16

(2) Residential sprinklers in accordance with the
requirements of Chapter 12

(3) Quick response CMSA sprinklers

(4) ESFR sprinklers

(5) Standard-response sprinklers used for modifications or
additions to existing light hazard systems equipped
with standard-response sprinklers

(6) Standard-response sprinklers used where individual
standard-response sprinklers are replaced in existing
light hazard systems

Section 9.2.1.7 is hereby revised as follows:
9.2.1.7 Concealed spaces filled with noncombustible

insulation shall not require sprinkler protection when approved
by fire code official.

NFPA 13D 2022 Edition, Standard for the Installation of
Sprinkler Systems in One- and Two-Family Dwellings
and Manufactured Homes is hereby amended as follows:

Section 7.1.2 is hereby revised as follows:

7.1.2 The sprinkler system piping may have separate
control valves installed when permitted.

NFPA 14, 2019 Edition, Installation of Standpipe and
Hose Systems is amended as follows:

Section 7.3.1.1 is hereby is deleted in its entirety.

NFPA 24, 2019 Edition, Standard for the Installation of
Private Fire Service Mains and Their Appurtenances is
hereby amended as follows:

Section 6.2.8.1 is hereby added as follows:

6.2.8.1 All indicating valves controlling fire
suppression water supplies shall be painted OSHA red.




Ordinance No. 1738

Exceptions:
1. Brass or bronze valves on sprinkler risers mounted to

the exterior of the building may be left unpainted.

2. Where OS&Y valves on the detector check assembly
are the only control valves, at least one OS&Y valve
shall be painted red.

Section 6.2.9 is hereby amended as follows:

All connections to private fire service mains for fire
protection systems shall be arranged in accordance with one
of the following so that they can be isolated:

(1) A post indicator valve installed not less than 40 ft
(12 m) from the building

(a) For buildings less than 40 ft (12 m) in height, a
post indicator valve shall be permitted to be
installed closer than 40 ft (12 m) but at least as
far from the building as the height of the wall
facing the post indicator valve.

(2) A wall postindicator valve

(3) An indicating valve in a pit, installed in accordance
with Section 6.4

(4) A backflow preventer with at least one indicating valve
not less than 40 ft (12 m) from the building

(a) For buildings less than 40 ft (12 m) in height, a
backflow preventer with at least one indicating
valve shall be permitted to be installed closer
than 40 ft (12 m) but at least as far from the
building as the height of the wall facing the
backflow preventer.

(5 Control valves installed in a fire-rated room accessible
from the exterior

(6) Control valves in a fire-rated stair enclosure
accessible from the exterior

Section 10.1.5 is hereby added as follows:

Page 67



Ordinance No. 1738 Page 68

10.1.5 All ferrous pipe and joints shall be polyethylene
encased per AWWA C150. Method A, B, or C. All fittings
shall_be protected with a loose 8-mil polyethylene tube or
sheet. The ends of the tube or sheet shall extend past the
joint by a_minimum of 12 inches and be sealed with 2-inch-
wide tape approved for_underground use. Galvanizing does
not meet the requirements of this section.

Exception: 304 or 316 Stainless Steel pipe and fittings.

Section 10.4.1.1 is hereby revised as follows:

10.4.1.1 Coatings. All bolted joint accessories shall be
cleaned and thoroughly coated with asphalt or other
corrosion-retarding material after installation.

Exception: Bolted joint accessories made from 304 or
316 stainless steel.

Section 10.4.1.1.1 is hereby added as follows:

10.4.1.1.1 _All bolts used in pipe-joint assembly shall
be 316 stainless steel.

Section 10.4.3.2 is hereby deleted.
Appendices
Appendix A is deleted in its entirety.
Appendix B is adopted in its entirety.
Appendix BB is adopted in its entirety.
Appendix C is adopted in its entirety.
Appendix CC is adopted in its entirety.
Appendix D is deleted in its entirety.
Appendix E is deleted in its entirety.
Appendix F is deleted in its entirety.

Appendix G is deleted in its entirety.



Ordinance No. 1738 Page 69

Appendix H is adopted in its entirety.
Appendix | is deleted in its entirety.
Appendix J is deleted in its entirety.
Appendix K is deleted in its entirety.
Appendix L is deleted in its entirety.
Appendix M is deleted in its entirety.
Appendix N is deleted in its entirety.

Appendix O is deleted in its entirety.”

Section 15. Severability. If any provision of this ordinance or its application to any
person or circumstance is held to be invalid by a court of competent jurisdiction, such
invalidity has no effect on the other provisions or applications of the ordinance that can
be given effect without the invalid provision or application, and to this extent, the
provisions of this Ordinance are severable. The City Council declares that it would have
adopted this Ordinance irrespective of the invalidity of any portion thereof.

Section 16. Effective Date. This Ordinance takes effect on January 1, 2023,
consistent with section 18941.5 of the California Health and Safety Code, or 30 days
after its final passage and adoption, whichever is later, consistent with California
Government Code section 36937.

Section 17. Certification. The City Clerk is directed to certify the passage and
adoption of this Ordinance; cause it to be entered into the City’s book of original
ordinances; make a note of the passage and adoption in the records of this meeting;
and, within fifteen (15) days after the passage and adoption of this Ordinance, cause it
to be published or posted in accordance with California law.

APPROVED AND ADOPTED this 6 day of December, 2022.

ATTEST:

g
’J /| - ]
City Clerk of the City“of Mayor of the City of
San Clemente, California San Clemente, California




Ordinance No. 1738 Page 70

STATE OF CALIFORNIA )
COUNTY OF ORANGE ) ss.
CITY OF SAN CLEMENTE )

I, LAURA CAMPAGNOLO, City Clerk of the City of San Clemente, California,
hereby certify that Ordinance No. 1738 having been regularly introduced at the meeting
of November 1, 2022 was again introduced, the reading in full thereof unanimously
waived, and duly passed and adopted at a regular and special meeting of the City Council
held on the 6 day of December, 2022 and said ordinance was adopted by the following
vote:

AYES: CABRAL, ENMEIER, JAMES, KNOBLOCK, MAYOR DUNCAN
NOES: NONE
ABSENT: NONE

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, | have hereunto set my hand and affixed the official seal of the
City of San Clemente, California, this 6 day of December, 20%.

KA 7
ey / L5 vy
,«-"«-/"'/}XA A ﬂ [7 /
/ CITY CLERK of the City of
\.S4n Clemente, California

e

CITY ATTORNEY-"




Ordinance No. 1738 Page 71

Exhibit A

Findings to Support Local Amendments to the
2022 Edition of the California Building Standards Code and Related Codes

Pursuant to California Health & Safety Code sections 17958.5, 17958.7, and 18941.5,
this Exhibit A to Ordinance No. 1738 of the City of San Clemente sets forth the City
Council's express findings and determinations justifying the City’s local amendments to
the 2022 Edition of the California Building Standards Code as reasonably necessary
because of local climatic, geologic, and/or topographic conditions.

Chapter 15.08 Amendments to California Building Code (CBC)
Municipal Code CBC Section Substance of Amendment Justificatio
Section Added or . . n (see key
Kieadud (full text in Ordinance No.1738) bekiw)
15.08.020 101.1 Title updated Admin
101.2 Scope updated Admin
101.2.1 Adopt by reference Appendix I, Admin
Patio Covers.
101.4 List referenced codes under Section Admin
101.4 considered part of this Code
101.4.8 Adoption of Green Building Standards | Admin
Code




Ordinance No. 1738

Page 72

105.2 Amendment of “Building™ list and Admin
associated items for which permits are
not required
105.3 Add Item #8 re Electric Vehicle Admin
Charging Stations expedited review
under AB 1236
105.3.2 Time limitation of application Admin
105.5 Expiration of permits Admin
105.8 Completion of construction Admin
105.9 Maintenance of Property During Admin
Construction
107.2.9 Requirement to submit soil report Admin & 11
107.3 Requirement to pay plan review fee at | Admin
time of document submittal
107.5 Requirement to image plans Admin
109.2 Fee for permits Admin




Ordinance No. 1738

Page 73

109.3 Building Official determination of value | Admin
or valuation
109.4 Investigation fee Admin
109.6 Building Official authorized to establish | Admin
refund policy
109.7 Deposit or bond requirement for final | Admin
inspection approvals
110.7 Re-inspections Admin
15.08.025 202 Add definitions for Bedroom, Kitchen or] Admin
Kitchenette, Spark Arrester, and
Swimming Pool to general definitions
15.08.030 406.2.4 Floor surfaces; exception #1 deleted I & 111
15.08.035 710A3.3 Detached accessory structures within 50 | I, I1, & 111
feet of an applicable building must
comply
15.08.040 901.2 Fire protection systems I, 11, & 11
903.2 New sprinklers, where required LI, & 1M1




Ordinance No. 1738

Page 74

903.2.8 Group R, sprinkler installation I, & 11
15.08.050 1502.4 Water accumulating on roof must be IT & 111
effectively drained
T1505.1 All roofs must be Class A I
1505.1.1 Roof coverings |
15.08.060 1807.1.6 Prescriptive design of concrete and T & Il
masonry foundation walls
15.08.070 3109.2 Amend definition of Enclosure, amend | Il & III
Exception #1 of 115922(a), add section
115928 related to Sound Attenuation
Chapter 15.12 Amendments to California Electrical Code (CEC)
Municipal Code | CEC Section Substance of Amendment Justification
Section e or (full text in Ordinance No.1738) (see key
Amended ’ below)
15.12.020 90 Administration and Fees Admin
300.5(L) Overhead writing not to be installed Admin, |
outside on private property




Ordinance No. 1738

Chapter 15.16

Amendments to California Mechanical Code (CMC)

Page 75

Justification

Vents

Municipal Code | CMC Section Substance of Amendment

Section Added or . . (see key
Amended (full text in Ordinance No.1738) below)

15.16.020 104.4.3 & 104.5 | Administration and Fees Admin
504.3 Domestic Range Hoods and 1,1, & I11




Ordinance No. 1738

Chapter 15.20

Amendments to California Plumbing Code (CPC)

Page 76

Municipal Code | CPC Section Substance of Amendment Justification
Section Added or (full text in Ordinance No.1738) {ace key
Amended below)
15.20.020 1044 & 104.5 Administration and Fees Admin
1308.5 Requirement of approved PE pipe ILIL & 111
and fittings for exterior buried gas
piping, prohibition on ferrous piping
absent soil analysis
104.4 & 104.5 | Administration and Fees Admin
604.1 Prohibition on ferrous materials in I, 11, & I1I
water pipe
604.2 Copper tube piping, weight not less than I 11, & 111
Type K
609.3 Amend Item #2 I, 11, & 11
610.8 Add prohibition on building supply pipes | I, II, & 111
less than 17 in diameter
701.1 Prohibition on cast iron for drainage and [, 11, & III
waste piping
1208.5 Requirement of approved PE pipe and L 11, & 111
fittings for exterior buried gas piping,
prohibition on ferrous piping absent soil
analysis
1308.5 Requirement of approved PE pipe and I, 11, & 111

fittings for exterior buried gas piping,
prohibition on ferrous piping absent soil
analysis




Ordinance No. 1738

Chapter 15.22

Amendments to California Residential Code (CRC)

Page 77

Municipal Code CRC Section Substance of Amendment Justificatio
Section Added or : . n (see key
Amended (full text in Ordinance No. 1738) elaw)
15.22.020 R101.1 Title Admin
R101.2 Scope Admin
R105.2 Amend Items [-10 of “Building” Admin
heading re projects not requiring a
permit
R105.3.2 Time limitation of application Admin
R105.5 Expiration Admin
R105.10 Completion of construction limitation | Admin
R105.11 Maintenance of property during Admin
construction
R106.1.4 Soil report required Admin, 11,
& 11
R106.3 Plan review fee Admin
R106.5 Plan imaging requirement Admin
R108.2 Fee set by Council resolution Admin




Ordinance No. 1738

Page 78

R108.3 Building Official determination as Admin
to value and valuation

R108.5 Refunds Admin

R108.6 Investigation Fee Admin

R108.7 Deposit Admin

R109.5 Re-Inspections Admin

15.22.030

TR301.2(1)

Amend Table R301.2(1) re wind
design, seismic design, winter
design, etc.

I I, & III

R301.9

Fuel Modification Requirements for
New Construction

I, 1L, & I

TR302.1(2)

Delete footnote “a” from Table

LI, & 11




Ordinance No. 1738

Page 79

R313.1 Townhouse automatic fire I, 11, & 111
sprinklers
R313.1.1 New buildings L1, & 111
R313.1.2 Existing buildings L1, & 111
R313.2 One- and two-family dwellings 11, & I
automatic fire sprinklers systems
R313.3.6.2.2 Calculation procedure re size for [, 101, & 111
water distribution piping
R322.1 General construction in flood I, I, & 1iI
hazard areas, floodways,
corresponding tables
15.22.040 R402.2 Concrete, corrosive soils, I & 111
reinforcement against
R405.1 Exception deleted I & 111




Ordinance No. 1738

Page 80

rings, or similar devices

15.22.050 R602.10.4.1 Mixing Methods IT & 111
15.22.060 R902.1 Roofing covering materials I, I, & 11
R902.1.1, Roof Coverings requirements, flame LI, & 11
R902.1.2, retardant properties, surface area re-
R902.1.3 roofing requirements
deleted and
replaced with
R902.1.1
R902.2 Fire-retardant-treated shingles and I, 11, & 111
shakes
R903.4 Roof Drainage &l
15.22.065 R1001.13 Outdoor gas fireplaces, fire pits, fire I 11, & 111




Ordinance No. 1738

Page 81

el

R1001.13.1 Gas-fueled devices [, 11, & Il
R1001.13.2 Devices using wood or fuels other I I, & IlI
than natural gas or liquefied-
petroleum gas
R1001.13.3 Where prohibited I, & 11
15.22.070 NFPA 13: Fire Department Connections & L1, & 111
6.7.3 Sprinkler System Installations
NFPA 13D:




Ordinance No. 1738

Chapter 15.23

Page 82

Amendments to California Existing Building Code (CEBC)

Municipal Code
Section

15.23.020

CEBC Section
Added or
Amended

302.6 & 302.7

302.7

Substance of Amendment
(full text in Ordinance No. 1738)

Requirements to move structure

Relocation permit fee

Justification
(see key
below)

LI, & I

Admin




Ordinance No. 1738

Chapter 8.16

Amendments to California Fire Code (CFC)

Page 83

Municipal Code | CFC Section Substance of Amendment Justification
Section Added or g 3 (see key
Amended (full text in Ordinance No. 1738) below)
8.16.020 N/A OCFA designated as enforcement and Admin
inspection authority
8.16.030 112.4 Violation penalties Admin
112.4.2 Infraction and misdemeanor Admin
8.16.040 202 Add definitions for OCFA, Spark Admin
Arrester to general definitions
8.16.050 304.1.2 Vegetation LI, &
111
305.6 Hazardous Conditions LIL &
111
305.7 Disposal of rubbish LI, &
11T
307.6 Open burning, recreational fires, fire LI, &
pits, fire rings, and portable outdoor [l
fireplaces used at Group R occupancies
307.6.1 Gas-fueled devices LIL &

I11




Ordinance No. 1738

Page 84

307.6.2.1 Where prohibited LI, &

11

307.7 Fire prevention LII, &

11

324 Fuel Modification Requirements for LI, &

New Construction 11

325 Clearing of Brush or Vegetation Growth [, 1], &

from Roadways Il

326 Unusual Circumstances LIL &

[

327 Use of equipment LIL &

11

327.1 Use of equipment and devices LI, &

generating heat, sparks or open flames 111

327.2 Spark arresters LI, &

I11

8.16.060 407.5 Hazardous Materials Inventory L1, &
Statement [

8.16.070 501.1 Scope L1, &

111




Ordinance No. 1738 Page 85
510.1 Emergency responder communication LI, &
coverage in new buildings 11
8.16.080 903.3.5.3 Hydraulically calculated systems LI &
11
8.16.102 2801.2 Permit requirement Admin
2808.2 Storage sites must be level with ground LIL &
and approved by fire code official I11
before transfer of wood products to site
2808.3 Size of piles LIL&
[1
2808.4 Pile separation I 11, &
I
2808.7 Pile file protection LI, &
1
2808.9 Material-handling equipment L1 &
11
2808.11 Temperature control LIL &
111
2808.11.1 Pile temperature control I, 11, &

I11




Ordinance No. 1738

Page 86

2808.11.2 New material temperature control LI &

I1

2808.12 Water availability L1, &

11

2808.13 Tipping area L1, &

11

2808.14 Emergency contact I 1, &

11

2808.15 Maximum Grid of Piles and Rows LI, &

(i

2808.16 Push-out / Clear area LI, &

11

8.16.103 4903.3 Fuel Modification Plans LI, &
11

8.16.104 5001.5.2 Hazardous Materials Inventory L1 &
Statement (HMIS) 11

5003.1.1.1 Extremely Hazardous Substances LIL &

11

8.16.105 5608.2 Firing LI &

[




Ordinance No. 1738

5608.3

Application for Permit

Admin
&1

NFPA 13:
92.1.7,
9.4.3.1,
16.12.3.3,

NFPA 13D:

712

NFPA 14:
7331

NFPA 24:
6.2.8.1,
6.2.9,
10.1.5;
10.4.1.1,
10.4.1.1.1
10.4.3.2

Assorted adjustments to NFPA
handbook values

LI, &
11




Ordinance No. 1738 Page 88

Justifications KEY:

Admin — This is an administrative amendment, which does not modify a building standard as
defined in California Health & Safety Code section 18909. The amendment establishes
administrative procedures for the effective enforcement of the building standards in the City of
San Clemente.

II

Climatic Conditions

A.

The jurisdiction of San Clemente is located in a semi-arid Mediterranean type
climate. It annually experiences extended periods of high temperatures with
little or no precipitation. Hot, dry (Santa Ana) winds, which may reach speeds
of 70 m.p.h. or greater are also common to the area. These climatic conditions
cause extreme drying of vegetation and common building materials. Frequent
periods of drought and low humidity add to the fire danger. This predisposes
the area to large destructive fires (conflagration). In addition to directly
damaging or destroying buildings, these fires also disrupt utility services
throughout the area.

The climate alternates between extended periods of drought and brief flooding
conditions. Flood conditions may affect the local fire authority’s ability to
respond to a fire or emergency condition. Floods also disrupt utility services to
buildings and facilities within the City.

Water demand in this densely populated area far exceeds the quantity
supplied by natural precipitation; and, although the population continues to
grow, the already-taxed water supply does not. California is projected to
increase in population by nearly 10 million over the next quarter of a century
with 50 percent of that growth centered in Southern California. Due to storage
capacities and consumption and a limited amount of rainfall, future water
allocation is not fully dependable. This necessitates the need for additional on-
site fire protection features.

These dry climatic conditions and winds contribute to the rapid spread of even
small fires originating in high-density housing or vegetation. These fires
spread very quickly and create a need for increased levels of fire protection.
The added protection of fire sprinkler systems and other fire protection
features will supplement normal fire department response by providing
immediate protection for the building occupants and by containing and
controlling the fire spread to the area of origin. Fire sprinkler systems will also
reduce the use of water for firefighting by as much as 50 to 75 percent.

These climatic conditions are applicable to amendments to the 2022
California Building Code Sections 901.2, 903.2, 903.2.8, 1505.1, and to the
2022 California Fire Code Sections 903, 1201, 2808, 4906.3.

Topographical Conditions:
Natural slopes of 15 percent or greater generally occur throughout the City.
The elevation change caused by the hills creates the geological foundation on
which communities within the City are built and will continue to build. With




Ordinance No. 1738 Page 89

much of the populated flatlands already built upon, future growth will occur on
steeper slopes and greater constraints in terrain.

. Traffic and circulation congestion is an artificially created, obstructive

topographical condition, which is common throughout the City.

. These topographical conditions combine to create a situation, which places

fire department response time to fire occurrences at risk, and makes it
necessary to provide automatic on-site fire-extinguishing systems and other
protection measures to protect occupants and property.

. These topographical conditions are applicable to amendments to 2022

California Building Code Sections 3109.2, the 2022 California Residential
Code Sections R313., R404.2, R602, R1001, the 2022 California Fire Code
Sections 305, 307, 903, 1201, 2808, 4909.

Geological Conditions:

. The City is a densely populated area that has buildings constructed over

and/or near a vast and complex network of faults that are believed to be
capable of producing future earthquakes similar or greater in size than the
1994 Northridge and the 1971 Sylmar earthquakes. Earthquake faults run
along the northeast and southwest boundaries of Orange County. The
Newport-Inglewood Fault, located within Orange County was the source of the
destructive 1933 Long Beach earthquake (6.3 magnitude) which took 120 lives
and damaged buildings in an area that ran from Laguna Beach to Marina Del
Rey to Whittier. In December 1989, another earthquake occurred in the City of
Irvine at an unknown fault line. Regional planning for reoccurrence of
earthquakes is recommended by the State of California, Department of
Conservation.

. Previous earthquakes have been accompanied by disruption of traffic flow and

fires. A severe seismic event has the potential to negatively impact any
rescue or fire suppression activities because it is likely to create obstacles
similar to those indicated under sections above. With the probability of strong
aftershocks there exists a need to provide increased protection for anyone on
upper floors of buildings. The October 17, 1989, Santa Cruz earthquake
resulted in one major fire in the Marina District (San Francisco). When
combined with the 34 other fires locally and over 500 responses, the
department was taxed to its fullest capabilities. The Marina fire was difficult to
contain because mains supplying water to the district burst during the
earthquake. This situation creates the need for both additional fire protection
and automatic on-site fire protection for building occupants. The State
Department of Conservation noted, in their 1988 report (Planning Scenario on
a Major Earthquake on the Newport Inglewood Fault Zone, page 59),
‘unfortunately, barely meeting the minimum earthquake standards of building
codes places a building on the verge of being legally unsafe.”

. Road circulation features located throughout the City also make amendments

reasonably necessary. There are major roadways, highways and flood control
channels that create barriers and slow response times. Hills, slopes, street
and storm drain design accompanied by occasional heavy rainfall, cause



Ordinance No. 1738 Page 90

roadway flooding and landslides and at times may make an emergency access
route impassable.

. Soils throughout the City possess corrosive properties that reduce the
expected usable life of water services when metallic pipes come in contact
with these soils.

. Expansive soils throughout the City combined with predominant hillside
conditions, groundwater and occasional flooding raise the potential for ground
slippage, ground erosion, slope failure and building damage.

. Portions of Orange County contain active or former oil production fields.
These areas contain a variety of naturally occurring gasses, liquids and
vapors. These compounds present toxicity or flammability hazards to building
occupants. Evaluation of these hazards and the risks they pose to
development is necessary implement for appropriate mitigation.

. Due to the topographical conditions of sprawling development separated by
waterways and narrow and congested streets and the expected infrastructure
damage inherent in seismic zone described above, it is prudent to rely on
automatic fire sprinkler systems to mitigate extended fire department response
time and keep fires manageable with reduced fire flow (water) requirements for
a given structures. Additional fire protection is also justified to match the
current resources of firefighting equipment and personnel within the Orange
County Fire Authority.

. These geological conditions are applicable to amendments to the 2022
California Building Code Sections 1502.4, 1505, tbl 1807.1.6, 1904, the 2022
California Electrical Code Section 300.5 the 2022 California Mechanical Code
Sections 504.3, 1308, the 2022 California Plumbing Code Sections 604.2,
609.3, 610.8, 701.1, 1208.5.3.1, the 2022 California Residential Code Sections
R402.2, R404.2, R602.



640 T aded

juswsaiinbay 3ulisno) Jooy v, Sse|D palads gunsix3 T'T°'S0ST IS8T
juawslinbay Buusno) Jooy v, ssejd paljaads 3unsixg T°G0ST 3|geL asT
ulelq wiols ._o\ pue 198415 0} um>m>=ou >_mb_uuwtw o 0} mwmc_m._n_ JO0Yy 10} u:me.::_uwm_ m..__um._xm ' E0ST VST
SWa1sAg aapjulads aui palended AjjedljnespAH 10} suoisirold (V420) Bunsixa £5€°€06 06
mw_ucmn_..uuo |eljuapisay - mw:wEwh_:me_ ._w_v__.___._n_m 2414 Jjeuwloiny w::.m_xm 2 €06 a6
mu_.__meL_:_uwm_ ._m_x:_.ﬁam all4 Jijewoiny ﬁ:m«m_xm 06 Y6

ZSHAHA U1 s3ampnis A1ossaady sapnpui(v4d0) Bunsig v'VYOTL a/

ZSH4HA Ul s31n3on135 Auossany sapnpul(v420) dunsixg TEVOTL VL

22o1naq deu] 10 Jojeiedas |10 parosddy ue 0} uielq o0} s100|4 33eIeC) 10) JUBWALINDaY Bunsixg S ¥'901 Vi
uoniuyaq Bunsix3 gunsa 202 az

sjuswalinbay sayue) - uoiluyag man (v420) MaN 702 74

S924 U01309dsul-aY - SAIBIISIUIWPY Bunsixg L'0TT 1T

usodaq - aAIeSIujWpY 3unsix3 £'60T ST

SpuUNjay 3a4 - AAIBISIUIWPY 3ul3sixg 9'60T ¥t

MULIS4 INOYIM IO 10} 334 UOIIRBIISIAU| - SAIFRIISIUIWPY 3usix3 ¥'60T [o)3

uoiienjep 123loid JO UOIjeUILLIRI3Q - SAIIBIISIUILIPY 3unsix3y £60T dT

(UonN[OSaY BUNSIXT Jad) 5324 HWI3 - SAHEBISIUILIPY 3unsix3 7’601 ot

994 BuiBew) juswnooq Aed - aAljessIUIWPY Buisixgy S'/0T NT

9£718V Aq paJinbay - 5533044 uonels Suidieyd AJ - aAleASILIWPY MapN €101 INT

994 J2aY) ue|d JO JuswiAed - SAljRIISIUILPY dunsixy €L01 1T

(ETOZ Ul 9°7°£0T) HOdaY s|10S Sa4INb3Y - SARASIUIWLPY gunsix3 L'TL0T AT

Iw:__u___._n uado 21nJas 0] Sul2ua) pappe — UoI}INIIsUo) w:_:ﬁ Aliadoud Jo 22UBUBIUIBIA - DAILRIISIUILIPY payipowl 6'S0T r
UOIIINIISUO) 04 Saweljaln] uonasjdwo) - aalesSIuWpyY Suisixy 2501 IT

uoljeaidx3 Julidd - AIeNSIUIWpY dunsixg 6'G0T HT

g¢71 dv 4ad paupadxa Sunwuad suonels Suidieyd A3 pappy — 2AlBISILIWLPY MaN 8# €501

$)I8Y) UB|d 10} UOIIEJIWIT BWI| - BAIRAISIUIWPY Bunsixg 7'E501 o1

SHWISJ Wouy Jdwax3 S0 - SAIRIISIUILPY sunisixg TS0t 4T

(€T0Z U1 8'%'TOT) SPOD USAID 0} ADUSIBSAY - SAIJRIISIUIWPY 3unsia 6'¥'10T 31

(ETOZ Ul 'H"TOT) 2P0 |€I11193]3 0} AdUI4Y - DAIJRIISIUIWPY Sunsixy 87’101 art

S9P0) JaY1Q 01 32U3I343Y - AAIRIISIUIWPY Sunsixg #'T0T o1

adoas - anijessiuiwpy Bunsixg T'10T a1

uone|nday Sulp|ing JO BILL - SABIISIUILIPY dunsixg T'10T vl

SIN3IWANINY 300D DNIaTng
AloisiH
Alewwng SUBIpURILIY uonoas way| J33dey)

199yS AJELUWING SIUSWPUSWY |BJI0T DIUBWS|) UBS SIPOD)

¢# INIWHOV.LLY [enuapisay/duiquinid/|esiueydanl/|eatina)a/3uipling eluioged zzoz



640 7 @8ed

S]10S 3AIS0.107) Ul pasn uaym Buidig J21BAN |BIBIAl SNOLIH JO 35 2y} UO SUONILIISaY Suisix3 1709 q
(Sapod €T0T Ul £°€0T) S9POD J2Yl0 YUM 31BUlpJo0) - SAlIBAISIUIWPY BunsIg 70T v
SINIWANINY A0 ONIGINTd
juswalinbay apo) .m.ﬁE:E yum jeualeiy Suidid seg Jo uoileuiploo) Bunsix3 S'80FT 3
(sapoD €10z Ul Z'#05) sdo|-}00D) 213s3wWw0Q 10} WalsAg 1sneyx3 1oj juawainbay Bunsixg €405 d
(sepo) €107 ul 0'F1IT) S2P0D J3YI0 YUM 3)BUIPIOO) - SAIIBJISIUILPY 3unsixg Sv01 v
SINIWANIINY 300D TVIINYHIIN
3uipjing MaN 40} [ed1d309]3 punoidiapun sainbay Bugsixg (1)5°00¢€ q
S3p0D J3Y10 Yum 21eUlpioo] - IAITRSIUIWPY BunsXg 006 v
SININANIWY 300D TVIIHLIT13
Sunsixg
seoueuauNddy JISYL pUe Sull B21AISS 3114 31BALd JO UOIIE|[EISU] - T VddN (V400) POLIPOIN ¥ VddN ase
Sunsixy
swa)sAg asoH adidpues jo uonejeisul - T Yd4N (v400) 1 Vd4N oS¢
paijipoin
SIWOH uysixg
AT Vd4N dse
painioesnuey pue s3uljamg Ajwey g pue T ul swajsAs Japjunids Jo uonejjeisul - €T Vd4N (v40) PaiIPoiN
3uisixy
swajsAg Japjulids Jo uone||eisu| - €T Vd4N (V420) pBIPOW €T VddN VSE
juawdinb3 eds |004 J0} UOI}ENUAI}Y PUNOS SPINOId 01 JuUBWlINbay gunsixg L'60TIE OL¢
sjuawalinbay ainsojpu3 JsLueg adeds |ood Bunsixg € ¥ 60TE 4T1€
|00d 31eAlld Jo uoniuyeq Bunsixy Tt v 60TE Jie
sjuswaJinbay 23e15/AN) Sunsixa Jad saydul 09 O} g L0y 1YBIay Jaiieg |00d SeUIPON Bunsix3 T'v'60TE ate
S19A02 |00d J0) uo1daIXD SEAOWRL SI9A0D eds palsl) 4oy uoIdadXa JS1e] sulelaY Bunsixg t'60TE ITE
sjuswaldinbay 23e15/AND 3unsixa Jad sayoul 09 03 8f Woly 1ySiaH Jaiueg |00d SaIPoN Juisixgy £601¢ a1€
sjuawalinbay ainsojpu] eds pue jood SUILILIMS JO uondope sayLie) MIN 60TE VIE
4 pue 3 ‘g sauodare) uisaq owsias ul sudisaq [je uonepunod aandudsald sHqIYoid Sunsixgy 9'1°/08T w81

193Ys AlewWWING SJU3WPUIWY |80 3JUIWI|) ues

[ERUSPIS3Y/BUIGUIN|d/|E2IUBYIBIN/|EILIIR1T/2114/BUIpjing BIuIoyIED TTOT




640 € aded

SaWOoYUMO] - sjuawsinbay Japjulids 2414 d13eWOIN gunsix3 :
Yumo] - sy INbay Ispjulids aii4 o1 ny PaLIPON T'ETEY ae
suoisiapgng
Sunsixg (2)1°zogy @lqeL J€
JUl7 107-0497 UIYHM S0UBlSI )OBq1IFS Uolleledas all4 JO UOIIONPaJ 3Y) 01 pajejas 210ulood 3132
UOI1INIISU0D) M3N J0j Sauswalinbay uoneayipo 8n4 (v420) Bunsix3y 6 TOEY g€
ews1u) udisag Suipjing - aAljRAISIUIL Bupspy (1) a|qe
W] usisag sulpjing ensiuiupy PaLIPOI T)Z'TOEY 9|qeL ve
$334 uopdadsul-ay - AAIRISIUILPY Bunsixg S'60TH dT
susodaq - aAneslsiuIwpy Sunisixg £°80TH o1
UWIa4 INOYNA HOA 10§ 831 UOHEBISIAU] - SAIEIISILIWPY dunsixg 9°80TH NT
spunjay a4 - sAljeISILIWpPY Sunsixg $'80TY NT
uotjenjeA 19af0id jJo uolEUIWIIR( - DAIIRAISIUIWPY 3unsixg €80Ty 1
{(Uuonn|osay a4 BunsIX3 19d) S84 NS - SAEAISIUIWPY Sunsixg 7'80TH AT
934 SuiBew| Juawnioq JO JU3WARY - BAIIBIISIUILIPY Bunnsixy S'90TY T
284 }I3Y) ue|d JO JUBWARY - SANRASIUILPY Bunsig £'90TY IT
(2p0od €TOZ Wl ¥'1°90T) SHoday si0S sa4inbay - aAnensIuIWPY 3upsix3 S'T'90TY HT
1wawsaainbal 23uay pappe — uonaNIsue) Sulng Aluadold JO SIUBUIIUIBIA - DAIIRIISILILUPY payipon TT°S0TYH o1
UoI1aNJISUO) 10§ SawelaLul] uos|dwo) - BAIeIISIUIWPY Bunsixg 0T’'SOTY 41
uoijeJidxg HwIay - SAIJRISIUNLPY Bunsix3 S'SOTH It
$I3YD Ue|d JOj UONEBIILIT SLI] - BAIRLIS|UIWPY Supsixg TE'S0TY at
SHWLIB Wouy 1dWaxg YJOM - SAITRIISIUILPY Sunsixg 7'S50TYH 3T
2doos - aAllesSIUILIPY Bunisixg Z'I0TYH a1
suolje|nsay [eIjUSPISAY JO JJILL AJIB]D - dAIRAISIUIWPY 3unsig T'T0TYH v
SINIWANINY 3A0D TVILNIQISIH
S|10S aAIs0.0)) Ul pasn uaym Buidld seo |BIaN SNOLI34 JO 85 2yl UO SUOI}DLIlSaY Sunsixg 807T )
S|10S SAIS0LI0D) Ul PAsM USYM UOJ| ISED JO 35() 341 UO SUOIPHISAY Bunisixg (Z)T'102 ]
.| UByl $$3] 10U 3¢ 0] IDIAIIS 12)BM JO ZIG Sunsixa 8019 q
S[I0S aAIso.LI0D) Ul pasn uaym Suidid J31epn Jaddo) Jo asn) a8yl uo suoloLlsay Bunsig (2)e'609 a
Bunsix3
S[I0S BAISOLI0D Ul pasn uaym Suidig 1a1epn s2ddo) Jo 3sn 9yl uo suodLIS3Y AIDOTE €09 5

192ys Alewiwng sjUsWpUSWY B30T S1UaWI|) UES

|eRuapIsay/Buiquin|d/|ealuBydai/|eaLIda|3/aud/8ulpling eluloyed 2Z0T




640  98ed

§09] pue sSuIp[ing paaojy| Funsixe h.Nom rdl
9°20¢
5po)) JuIp[ing SunsIXy
SOWOH Sunsixj
QET Vdi4N avv
painioejnuepy pue ssuljjamg Ajiwey g pue T ui SwajsAs 4spjuiads Jo uolie||eisul - Q€T Vd4N (v420) payipon
Juisixg
SwialsAs J3pjulids jo uoijejjeisuj - :
1SAS J3]julds § 1IejjeIsu| - €T Vd4N (v420) PaLIPOIN €T VdiN vy
S3UOZ ||B Ul Buiuing [an) PIjOS ]BUILLIID 0] SAUOZ AllIaAaS — R
pieZEH 3414 PUB ‘SBAIY YSIY SULPIIM ‘BUOZ UONBILIPO [N4 Ul [an4 PIjos Jo Suluing suwn (v400) i S aot
$321A3( 101131X3 pajan4-sen 1o} sjuawalinbay (v420) sunsixy T'ET'TOOTY dot
S2IN3Q J01I21XT 1330 pue sButY ali4 ‘Siid ali4 ‘seoejdall4 to0pInQ U0 sluawalinbay(v4d0) Bunsixj €T°100TYH vOT
uleJQ Wi0ls Jo/pue 13315 01 paAanuo) Ajaaaayy] aq ol adeuielq Jooy 10} 1uawsalinbay Sunsixg 'c06Y as
sayeys pue sajSulys paiess] juepielay-alld Bunsix3 2'z06Y o6
juswaiinbay 3ulsA0) Jooy .V, SSeD m_.__pm_xm_ 112064 g6
juswaunbay BuliaAc) Jooy Y, SseD gunysixy T°2064 v6
juswadinbay uleiq uonepunod ol uoiydasx] ss1312q guiisixg 1°soby
5]10S AISO.L10D 10} S3U3W31nbal 31815u0D SppY payipo 2Zovd v
sjuawalinbay ainsopu] edg pue jood SUILLIIMG SaljLIe|D) Bunsixy T'9Z€Y I€
siuawalinbay aunsopu3 eds pue |004 SUILUWIMS JO uoildope salLe]) sunsixy g9z¢y HE
9£'ST DINIDS YEM UOIRUIPIOD) UOIUAARIJ dBRWEq poold 3unsixg T'ZCEd ¢
wa1sAs Japjuiids a1t oy Buidld 3ziS 03 21npadoid uonenfed (v410) 3unsixy TTIEETEY i€
sSuljjamg Ajweq omj pue auQ - syuawalinbay Jspjulds a4i4 Jnewoiny . TETEY 3€

199yS AJBWIWING SIUBLIPUSWY |BJ0T JUBWI|D ueS

[ERUSpISaY /BUiqUIN|d/|EJluBYI3N/|EaNIIB| /3414 /Buipjing BluIOjED) TZOT




640 G @deq

Dd1 40 sed jednjeu uey)
aoe|daJly e Ul SS3JuN SBJqIISNGUWIOD JO ST UIYUM [3n) PIjOS SHqQIYosd | 43Y30 Sjany 10 poom Suisn sadinag Z'9L0€ 29°L0E
sauednilo
¥ Jay3o jo 01 40 Aduednado g-Y Jo £ uynm sud auly sed suqiyoud S3JIN3P pajans-seg I'9°/0€ 1'9°L0€E
*sapuednadQ Y dnoug
1B pasn saJjAap Jejiwis 10 ‘s3uly
‘s8ull aJly ‘siid a1y ‘saoe|dall) JOOPING 40 SIUBWBANDAI SISSAIPPY 2414 ‘slid aai4 ‘sasejdally JoopIng 9 /0E 9°/l0¢E
“JUaWIpUIWe SNoiAAd sadejdaly
wo.Jy 28ueyd oN '9°£0€ Ul SJUBWpUALWE Japun paje|ndal supl Joopino pue ‘s3u a1l ‘syud aay
2414 pue syd aJyy apnjaul 03 8111 UOIIIBS 3y} 03 8uUeyd BAlIRISIUILPY ‘saJyy Jeuopyeasdal ‘Sujuing uado LOE LOE
*S1Igap 18410 pue ‘saaea) ‘yseds jo Sujuing usdo s1qiYoLd ysiqqny jo |esodsiq /'SO0€E L'SOE
*SUOIPUO) JaYyleam snoplezey Sulnp sa4l4 100pINO SHGIYoid SUOIIpUO) SnopJezey 9°'50¢ 9°'S0E
‘siuswainbal §0-D sul|3pIng Y40 03 saueuulew susiy uonedsap C'TroE 'Tv0E
sjudwaiinbay jesauan - ¢ Jajdey)
I ‘pasueyoun JaysaLe yleds, pue ,v420, 0 UORIUL3Q | suonuyaq | z0Z | 202
suoiiuyaq - Z 1a1deyd
‘uonoas
3UO Japun JOUB3LWSPSIW pUe UO[IIBL4U} JO SUOIIUYSP SBUIGWOD
Juswpuswy ‘601 J2pun sanjeuad BuiA|dde jo asodind 1oy pasn JOUuBalapsIAl 13 uoildeljul Z'orT Vel
*a|npayas 934 paydope
Y4200 U0 paseq mau saulj 'ssadoid UOIIB|OIA BAIJBIISIUIWPE S3YLe|D sajyjeuad uope|oIn v'OrT P'ZIt
uonesisiuiwpy g adoas - T Ja3deyd

NOILL33S
uanass 3402

1D3r8ns/a apol 5702 243:2202

‘abpyaod Juawpuawp zzOz Y3 Ul JUSWPUIWD M3U D S Sitf| ™
*abpy20d JUAWPUIWD ZZ0Z 343 03U} PiDMIOS paliipd Bulag Jou S| JUSWPUIWD GTOZ SIYL I
123ffa Asoypinbas 330dwi Aow A3y} 10 ‘U0IS13n ETOZ 343 03 InID[aL JubIL1ubIs 210 BulpIom 40 ado3s uf saBUDYY *PIDMIOS PatiapI Buyaq st IUAWPUIWD GTOZ 34 JO UOISIAN PALfIPOW ¥ i

3ffa Aiojojnbal jp1a)ow anpy Jou 0p A3y} INq ‘apow uaagq aaby Aow sabuoyd [D3113[3/1011031pa Joul aBoyI0d JUBWPUILID ZZ0Z 0IUI PIDMICS PalLIDI BUI3q 5| WAWPUSWD ETOZ SIYL I
puabal

NOLIVIELISOL/SINSIAINGD

Aewwing Juawipuawy Y420 - (342) 2po) adi4 eluioiied zzoz

199yS AleWIWING SJUBWIPUSWY |BIOT dIUBWS|D) UEeS
[e1UapISaY /Buiquin|d/|ed1uByIRIA/|BI1III[ /3114 /3UIp|INg BIUIOJIIED ZZOT



640 g 3deq

swajysAs ASiaug] - 2T 191dey)

suoi1ejnajea Japjunds ul papnput

9q 03 uiBiew Aa4es %0T pJepuels Allsnpul Joj uoliedly|aads sppy swiaysAs pajenajed AjjedinespAy E£'SE'E06 £'S'E'E06
‘B|J2]11D BalE SNOLIEA UO paseq
[2powial Jo uopippe Sulo81apun sawoy Ui 1jouial Jspjuuds sasnbay (ssapjuiids) ¥ dnoun 8'Z7'c06 8'7°€06

'safese8 Suyted uado Jo) uoldadxa Mmo||e 0} pasiAlY elIallid
BaJe snoiJeA uo paseq uoiippe ulo8ispun s3uipjing Ul 34osal
Japjunds sasinbay azis uo paseq sBuip|ing mau ul siajjuLids salinbay (ssepjunidg) pasinbaa atsym Z'€06 2'€06

SwalsAS uo11I3304d 3414 - 6 Jardey)

paJinbai si waisAs olpes Jspuodsal
Auadiawa ue aiaym suipjing o sadA) salpads pue asueulplo s3ujpjing mau u| a3e1an0d
s,uonaipsisnl Bulaey Ajioyine [220| 0] S3US43)2J SBYRW JUIWPUIWY olpe. Japuodsai Asuagiawy I'0rs T'01S

"T0-9 Ul Sjuawalinbal
T 811 0] S80UaJ3)31-55010 3ie 31ay] 3JUIS pai3[ap S| eg0-g 03
3juaiajay "T0-9 01 P3WeUs] pue pax)Jomal u3aq sey 60-g auljsping adoag I'tos T°108

sa1njead JIINIBS 344 -S Jaidey)

adenBue|
05°UD yum Aaua1sisuod Joj 1axoed uopedyisse]) (eawayd s,v420, juawajels
Aq pasejdau s1 Juawalels AIOJUSAU| |BII31BLW SNOPIEZEH 03 33U3J343Y Aiojuanu| jeusie snopiezey 50t S L0V

ssaupaJedald pue Sujuuejd Asuaiaw] - ¢ 193dey)

uoljugi |euspiaoe

1uaaaid pue zoz D42 Yim A|dwod 03 sia)salie y.eds salinbay siaysadse yJeds F 743 T L2E
"uo3ipsuNn| ¥4J0 ul sadiy 3|diRjnw Jo Isned ayj uo paseq sawejy
seaJe ySI puB|p|IM U] S3}IAIE Snopaezey 1oy (,0T JO peaisul ydeqias uado Jo s)ieds ‘jeay 3uipesauas
,0€) Juawalinbal 3po7 5324n0Say Jl|qnd JO UOISIA payipow e sidopy saonap pue juawdinba jo asn TvZE 1'LZE
seale
auoJd aJyypim ul pasn juswdinba uo Ja3saLle yleds Jo asn sainbay juawdinba jo asn 4 LZE
S3IUBISWINDIII J1J123dS JSPUN SPJEPUE]S 3JUBUAUIBL UO[IEID88A
yim aaueljdwod Jo SpoyIs aAfleuIa)je 10 Jo uoisuadsns 104 s3pinoig S22UEISWNIII [ENSNUN £zZE 9z¢
plezey uonjus| shempeos woyj ymosd
29npas 01 SAempeod Jo sadpa WoJj UoIIeI3SaA JO 3DURIES|D SSZLIOYINY uoijeladan o Yysniq Jo 3dueiea|) ZZ€ 7€
‘spJezey uoil1e1adaA a|qusNquIod Yiim sease uopoNIIsuU0d Mau
01 Juadefpe saj)adoad u) UOEIJIPOW [SNy 10} SJUBWRIIND3L sayipo) | 104 Ssju3walinbal uonedipow |anyg [Z€ vZE
'9p0) 8l WD TZOE Ul PassaIppy suiajuel Ays £'9°'T'80¢ €'9°1°'80¢
sase|daly JO apISIN0 BaIY YSIY BJYPlIA/338Li81U|
ueqJn-pue|p|I/V Ul PUB ‘BU0Z POW [N} Ul SJY 3N PI|OS SHGIYO.d Pauqiyosd asaym I'2'9°L0g 1'2°9'L0E

183yS AJEWWNG SJUSWPUIWY |BD0T IJUSWS|) Ues
[enuapisay/Buiquinid/|ed1UByIaN /|Ba11I3|3 /3114 /BUipling BILIOJI|BD ZZ0T




6Jo £ a8eq

I ‘padlj AjjeaL1dale aq 01 SMoys syJomall) sadinbay _ (syaomaaid) Bumy _ 78095 _ 7°8095S
S)J0Mmali4 pue saAalsojdx3 - 9g 193deyd
"E3JE |eljUSpISaI B UL
SJUNOWE 3jgeS0[ISIP BAOQE SBIURISGNS SNopJezey Ajawalixa suqlyold sasuelsgns snopJezey Ajawaix3 I'T'T£00S T'T'T'£00S
juawaiels Alojuanu| s[eliajeN SNopIezeH (SIAIH) Juawajeys
B JO pealsul 183284 Uolledljisse|d |eaiway) s,v400, Saouaiasay AJojuanui sjelalewl snopiezey Z2'S'T00S 2'S'T00S
s|el9le|N snopiezeH - 09 qun_m_._u
"50-D BUIBPINGD V420 pue ‘6y 4a1deyd 34D
ZZ0Z Ul uo11Ias aJeds ajgISUBJAG MAU DY) Ul PRSSBIPPE MOU SI SIY| sjuawaainbay £906F £°9061
*'g0-D auljaping ui 88en3ue| pasiaal pue gt J21deyd ul adendue| ueld
U0[129104d 3414 M3U Y1IM BoUBPIOIIE U] 3G 0} palepdn Juawpuawy Sue|d UoIeILIPOIA |2n4 8061 €°€061
sealy a.dl4 Jeyiu| ueqin-pue|pjim 104 syuawalinbay - 6t 193deyd
MaN ‘sa|id 10} pasinbau s ease no-ysnd e usym SulAynuap) eaJe Je3|) / no ysnd V/N 91°'8087
*s3|id jo uopesedas wnuwixew Sulugag SMOY 12 S3|id 4O PUD WNWIXe\ V/N ST'808Z
oju| 1oe3U00 AauaBiaws jo Supsod sasinbay 19e3U0) Aduadiawy ¥1°808TC +1°'808¢
asn pue
uonesn3dyuod ease uiddi) |elIa1eW MaU Joj SJuaWINDI SaYsI|qe1s] ealy Suiddi) €1°8082 €1°8082Z
sjuawaJinbai Ayjuenb Ia1em BunyBialy saysi(qeis3 Avijiqejieny Jajepm T1'808T Z1°8087
s92439p 59T aAoqe sa|id mau jo @aueldadoe sajenday | |043U0D aunjeladwal [elalew map Z'IT°'808¢ Z'11°808¢
saaidap 59T anoge sajid jo uonjelos saiinbay |o43u0) ainjesadwa; ajid I'ITr°'8082 T'I1°8082
paulejulew pue pajojuow aqg aunjesadwsa) jey) saiinbay [o43u0d aunjesadwa ) TT'8087 IT1°'8082
awdinbs uo Ja)ssuie jJeds panocidde sainbay wswdinba 3uipuey-jepaie 6°'808Z 6°808¢
seaJe Suuapjows/3uiuing umop
}9M pue JUa1U0D 3UN1SIOW Ujelulew o] siapulids Sunej|iaso ssanbay uonaajoad ady 9jid £'808¢ 1’8082
uoijejadan 3|quISNQUIOd J3Yjo wolj uoijeledas QT sadinbal faue|
aJy e Ajjeayiads Jo peajsu sajid usamiaq uoneredss 0z salinbay uonesedas ajid v'808¢ 8082
s|elJalew ajgnsnquiod jo s3|id Jo azis ayj saanpay sa|id Jo azis £'e08e £'8082
als ay) 01 J1onpoud 3uiduniq a1053q aus Jo |eaoidde y4DQ sasinbay 33is a8eui03s 2’808z 2'808¢
yuwad 28e.01S 9|q1ISNGWIoD) SNOBUE|[BIS|IA (28e103s
e 5| 31sem ua3.3 Jo Fupsodwod/a3elols Joj Jwiad sayue)) | IGIISNGUIOI SNOJUEB||DISIAY) HIDd Z'I08¢ 2'1082
sal}ijioe4 SupjIOMpoOo\ pue ssewolg pijos ‘letisnpui-oiSe ‘paeh saquing - gz 191dey)
I s1ieJ pue sied 1o} swajsAs uidieys Aienieq Joy uonedyads pappy _ swaisAs Jaya0 _ _ T'T'T0ZT

133Yys Alewwing sjuswpuswy |eJ07 ajuaws|) ues
|enuapisay /Buiquin|d/|ediueydain/eauide|3 /a4 /3ulpiing eluioed zZzoz




6 4o 8 aded

saxoq anjea Aempeol joj uoindadxa sanoway SOAJEA 193018 (s)6z9 (s)ez9
*SAAIBA JJOINUS ABSO
AJUO UM WBISAS B 10} PUE S3511 JOLIBIX3 UD SIA|BA 0} UDI1dadxa
sapinoad ‘si21yBiyadly Aq uonedyljuspl a1el|ioe) o} paJ pajuled I'8'¢c9-ve 1’89
2q ||eys sanddns Ja1em Sunydiye) Sulj|osuod sanjeA Jey) sayidads sanjep Supesipu Vd4N 9102 | ¥Z Vd4dN 6102
< VdiN
TLEL AL ITEL
19[3n0 3504 J0 1y3I3Y paylads Y319 uo3UU0) 3SOH YdJIN 9T0Z | ¥T YddN 6T0Z
T VdiN
2T, 'QET ¢TLagT
paj||e1sul SI SA|BA JJ0INYS J3julids paledtpap e Ji Buliojiuolw salnnbay S3A|BA [04IU0D) Yd4N 9102 vdiN Z2zZ0Z
dET VdiN
Ajddns Ja1em Buluiwialap jo spoylawl ajqeidane saiydads ANddnsJazepy | TTTECZTII I'v'1T6T
SasNoyalem
10U 3Je 1Y) sSuipjing Jads 10} B1191110 uBisap sapjuids saidads usisap Japjuuds ITTII T'T'6T
sjuawaJinbal |euoeIado Yum S11Juod Juanaid 0] pamaiasl ag ued
UOIIB|NSUI 3|IISNEGUIOIUOU JO 35N 34} JBY] 3INSU3 03 UOI}IDS SaSIAaY saseds pajeasuo) L'CTST8 L'T'T6
sasnoyalem
10u 248 18yl sBulp|ing (13ys 23ds Joj adA) Japjuiids sayaads s8uip|ing ||2ys T'E'E8 1°Sv'6
€T VddN JO
SUO{1P95 JaY10 yim uSije Jo113q 01 pue Ajle|d |rUOIPPE 10§ palipow £L9CL E'ETTIT
a8en3ue| Juawpuawe Funsixy "Da4 JO J0jod ‘uopiedo] ‘adAy salyoads adA) oad Vd4N 8102 VddN ZZ0Z
€T VdiN
SPJEpPUE]S palualaloy - 08 ._mpﬂ.msu
I "Bd7 'OND ‘uadolpAy jo Bujjany 3|igow paugiyold _ adoas I'T085 1°108S
spini4 u_cwmo\r.u 3|gewwie|4 pue saser) ajqewiwie]q - 89 ..wan_m_._u
‘paildope jou aJe suoisiaoid Suijany 3|iqow 1ey) Sa1ed1pul
Aj1e3P 24D ZZ0Z 2y} Ul X11ew uopdope se papaau Ja8uo| ou i
Wswpuawy °zg Ja1dey) jo adods ayl wody Su|dn) ajiqow paaoway Sujang ajiqoy I'TT0LS T'T'T0.LS
spinbr] 3|qusnquio) pue ajqewweld - £g 1a3deyd
‘Uaul/,04 PIEPURIS BY1 JO PEIISU| SUOZ INO|[B} LYIUI/,00T B Ys!|geiss 0}
pPapusWE 3q Ued 3 05 3p07 di 01Ul JUBWaNNba 6T JJILL J9A0 SaLLIED Juwiad Joj uonesjddy v/N £°809S

199ys AJELIWING SJUSWPUDWY |EDOT BlUaWR|D ues
[e1uaPISaY/BUIqUIN|d/[EIUBYIBIN/|BI111083/2114/BUIp|ing BILIOHIED 220T




640 6 28ed

‘pa1dope Apealje sey ale1s 3yl lJeym puoAaq wayl o) suswpuawe Jo sadjpuadde H‘2‘ ‘ag
jeuonippe Aue jo uondope Buisodoud 10U S Y400 “2181S 3yl Aq pardope ale (H pue ‘3D ) ‘gd ‘g) apoDd 244 ZZ0TZ 3Yl u| papnpul sadipuadde g1 2y jo aay Ajug | ‘g sedipuaddy
sadipuaddy
“1asi e dasms |2315 ssa|ulels
aoaid aj8uls sauinbal {||em J01131x3 Jeau ajeulw sy o3 ad|d sauinbay suonepunoy 1apun adid '€'901L TEVOoT
*51j0q] [233S SS3jUIR)S JO IS SauInbay s3|oq |233s ssa|ulels I'T'TvOor T'TT¥0T
‘Jueplelas uoiso.llod J8ylo Jo Jeydse
ylim paleod aq 01 paau 10u op sued [993s $sa|ulels 1ey) salyads sjutof adig I'Tvyor TTvot
‘Buign] Jo pealsul SpIepuels YMMY YIIM 23uepiodde
uf 193ys auajAyisAjod yum adid jo Buiddoim mo|je o1 pasiAsy adid Supeo)/Suiddeipp STO0L S'1°01

123Ys AJEWIWINS SJUSWPUIWY |BDOT IJUBWS|) UeS
lenuapisay/duiquin|d/|eaiueydaiAl/|eau1da)3 /3414 /3uipjing eluioy|ed Zz0Z







