2022

California Fire Code

Amendment Package

Final Version
Updated

October 31, 2022
2022 CFC Code Amendments (County)

Page 1 of 22



ORDINANCE NO. 22-008

AN ORDINANCE OF THE COUNTY OF ORANGE,
CALIFORNIA REPEALING THE CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE,
2019 EDITION ORDINANCE 19-010 AND ADOPTING BY
REFERENCE THE CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE, 2022
EDITION WITH APPENDIX B, BB, C, CC, and H and
AMENDMENTS THERETO.

The Board of Supervisors of the County of Orange, California, does ordain as follows:

FIRE CODE

Section 3-3-1, Fire Code Adopted

The 2022 California Fire Code, based on the International Fire Code, 2021
Edition, with errata, published by International Code Council (ICC), and the whole
thereof, including Appendix B, Appendix BB, Appendix C, Appendix CC, and Appendix
H are hereby adopted by the County of Orange for the purpose of prescribing
regulations governing conditions hazardous to the life and property from fire and
explosion, save and except such portions as are hereinafter added, deleted, modified or
amendment. One copy of all the above is now on file in the office of the Clerk for public
inspection and is adopted with the same force and effect as through set out herein in
full.

Section 3-3-2. Enforcement and Inspection

The California Fire Code with amendments shall be enforced by the Orange
County Fire Authority, which shall be operated under the Fire Chief of the Orange
County Fire Authority. The Fire Chief of the Orange County Fire Authority may detail
such members of the fire authority as inspectors as shall be necessary from time to
time.

Section 3-3-3. Chapter 1 Scope and Administration

Chapter 1 General Requirements. Adopt Chapter 1in its entirety, with the exception of
Section 109, and with the following amendments:

Section 110.4 Violation penalties is hereby revised as follows:

110.4 Violation penalties. Persons who shall violate a provision of this code or
shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or shall fail to comply
with any issued orders or notices_or who shall erect, install, alter, repair or do
work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the fire
code official, or of a permit or certificate used under provisions of this code, shall
be subject to penalties assessed as prescribed in the OCFA Prevention Field
Services adopted fee schedule. Each day that a violation continues after due
notice has been served shall be deemed a separate offense.

Section 110.4.2 Infraction and misdemeanor is hereby added as follows:

October 31, 2022
2022 CFC Code Amendments (County)

Page 2 of 22



110.4.2 Infraction and misdemeanor. Persons operating or maintaining any
occupancy, premises or vehicle subject to this code that shall permit any fire or
life safety hazard to exist on premises under their control shall be guilty of an
infraction. Persons who fail to take immediate action to abate a fire or life safety
hazard when ordered or notified to do so by the chief or a duly authorized
representative are guilty of a misdemeanor.

Section 3-3-4. Chapter 2 Definitions
Chapter 2 Definitions is adopted in its entirety with the following amendments:

Sections 202 General Definitions is hereby revised by adding "“OCFA;" and “Spark
Arrester” as follows:

202 General Definitions
OCFA: Orange County Fire Authority, fire authority having jurisdiction.

SPARK ARRESTER. A listed device constructed of noncombustible material
specifically for the purpose of meeting one of the following conditions:

1. Removing and retaining carbon and other flammable particles/debris from
the exhaust flow of an internal combustion engine in accordance with
California Vehicle Code Section 38366.

2. Fireplaces that burn solid fuel in accordance with California Building Code
Chapter 28.

Section 3-3-5. Chapter 3 General Requirements

Chapter 3 General Requirements. Adopt Chapter 3 in its entirety, with the exception of
Sections 308.1.4, 311.5 through 311.5.5, 318, and 319, and with the following
amendments:

Section 304.1.2 Vegetation is hereby revised as follows:

304.1.2 Vegetation. Weeds, grass, vines or other growth that is capable of being
ignited and endangering property, shall be cut down and removed by the owner or
occupant of the premises. Vegetation clearance requirement in urban-wildland
interface areas shall be in accordance with Chapter 49. Type, amount,
arrangement, and maintenance of vegetation in a fuel modification area, interior
slope, or similarly hazardous area shall be in accordance with OCFA Guideline C-
05 “Vegetation Management Guideline—Technical Design for New Construction,
Fuel Modification Plans, and Maintenance Program.”

October 31, 2022
2022 CFC Code Amendments (County)

Page 3 of 22



Section 305.6 Hazardous Conditions is hereby added as follows:

305.6 Hazardous conditions. Outdoor fires burning wood or other solid fuel are
not allowed when any of the following conditions applies:

1. when predicted sustained winds exceed 8 MPH and relative humidity is less
than 25%, or a red flag condition has been declared

2. when an official sign was caused to be posted by the fire code official, or a
public announcement is made

No outdoor fires using any fuel type are permitted when predicted sustained winds
exceed 20 MPH or when such fires present a hazard as determined by the fire code
official.

Section 305.7 Disposal of rubbish is hereby added as follows:

305.7 Disposal of rubbish. Rubbish, trash or combustible waste material shall
be burned only within an approved incinerator and in accordance with Section
307.2.1.

Section 307 OPEN BURNING, RECREATIONAL FIRES AND PORTABLE OUTDOOR
FIREPLACES is hereby revised as follows:

SECTION 307 OPEN BURNING, RECREATIONAL FIRES, FIRE PITS, FIRE
RINGS, AND PORTABLE OUTDOOR FIREPLACES

Sections 307.6 Outdoor Fireplaces, Fire Pits, Fire Rings, or similar devices used at
Group R Occupancies is hereby added as follows:

307.6 Outdoor Fireplaces, Fire Pits, Fire Rings, or similar devices used at
Group R Occupancies. Outdoor fireplaces, fire pits, fire rings, or similar exterior

devices used at Group R occupancies shall comply with this section.

Exception: Barbeques, grills, and other portable devices intended solely for
cooking.

Section 307.6.1 Gas-fueled devices is hereby added as follows:

307.6.1 Gas-fueled devices. Outdoor fireplaces, fire pits and similar devices
fueled by natural gas or liquefied-petroleum gas are allowed when approved by
the Building Department and the device is designed to only burn a gas flame and
not wood or other solid fuel. At R-3 occupancies, combustible construction and
vegetation shall not be located within three feet of an atmospheric column that
extends vertically from the perimeter of the device. At other R occupancies, the
minimum distance shall be ten feet. Where a permanent Building Department

October 31, 2022
2022 CFC Code Amendments (County)

Page 4 of 22



approved hood and vent is installed, combustible construction may encroach upon
this column between the bottom of the hood and the vent opening. Where
chimneys or vents are installed, they shall have a spark arrester as defined in
Section 202.

Section 307.6.2 Devices using wood or fuels other than natural gas or liquefied-
petroleum gas is hereby added as follows:

307.6.2 Devices using wood or fuels other than natural gas or liquefied-
petroleum gas. Permanent outdoor fireplaces burning wood or other solid fuel
shall be constructed in accordance with the California Building Code with
clearance from combustible construction and building openings as required
therein. Fires in a fireplace shall be contained within a firebox with an attached
chimney. The opening in the face of the firebox shall have an installed and
maintained method of arresting sparks.

The burning of wood or other solid fuel in a device is not allowed within 25 feet of
combustible structures unless within an approved permanent fireplace, Conditions
which could cause a fire to spread within 25 feet of a structure or to vegetation
shall be eliminated prior to ignition. Fires in devices burning wood or solid fuel shall
be in accordance with Sections 305, 307, and 308.

Exceptions:

1. Portable fireplaces and fire rings/pits equipped with a device to arrest
sparks shall be located at least 3' from combustible construction at R-3
occupancies,

2. Portable fireplaces, and fire pits/rings equipped with a device to arrest
sparks, shall be located at least 15 feet from combustible structures at
other R occupancies.

Section 307.6.2.1 Where prohibited is hereby added as follows:

307.6.2.1 Where prohibited. The burning of wood and other solid fuels shall not
be conducted within a fuel modification zone, Wildfire Risk Area (WRA), Wildland-
Urban Interface Area (WUI), or in locations where conditions could cause the
spread of fire to the WRA or WUL.

Exceptions:

1. Permanent fireplaces that are not located in a fuel modification zone

2. Where determined by the Fire Code Official that the location or design of
the device should reasonably prevent the start of a wildfire.

Section 324 Fuel Modification Requirements for New Construction is hereby added
as follows:

October 31, 2022
2022 CFC Code Amendments (County)

Page 5 of 22



324 Fuel Modification Requirements for New Construction. All new structures
and facilities adjoining land containing hazardous combustible vegetation shall be
approved and in accordance with the requirements of OCFA Guideline C-05
“Vegetation Management Guideline — Technical Design for New Construction Fuel
Modification Plans and Maintenance Program.”

Section 325 Clearance of brush or vegetation growth from roadways is hereby
added as follows:

325 Clearance of brush or vegetation growth from roadways. The fire code
official is authorized to cause areas within 10 feet (3048 mm) on each side of
portions of highways and private streets which are improved, designed or ordinarily
used for vehicular traffic, to be cleared of flammable vegetation and other
combustible growth. Measurement shall be from the flow-line or the end of the
improved edge of the roadway surfaces.

Exception: Single specimens of trees, ornamental shrubbery or cultivated
ground cover such as green grass, ivy, succulents or similar plants used as
ground covers, provided that they do not form a means of readily transmitting
fire.

Section 326 Unusual Circumstances is hereby added as follows:

326 Unusual circumstances. The fire code official may suspend enforcement of
the vegetation management requirements and require reasonable alternative
measures designed to advance the purpose of this code if determined that in any
specific case that any of the following conditions exist:

Difficult terrain.

Danger of erosion.

Presence of plants included in any state and federal resources agencies,
California Native Plant Society and county-approved list of wildlife, plants,
rare, endangered and/or threatened species.

Stands or groves of trees or heritage trees.

Other unusual circumstances that make strict compliance with the clearance
of vegetation provisions undesirable or impractical,

N

[ |

Section 327 Use of Equipment is hereby added as follows:

327 Use of equipment. Except as otherwise provided in this section, no person
shall use, operate, or cause to be operated in, upon or adjoining any hazardous
fire area any internal combustion engine which uses hydrocarbon fuels, unless the
engine is equipped with a spark arrester as defined in Section 202 maintained in
effective working order, or the engine is constructed, equipped and maintained for
the prevention of fire.

October 31, 2022
2022 CFC Code Amendments (County)

Page 6 of 22



Exceptions:

1. Engines used to provide motor power for trucks, truck tractors, buses, and
passenger vehicles, except motorcycles, are not subject to this section if the
exhaust system is equipped with a muffler as defined in the Vehicle Code of
the State of California.

2. Turbocharged engines are not subject to this section if all exhausted gases
pass through the rotating turbine wheel, there is no exhaust bypass to the
atmosphere, and the turbocharger is in good mechanical condition

Section 327.1 Use of Equipment and Devices Generating Heat, Sparks or Open
Flames is hereby added as follows:

327.1 Equipment and devices generating heat, sparks or open flames.

During any time of the year within Wildfire Risk Areas, within or immediately

adjacent to any forest- or brush-covered land or non-irrigated grass-covered land,

no person shall use or operate any welding equipment, cutting torches, tar pots,
grinding devices, or other tools or equipment that may produce a spark, fire, or
flame that could result in a wildfire without doing the following:

1. First clearing away all flammable material, including snags, from the area around
such operation for a distance of 30 feet or other approved method to reduce fire
spread into the wildlands. If 30 foot clearing cannot be achieved, then an
alternate method shall be approved by the AHJ prior to work starting.

2. Maintain one serviceable round point shovel with an overall length of not less
than forty-six (46) inches and one backpack pump water-type fire extinguisher
fully equipped and ready for use at the immediate area during the operation.

3. Stop work when winds are 8 MPH or greater during periods when relative
humidity is less than 256%, or a red flag condition has been declared or public
announcement is made, when an official sign was caused to be posted by the
fire code official, or when such fires present a hazard as determined by the fire
code official.

4. Keep a cell phone nearby and call 911 immediate in case of fire.

Section 327.2 Spark Arresters is hereby added as follows:

327.2 Spark arresters. Spark arresters shall comply with Section 202, and when
affixed to the exhaust system of engines or vehicles subject to Section 327 shall
not be placed or mounted in such a manner as to allow flames or heat from the
exhaust system to ignite any flammable material.

Section 3-3-6. Chapter 4 Emergency Planning and Preparedness

October 31, 2022
2022 CFC Code Amendments (County)

Page 7 of 22



Chapter 4: Emergency Planning and Preparedness. Adopt only the sections,
subsections, and amendment listed below:

Section 407.5 is revised as follows:

407.5 Hazardous Materials Inventory Statement. Where required by the fire
code official, each application for a permit shall OCFA’s Chemical
Classification Guideline in accordance with Section 5001.5.2.

Section 3-3-7. Chapter 5 Fire Service Features

Chapter 5 Fire Service Features is adopted in its entirety as amended by SFM with
the following amendments:

Section 501.1 Scope is revised as follows:

501.1 Scope. Fire service features for buildings, structures and premises shall
comply with this chapter and, where required by the fire code official, with OCFA
Guideline B-09, “Fire Master Plan for Commercial & Residential Development.”

Section 510.1 Emergency responder radio coverage in new buildings is revised as
follows:

510.1 Emergency responder radio coverage in new buildings. All new
buildings shall have approved radio coverage for emergency responders within
the building based upon the existing coverage levels of the public safety
communication systems of the jurisdiction at the exterior of the building. This
section shall not require improvement of the existing public safety communication
systems. The Emergency Responder Radio Coverage System shall comply with
the requirements of the Orange County Sheriffs Department, Communications
and Technology Division, and where the functionality of performance
requirements in the California Fire Code are more stringent, this code.

Exceptions:

1. In buildings or structures where it is determined by the fire code official
that the radio coverage system is not needed, including but not limited to
the following:

a. Existing buildings or structures, unless required by the Building
Official and OCFA for buildings and structures undergoing
extensive remodel and/or expansion.

Elevators.

¢. Structures that meet all of the following:

i. Three stories or less, and
ii. Do not have subterranean storage or parking, and
iii. Do not exceed 50,000 square feet on any single story.
d. Structures that meet all of the following:

o

October 31, 2022
2022 CFC Code Amendments (County)

Page 8 of 22



i. Residential structures four stories or less, and

ii. Constructed of wood, and

iii. Do not have subterranean storage or parking, and

iv. Are not built integral to an above ground muilti-story parking

structure.

Should a structure that is three stories or less and 50,000 square feet or smaller
on any single story include subterranean storage or parking, then this ordinance
shall apply only to the subterranean areas.

2. In facilities where emergency responder radio coverage is required and
such systems, components or equipment required could have a negative
impact on the normal operations of the facility, the fire code official shall
have the authority to accept an automatically activated emergency radio
coverage system.

Section 3-3-8. Chapter 6 Building Services and Systems

Chapter 6 Building Services and Systems is adopted in its entirety as amended by
SFM

Section 3-3-9. Chapter 7 Fire and Smoke Protection Features

Chapter 7 Fire and Smoke Protection Features is adopted in its entirety as amended
by SFM.

Section 3-3-10. Chapter 8 Interior Finish, Decorative Materials and Furnishings

Chapter 8 Interior Finish, Decorative Materials and Furnishings is adopted in its
entirety as amended by SFM.

Section 3-3-11. Chapter 9 Fire Protection and Life Safety Systems

Adopt Chapter 9 Fire Protection and Life Safety Systems is adopted in its entirety
as amended by SFM with the following amendments:

Section 903.2 Where required is hereby revised as follows:

903.2 Where required. Approved automatic sprinkler systems in Arew-buildings
and structures shall be provided when one of the following conditions exists:

New buildings: Notwithstanding any applicable provisions of Sections 903.2.1
through 903.2.19, an automatic fire-extinguishing system shall also be installed in
all occupancies when the total building area exceeds 5,000 square feet as
defined in Section 202, regardless of fire areas or allowable area, or is more than

two stories in height.

Cctober 31, 2022
2022 CFC Code Amendments (County)

Page 9 of 22



Exception: Subject to approval by the Fire Code Official, open parking
garages in accordance with Section 408.5 of the California Building Code
that are smaller than the area specified in section 903.2.10 (3) or 803.2.10.1
of the California Fire Code.

Existing Buildings: Notwithstanding any applicable provisions of this code,

an automatic sprinkler system shall be provided in an existing building when

an addition occurs and one of the following conditions exists:

a. When an addition is 33% or more of the existing building area, and the
resulting building area exceeds 5000 square feet

b. When an addition exceeds 2000 square feet, and the resulting building
area exceeds 5000 square feet.

¢. An additional story is added above the second floor regardless of fire
areas or allowable area.

Exception: Additions to Group R-3 occupancies shall comply with Section
903.2.8 (2).

Section 903.2.8 Group R is hereby revised as follows:

903.2.8 Group R. An automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section
903.3 shall be provided throughout all buildings with a Group R fire area as follows:

1.

New Buildings: An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed
throughout all new buildings.

Existing R-3 Buildings: An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed
throughout when one of the following conditions exists:

1. When the floor area of alterations within any two-year period exceeds
50 percent of gross floor area of the existing structure and the building
gross floor area exceeds 5,500 square feet or:

2. When an existing Group R Occupancy is being substantially
renovated, and where the scope of the renovation is such that the
Building Code Official determines that the complexity of installing a
sprinkler system would be similar as in a new building.

Section 903.3.5.3 Hydraulically calculated systems is hereby added as follows:

903.3.5.3 Hydraulically calculated systems. The design of hydraulically
calculated fire sprinkler systems shall not exceed 90% of the water supply
capacity.

Exception: When static pressure exceeds 100 psi, and when required by the
fire code official, the fire sprinkler system shall not exceed the water supply
capacity specified by Table 903.3.5.3.

October 31, 2022
2022 CFC Code Amendments (County)

Page 10 of 22



TABLE 903.3.5.3
Hydraulically Calculated Systems

Design %
75

80

85

S0
100 110 120 130 140 150 Ppst

Section 3-3-12. Chapter 10 Means of Egress
Chapter 10 Means of Egress is adopted in its entirety as amended by SFM.
Section 3-3-13. Chapter 11 Construction Requirements for Existing Buildings

Chapter 11 Construction Requirements for Existing Buildings. Adopt only those
sections and subsections adopted by SFM.

Chapter 12 Energy Systems

Chapter 12 Energy Systems is adopted in its entirety as amended by SFM.
Section 3-3-14. Chapter 20 Aviation Facilities

Chapter 20 Aviation Facilities is adopted in its entirety.

Section 3-3-15. Chapter 21 Dry Cleaning

Chapter 21 Dry Cleaning is adopted in its entirety as amended y SFM.
Section 3-3-16. Chapter 22 Combustible Dust-Producing Operations

Chapter 22 Combustible Dust-Producing Operations is adopted in its entirety as
amended by SFM.

Section 3-3-17. Chapter 23 Motor Fuel-Dispensing Facilities and Repair Garages

Chapter 23 NMotor Fuel-Dispensing Facilities and Repair Garages is adopted in its
entirety as amended by SFM.

October 31, 2022
2022 CFC Code Amendments (County)

Page 11 of 22



Section 3-3-18. Chapter 24 Flammable Finishes

Chapter 24 Flammable Finishes is adopted in its entirety as amended by SFM.
Chapter 25 Fruit and Crop Ripening

Chapter 25 Fruit and Crop Ripening is not adopted.

Chapter 26 Fumigation and Insecticidal Fogging

Chapter 26 Fumigation and Insecticidal Fogging is not adopted.

Chapter 27 Semiconductor Fabrication Facilities

Chapter 27 Semiconductor Fabrication Facilities is adopted in its entirety.
Section 3-3-19. Chapter 27

Chapter 27 Semiconductor Fabrication Facilities is adopted in its entirety without
amendments

Section 3-3-20. Chapter 28 Lumber Yards and Agro-Industrial, Solid Biomass and
Woodworking Facilities

Chapter 28 Lumber Yards and Agro-industrial, Solid Biomass and Woodworking
Facilities is adopted in its entirety with the following amendments:

Section 2801.2 Permit is hereby revised as follows:

2801.2 Permit. Permits shall be required as set forth in Section 105.6 and
105.6.29.

Section 2808.2 Storage site is hereby revised as follows:

2808.2 Storage site. Storage sites shall be level and on solid ground, elevated
soil lifts or other all-weather surface. Sites shall be thoroughly cleaned and
approval obtained from the fire code official before transferring products to the
site.

Section 2808.3 Size of piles is hereby revised as follows:

2808.3 Size of piles. Piles shall not exceed 15 feet in height, 50 feet in width and
100 feet in length.

October 31, 2022
2022 CFC Code Amendments (County)

Page 12 of 22



Exception: The fire code official is authorized to allow the pile size to be
increased where a fire protection plan is provided for approval that includes,
but is not limited to, the following:

1. Storage yard areas and materials-handling equipment selection, design
and arrangement shall be based upon sound fire prevention and
protection principles.

2. Factor that lead to spontaneous heating shall be identified in the plan, and
control of the various factors shall be identified and implemented,
including provisions for monitoring the internal condition of the pile.

3. The plan shall include means for early fire detection and reporting to the
public fire department; and facilities needed by the fire department for fire
extinguishment including a water supply and fire hydrants.

4. Fire apparatus access roads around the piles and access roads to the top
of the piles shall be established, identified and maintained.

5. Regular yard inspections by trained personnel shall be included as part of
an effective fire prevention maintenance program.

Additional fire protection called for in the plan shall be provided and shall be
installed in accordance with this code. The increase of the pile size shall be
based upon the capabilities of the installed fire protection system and
features.

Section 2808.4 Pile Separation is hereby revised as follows:

2808.4. Pile separation. Piles shall be separated from adjacent piles by
minimum distance of 20 feet. Additionally, piles shall have a minimum separation
of 100 feet from combustible vegetation.

Section 2808.7 Pile fire protection is hereby revised as follows:

2808.7 Pile fire protection. Automatic sprinkler protection shall be provided in
conveyor tunnels and combustible enclosures that pass under a pile.
Combustible conveyor systems and enclosed conveyor systems shall be
equipped with an approved automatic sprinkler system. Oscillating sprinklers with
a sufficient projectile reach are required to maintain a 40% to 60% moisture
content and wet down burning/smoldering areas.

Section 2808.9 Material-handling equipment is hereby revised as follows:

2808.9 Material-handling equipment. All material-handling equipment
operated by an internal combustion engine shail be provided and maintained with
an approved spark arrester. Approved material-handling equipment shall be
available for moving wood chips, hogged material, wood fines and raw product
during fire-fighting operations.

October 31, 2022
2022 CFC Code Amendments (County)

Page 13 of 22



Section 2808.11 Temperature control is hereby added as follows:

2808.11 Temperature control. The temperature shall be monitored and
maintained as specified in Sections 2808.11.1 and 2808.11.2.

Section 2808.11.1 Pile temperature control is hereby added as follows:

2808.11.1 Pile temperature control. Piles shall be rotated when internal
temperature readings are in excess of 165 degrees Fahrenheit.

Section 2808.11.2 New material temberature control is hereby added as follows:

2808.11.2 New material temperature control. New loads delivered to the
facility shall be inspected and tested at the facility entry prior to taking delivery.
Material with temperature exceeding 165 degrees Fahrenheit shall not be
accepted on the site. New loads shall comply with the requirements of this
chapter and be monitored to verify that the temperature remains stable.

Section 2808.12 Water availability is hereby added as follows:

2808.12 Water Availability. Facilities with over 2500 cubic feet shall provide a
water supply. The minimum fire flow shall be no less than 500 Gallons Per
Minute (GPM) @ 20 psi for a minimum of 1 hour duration for pile heights up to 6
feet and 2 hour duration for pile heights over 6 feet. If there is no water purveyor,
an alternate water supply with storage tank(s) shall be provided for fire
suppression. The water supply tank(s) shall provide a minimum capacity of 2500
gallons per pile (maximum 30,000 gallons) for piles not exceeding 6 feet in height
and 5000 gallons per pile (maximum 60,000) for piles exceeding 6 feet in height.
Water tank(s) shall not be used for any other purpose unless the required fire
flow is left in reserve within the tank at all times. An approved method shall be
provided to maintain the required amount of water within the tank(s).

Section 2808.13 Tipping area is hereby added as follows:

2808.13 Tipping areas shall comply with the following:

Tipping areas shall not exceed a maximum area of 50 feet by 50 feet.
Material within a tipping area shall not exceed 5 feet in height at any time.
Tipping areas shall be separated from all piles by a 20-foot-wide fire access
lane.

A fire hydrant or approved fire water supply outiet shall be located within 150
feet of all points along the perimeter of the tipping area.

All material within a tipping area shall be processed within 5 days of receipt.

o b b=

Section 2808.14 Emergency Contact is hereby added as follows:

October 31, 2022
2022 CFC Code Amendments (County)

Page 14 of 22



2808.14 Emergency Contact. The contact information of a responsible person
or persons shall be provided to the Fire Department and shall be posted at the
entrance to the facility for responding units. The responsible party should be
available to respond to the business in emergency situation.

Section 2808.15 Maximum Grid of Piles and Rows is hereby added as follows:
2808.15 Maximum Grid of Piles and Rows, Rows of Piles shall not exceed
500 feet by 500 feet. Grids shall be separated by a minimum 50 foot clear
space used for no other purpose.

2808.16 Push-out / Clear area is hereby added as follows:

2808.16 Push-out / Clear area Piles exceeding 20 cubic yards shall be
provided with push-out areas. Push-out areas shall be maintained clear at
all times to allow for the largest pile to be spread out to a depth of 2 feet in
height. Push-out areas shall be located within 250 feet of all edges of any
pile and shall be located a minimum of 20 feet from any building.

Section 3-3-21. Chapter 29 Manufacture of Organic Coatings

Chapter 29 Manufacture of Organic Coatings is adopted in its entirety without
amendments.

Section 3-3-22. Chapter 30 Industrial Ovens
Chapter 30 Industrial Ovens is adopted in its entirety without amendments.

Section 3-3-23. Chapter 31 Temporary Special Event Structures and Other
Membrane Structures

Chapter 31 Temporary Special Event Structures and Other Membrane Structures
is adopted in its entirety as amended by SFM.

Section 3-3-24. Chapter 32 High-Piled Combustible Storage

Chapter 32 High-Piled Combustible Storage is adopted in its entirety without
amendments.

Section 3-3-25. Chapter 33 Fire Safety During Construction and Demolition

Chapter 33 Fire Safety During Construction and Demolition is adopted in its entirety
without amendments.

Section 3-3-26. Chapter 34 Tire Rebuilding and Tire Storage

October 31, 2022
2022 CFC Code Amendments (County)

Page 15 of 22



(stl‘g;lpter 34 Tire Rebuilding and Tire Storage is adopted in its entirety amended by

Section 3-3-27. Chapter 35 Welding and Other Hot Work
Chapter 35 Welding and Other Hot Work is adopted in its entirety.
Section 3-3-28. Chapter 36 Marinas

Chapter 36 Marinas is adopted in its entirety.

Section 3-3-29. Chapter 37 Combustible Fibers and Chapter 39 Processing and
Extraction Facilities

Chapter 37 Combustible Fibers is adopted in its entirety.
Chapter 39 Processing and Extraction Facilities is adopted in its entirety.

Section 3-3-30. Chapter 48 Motion Picture and Television Production Studio
Sound Stages, Approved Production Facilities and Production Locations

Chapter 48 Motion Picture and Television Production Studio Sound Stages,
Approved Production Facilities and Production Locations is adopted in its entirety.

Section 3-3-31. Chapter 49 Requirements for Wildland-Urban Interface Fire Areas

Chapter 49 Requirements for Wildland-Urban Interface Fire Areas is adopted in its
entirety with the following amendments:

Section 4903.3 Fuel Modification Plans is hereby added as follows:

4903.3 Fuel Modification Plans. Fuel modification plans shall be reviewed and
approved by OCFA for all new buildings to be built or installed in a wildfire risk area.
Plans shall meet the criteria set forth in OCFA Guideline C-05 “Vegetation
Management Guideline — Technical Design for New Construction Fuel Modification
Plans and Maintenance Program.”

Section 3-3-32. Chapter 50 Hazardous Materials

Chapter 50 Hazardous Materials — General Provisions is adopted in its entirety as
amended by SFM with the following amendments.

Section 5001.5.2 Hazardous Materials Inventory Statement (HMIS), is hereby
revised as follows:

5001.5.2 Hazardous Materials Inventory Statement (HMIS). Where required
by the fire code official, an application for a permit shall include. Orange County

October 31, 2022
2022 CFC Code Amendments (County)

Page 16 of 22



Fire Authority's-Chemical Classification Guideline, which shall be completed and
approved prior to approval of plans, and/or the storage, use or handling of
chemicals on the premises.

Section 5003.1.1.1 Extremely Hazardous Substances is hereby added as follows:
5003.1.1.1 Extremely Hazardous Substances. No person shall use or store
any amount of extremely hazardous substances (EHS) in excess of the
disclosable amounts (see Health and Safety Code Section 25500 et al) in a
residential zoned or any residentially developed property.

Section 3-3-33. Chapter 51 Aerosols

Chapter 51 Aerosols is adopted in its entirety.

Section 3-3-34. Chapter 53 Compressed Glass

Chapter 53 Compressed Gases is adopted in its entirety.

Section 3-3-35. Chapter 54 Corrosive Materials

Chapter 54 Corrosive materials is adopted in its entirety.

Section 3-3-36. Chapter 55 Cryogenic Fluids

Chapter 55 Cryogenic Fluids is adopted in its entirety.

Section 3-3-37. Chapter 56 Explosives and Fireworks

Chapter 56 Explosives and Fireworks is adopted in its entirety as amended by SFM
with the following amendments:

Section 5608.2 Firing is hereby added as follows:

5608.2 Firing. All fireworks displays, regardless of mortar, device, or shell size,
shall be electrically fired.

Section 5608.3 Application for Permit is hereby added as follows:

Section 5608.3 Application for Permit. A diagram of the grounds on which the display
is to be held showing the point at which the fireworks are to be discharged, the fallout
area based on 100 feet per inch of shell size, the location of all buildings, roads, and
other means of transportation, the lines behind which the audience will be restrained,
the location of all nearby trees, telegraph or telephone line, or other overhead
obstructions shall be provided to OCFA,

October 31, 2022
2022 CFC Code Amendments (County)

Page 17 of 22



Section 3-3-38. Chapter 57 Flammable and Combustible
Liquids

Chapter 57 Flammable and Combustible Liquids. Adopt Chapter 57, as adopted
and amended by SFM.

Section 3-3-39. Chapter 58 Flammable Gasses and Flammable Cryogenic Fluids

Chapter 58 Flammable Gases and Flammable Cryogenic Fluids. Adopt Chapter 58
in its entirety and with the following amendment:

Section 3-3-40. Chapter 59 Flammable Solids

Chapter 59 Flammable Solids is adopted in its entirety.

Section 3-3-41. Chapter 60 Highly Toxic and Toxic Materials
Chapter 60 Highly Toxic and Toxic Materials is adopted in its entirety.
Section 3-3-42. Chapter 61 Liquified Petroleum Gases

Chapter 61 Liquefied Petroleum Gases is adopted in its entirety.
Section 3-3-43. Chapter 62 Organic Peroxides

Chapter 62 Organic Peroxides is adopted in its entirety.

Section 3-3-44. Chapter 63 Oxidizers, Oxidizing Gases, and Oxidizing Cryogenic
Fluids

Chapter 63 Oxidizers, Oxidizing Gases, and Oxidizing Cryogenic Fluids is adopted
in its entirety.

Section 3-3-45. Chapter 64 Pyrophoric Materials

Chapter 64 Pyrophoric Materials is adopted in its entirety.

Section 3-3-46. Chapter 65 Pyroxylin (Cellulose Nitrate) Plastics
Chapter 65 Pyroxylin (Cellulose Nitrate) Plastics is adopted in its entirety.
Section 3-3-47. Chapter 66 Unstable (Reactive) Materials

Chapter 66 Unstable (Reactive) Materials is adopted in its entirety.
Section 3-3-48. Chapter 67 Water-Reactive Solids and Liquids

October 31, 2022
2022 CFC Code Amendments (County)

Page 18 of 22



Chapter 67 Water-Reactive Solids and Liquids is adopted in its entirety.
Section 3-3-49. Chapter 80 Referenced Standards

Chapter 80 Referenced Standards is adopted in its entirety with the following
amendments:

NFPA 13, 2022 Edition, Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systems is hereby
amended as follows:

Section 16.12.3.3 is hereby revised as follows:

16.12.3.3 Fire department connections (FDC) shall be of an approved type. The
location shall be approved and be no more than 150 feet from a public hydrant.
The FDC may be located within 150 feet of a private fire hydrant when approved
by the fire code official. The size of piping and the number of 2%%" inlets shall be
approved by the fire code official. If acceptable to the water authority, it may be
installed on the backflow assembly. Fire department inlet connections shall be
painted OSHA safety red or as approved. When the fire sprinkler density design
requires more than 500 GPM (including inside hose stream demand), or a
standpipe system is included, four 2%%" inlets shall be provided.

Section 9.4.3.1 is hereby revised as follows:

9.4.3.1 When fire sprinkler systems are installed in shell buildings of undetermined
use (Spec Buildings) other than warehouses (S occupancies), fire sprinklers of the
quick-response type shall be used. Use is considered undetermined if a specific
tenant/occupant is not identified at the time the fire sprinkler plan is submitted.
Sprinklers in light hazard occupancies shall be one of the following:

(1) Quick-response type as defined in 3.6.4.8

(2) Residential sprinklers in accordance with the requirements of 8.4.5

(3) Quick response CMSA sprinklers

(4) ESFR sprinklers

(5) Standard-response sprinklers used for modifications or additions to existing
light hazard systems equipped with standard-response sprinklers

(6) Standard-response sprinklers used where individual standard-response
sprinklers are replaced in existing light hazard systems

Section 9.2.1.7 is hereby revised as follows:

9.2.1.7 Concealed spaces filled with noncombustible insulation shall not require
sprinkler protection when approved by fire code official.

October 31, 2022
2022 CFC Code Amendments (County)

Page 19 of 22



NFPA 13D 202.2 Edition, Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systems in One-
and Two-Family Dwellings and Manufactured Homes is hereby amended as follows:

Section 7.1.2 is hereby revised as follows:

7.1.2 The sprinkler system piping shall not have separate control valves installed
unlegss supervised by a central station, proprietary, or remote station alarm
service.

NFPA 14, 2019 Edition, Installation of Standpipe and Hose Systems is hereby
amended as follows:

Section 7.3.1.1 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

NFPA 24, 2019 Edition, Standard for the Installation of Private Fire Service Mains
and Their Appurtenances is hereby amended as follows:

Section 6.2.8.1 is hereby added as follows:

6.2.8.1 All indicating valves controlling fire suppression water supplies shall be
painted OSHA red.

Exceptions:

1. Brass or bronze valves on sprinkler risers mounted to the exterior of the
building may be left unpainted.

2. Where OS&Y valves on the detector check assembly are the only control
valves, at least one OS&Y valve shall be painted red.

Section 6.2.9 is hereby amended as follows:

All connections to private fire service mains for fire protection systems shall be
arranged in accordance with one of the following so that they can be isolated:

(1) A postindicator valve installed not less than 40 ft (12 m) from the
building

(a) For buildings less than 40 ft (12 m) in height, a post indicator valve
shall be permitted to be installed closer than 40 ft (12 m) but at least
as far from the building as the height of the wall facing the post
indicator valve.

(2) A wall post indicator valve
(3) An indicating valve in a pit, installed in accordance with Section 6.4

(4) A backflow preventer with at least one indicating valve not less than 40 ft
(12 m) from the building

October 31, 2022
2022 CFC Code Amendments (County)

Page 20 of 22



(a) For buildings less than 40 ft (12 m) in height, a backflow preventer
with at least one indicating valve shall be permitted to be installed
closer than 40 ft (12 m) but at least as far from the building as the
height of the wall facing the backflow preventer.

(5) Control valves installed in a fire-rated room accessible from the exterior
(6) Control valves in a fire-rated stair enclosure accessible from the exterior
Section 11.1.1.1 is hereby added as follows:

11.1.1.1 When fire sprinkler systems are required in buildings of undetermined
use other than warehouses, they shall be designed and installed to have a fire
sprinkler density of not less than that required for an Ordinary Hazard Group 2
use, with no reduction(s) in density or design area. Warehouse fire sprinkler
systems shall be designed to Figure 16.2.1.3.2 (d) curve “G". Use is considered
undetermined if a specific tenant/occupant is not identified at the time the
sprinkler plan is submitted. Where a subsequent use or occupancy requires a
system with greater capability, it shall be the responsibility of the occupant to
upgrade the system to the required density for the new use or occupancy.

Section 10.1.5 is hereby added as follows:
10.1.5 All ferrous pipe and joints shall be polyethylene encased per AWWA C150,
Method A, B, or C. All fittings shall be protected with a loose 8-mil polyethylene
tube or sheet. The ends of the tube or sheet shall extend past the joint by a
minimum of 12 inches and be sealed with 2-inch-wide tape approved for
underground use. Galvanizing does not meet the requirements of this section.

Exception: 304 or 316 Stainless Stee! pipe and fittings
Section 10.4.1.1 is hereby revised as follows:

10.4.1.1 All bolted joint accessories shall be cleaned and thoroughly coated with
asphalt or other corrosion-retarding material after installation.

Exception: Bolted joint accessories made from 304 or 316 stainless steel.
Section 10.4.1.1.1 is hereby added as follows:
10.4.1.1.1 All bolts used in pipe-joint assembly shall be 316 stainless steel.

Section 10.4.3.2 is hereby deleted.

October 31, 2022
2022 CFC Code Amendments (County)

Page 21 of 22



Appendices
Appendix A is deleted in its entirety.

Appendix B is adopted in its entirety.
Appendix BB is adopted in its entirety.
Appendix C is adopted in its entirety.
Appendix CC is adopted in its entirety.
Appendix D is deleted in its entirety.
Appendix E is deleted in its entirety.
Appendix F is deleted in its entirety.
Appendix G is deleted in its entirety.
Appendix H is in its entirety.
Appendix | is deleted in its entirety.
Appendix J is deleted in its entirety.
Appendix K is deleted in its entirety.
Appendix L is deleted in its entirety.
Appendix M is deleted in its entirety.

Appendix N is deleted in its entirety.

October 31, 2022
2022 CFC Code Amendments (County)

Page 22 of 22



This ordinance shall take effect and be in full force thirty days from and afier its passage. This

ordinar}c_;e shall be published once in an adjudicated newspaper in the County of Orange within fifteen
days of its passage.

THE FOREGOING was PASSED and ADOPTED by the following vote of the Orange County
Board of Supervisors on December 06, 2022, to wit:

AYES: Supervisors:  LISA A. BARTLETT, ANDREW DO, KATRINA FOLEY
DOUG CHATFEE

NOES:
EXCUSED: DONALD P. WAGNER
ABSTAINED:
) QL'/"
/) 71 i‘
CHAIRMAN v

STATE OF CALIFORNIA )
) ss:
COUNTY OF ORANGE )

I, VALERIE SANCHEZ, Chief Deputy Clerk of the Board of Orange County, California, hereby
certify that a copy of this document has been delivered to the Chairman of the Board and that the above
and foregoing Ordinance was duly and regularly adopted by the Orange County Board of Supervisors.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereto set my hand and seal.

(Ui

VALERIE SANCHEZ
Chief Deputy Clerk of the Board.
County of Orange, State of California

Ordinance No.; 22-008
Agenda Date:  12/06/2022
Item No.: 28

__;_\*_';‘g,-' [ certify that the foregoing is a true and correct copy of the
Sﬁff??%ﬁ Ordinance adopted by the Board of Supervisors , Orange County,

Tfai™  State of California

ane:‘icwf Deputy Clerk of the Board of Supervisors.
By:

7 Deputy




ORDINANCE NO. 22-004

AN ORDINANCE OF THE COUNTY OF ORANGE, CALIFORNIA,
REPEALING THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, 2018 EDITION;
THE CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE, 2019 EDITION; THE CALIFORNIA
RESIDENTIAL CODE, 2019 EDITION; THE CALIFORNIA ENERGY CODE,
2019 EDITION; THE CALIFORNIA GREEN BUILDING STANDARDS
CODE, 2019 EDITION; THE CALIFORNIA HISTORICAL BUILDING
CODE, 2019 EDITION; THE CALIFORNIA EXISTING BUILDING CODE,
2019 EDITION; REPEALING ORDINANCE 19-006 AND ADOPTING BY
REFERENCE THE CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE, 2022 EDITION; THE
INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, 2021 EDITION; THE CALIFORNIA
RESIDENTIAL CODE, 2022 EDITION; THE CALIFORNIA ENERGY CODE,
2022 EDITION; THE CALIFORNIA GREEN BUILDING STANDARDS
CODE, 2022 EDITION; THE CALIFORNIA HISTORICAL BUILDING
CODE, 2022 EDITION; THE CALIFORNIA EXISTING BUILDING CODE,
2022 EDITION; WITH AMENDMENTS THERETO.

The Board of Supervisors of the County of Orange, California, ordains as follows:

SECTION 1. Article 2 of Division 1 of Title 7 of the Orange County Codified Ordinances is
hereby repealed.

SECTION 2. Article 2 of Division 1 of Title 7 of the Orange County Codified Ordinances is
hereby added to read as follows:

ARTICLE 2. BUILDING AND STRUCTURES

Section 7-1-12. ADOPTION OF CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE, INTERNATIONAL BUILDING
CODE, CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE, CALIFORNIA ENERGY CODE, CALIFORNIA GREEN BUILDING
STANDARDS CODE, CALIFORNIA HISTORICAL BUILDING CODE, AND CALIFORNIA EXISTING
BUILDING CODE.
a. The Board of Supervisors of the County of Orange hereby adopts the California Building Code,
2022 Edition and the International Building Code, 2021 Edition, as published by the International Code
Council, including Division II of Chapter 1 Administration, Appendix C, Appendix 1, and Appendix J,
except Chapters 1, 11, 27, 28, 29 in the text of the International Building Code, except such portions
as are deleted, modified, or amended in this Article. Chapter 1 of the International Building Code is

replaced with Division II of Chapter 1 of the California Building Code with County amendments.

Page 1 of 34



The Board of Supervisors of the County of Orange hereby adopts the California Residential
Code, 2022 Edition, including Appendix AH and Appendix AX. Division II of Chapter 1 of the California
Residential Code is replaced with Division II of Chapter 1 of the California Building Code with County
amendments.

The Board of Supervisors of the County of Orange hereby adopts the California Energy Code,
2022 Edition.

The Board of Supervisors of the County of Orange hereby adopts the California Green Building
Standards Code, 2022 Edition. Chapter 1 of the California Green Code is added to Division II of
Chapter 1 of the California Building Code with County amendments.

The Board of Supervisors of the County of Orange hereby adopts the California Historical
Building Code, 2022 Edition.

The Board of Supervisors of the County of Orange hereby adopts the California Existing
Building Code, 2022 Edition. Division II of Chapter 1 of the California Existing building Code is
replaced with Division II of Chapter 1 of the California Building Code with County amendments.

b. The purpose of these codes is to prescribe regulations for the erection, construction,
enlargement, alteration, repair, improving, removal, conversion, demolition, occupancy, equipment,
use, height, area and maintenance of all buildings and structures.

c. Not less than one (1) copy of each has been made and is now filed in the office of the OC
Public Works. They are hereby adopted and incorporated as if set forth at length herein. Whenever
there is a difference between the California Code and the International Code, the California Code shall
prevail,

Section 7-1-13. SECTION 101.1 OF DIVISION II of CHAPTER 1 AMENDED.

Section 101.1 of Division II of Chapter 1 of the 2022 California Building Code is hereby
amended to read as follows:

TITLE

Section 101.1 these regulations shall be known as the Orange County Building Code,

Page 2 of 34



hereinafter referred to as “this Code”.

Section 7-1-14. SECTION 101.2 AND SECTION 101.4 OF DIVISION II OF CHAPTER 1 AMENDED.

Section 101.2 and Section 101.4 Division II of Chapter 1 of the 2022 California Building Code is
hereby amended to read as follows:

SCOPE

Section 101.2. The provisions of this Code shall apply to the construction, alteration,
movement, enlargement, replacement, equipment, location, removal, demolition, repair, maintenance
and use and occupancy of any building or structure within the unincorporated area of the County,
and County-owned buildings and structures within incorporated cities, except work located primarily
in a public way, public utility towers and poles, mechanical equipment not specifically regulated in
this Code, and hydraulic flood control structures.

Where, in any special case, different sections of this Code specify different materials,
method of construction or other requirements, the most restrictive shall govern. Where there is a
conflict between a general requirement and a specific requirement, the specific requirement shall be
applicable.

Wherever in this Code reference is made to the Appendix, the provisions in the Appendix shall
not apply unless specifically adopted.

Section 101.4. The other codes listed in Section 101.4.1 through 101.4.7 and referenced
elsewhere in the Code shall be considered part of the requirements of the Code to the prescribed
extent of each such reference.

Section 101.4.1 Gas. The provisions of the California Plumbing Code shall apply to the
installation of gas piping from the point of delivery, gas appliances and related accessories as covered
in this Code. These requirements apply to gas piping systems extending from the point of delivery to
the inlet connections of appliances and the installation and operation of residential and commercial
gas appliances and related accessories.

Section 101.4.2 Mechanical. The provisions of the California Mechanical Code shall apply to

Page 3 of 34



the installation, alterations, repairs and replacement of mechanical systems, including equipment,
appliances, fixtures, fittings and/or appurtenances, inciuding ventilating, heating, cooling, air-
conditioning and refrigeration systems, incinerators and other energy-related systems.

Section 101.4.3 Plumbing. The provisions of the California Plumbing Code shall apply to the
installation, alteration, repair and replacement of plumbing systems, including equipment, appliances,
fixtures, fittings and appurtenances, and where connected to a water or sewage system and all
aspects of a medical gas system. The provisions of the California Plumbing Code shall apply to
private sewage disposal systems.

Section 101.4.4 Property Maintenance. The provisions of the California Existing Building Code
shall apply to existing structures and premises; equipment and facilities; light, ventilation, space
heating, sanitation, life and fire safety hazards; responsibilities of owners, operators and occupants;
and occupancy of existing premises and structures.

Section 104.4.5 Fire Prevention. The provisions of the California Fire Code shall apply to all
matters affecting or relating to structures, processes and premises from the hazard of fire and
explosion arising from storage, handling or use of structures, materials or devices; from conditions
hazardous to life, property or public welfare in the occupancy of structures or premises; and from the
construction, extension, repair, alteration or removal of fire suppression and alarm systems or fire
hazards In the structure or on the premises from occupancy or operation.

Section 101.4.6 Energy. The provisions of the California Energy Code, Title 24, Part 6 shall
apply to all matters governing the design and construction of buildings for energy efficiency.

Section 101.4.7 Existing buildings. The provisions of the California Existing Building Code,
Title 24, Part 10 shall apply to all matters governing the repair, alteration, change of occupancy,
addition to and relocation of existing buildings.

Section 7-1-15. SECTION 101.5 OF DIVISION II OF CHAPTER 1 ADDED.

Section 101 of Division II of Chapter 1 of the 2022 California Building Code is hereby amended

by adding Section 101.5 to read as follows:

Page 4 of 34



UNDERGROUND UTILITIES REQUIRED

Section 101.5. The Building Official shall, as a condition precedent to the issuance of a Building
Permit, require all utility services located within the exterior boundary lines of lot or parcel of property
to be installed underground if:

(1) The property is to be developed with a new or relocated main building;

(2) The remodeling, alteration, or addition to an existing main building, exceeds 50 percent of
the value and/or area of the existing building;

(3) A residential building or use is converted to any nonresidential use or purpose.

For purposes of this section, the term "main building" shall mean a building in which is
conducted the principal use of the lot or building site on which it Is located.

The owner or developer of the property is responsible for complying with the requirements of
this section and shall provide all necessary facilities on the property to recelve such service from the
supplying utilities.

If it Is determined that practical difficulties, or unreasonable hardships inconsistent with the
purposes of this chapter and unique to a particular parcel of property, would result from the literal
interpretation of this section, the Building Official may waive, modify or delay the imposition of an
underground requirement imposed pursuant to this section upon written application of any affected
property owner. The Building Official shall notify the applicant of his decision in writing by certified
mail. If the Building Official determines to delay the installation of required underground utilities, he
may require a recorded agreement guaranteeing the future performance of the work, together with
adequate performance security enforceable by the County in the form of a cash deposit, bond, letter
of credit, or other instrument satisfactory to the County Counsel.

For purposes of this section, appurtenances and associated equipment such as, but not limited
to, surface-mounted transformers, pedestal-mounted terminal boxes and meter cabinets, and
concealed ducts in an underground system, may be placed above ground.

Any person dissatisfied with the decision of the Building Official may file an appeal with the

Page 5 of 34



Hearing Officer within fifteen (15) days after the decision of the Building Official is deposited in the
mail by filing a written statement setting forth the reasons for said appeal with the County Clerk. The
Hearing Officer may overrule, modify, or affirm the decision of the Building Official.

Section 7-1-16. SECTION 116 OF DIVISION II OF CHAPTER 1 REPLACED.

Section 116 of Division II of Chapter 1 of the 2019 California Building Code is hereby replaced
to read as follows:

UNSAFE BUILDING, NUISANCES, NOTICE, ADMINISTRATIVE HEARING, APPEAL.

Section 116. (a) Unsafe Buildings. All buildings or structures which are structurally unsafe or
not provided with adequate egress, or which constitute a fire hazard, or are otherwise dangerous to
human life, or which in relation to existing use constitute a hazard to safety or health or public
welfare, by reason of inadequate maintenance, dilapidation, obsolescence, fire hazard, disaster
damage, or abandonment, as specified in this Code or in any other effective ordinance or statute, are,
for the purpose of this section, unsafe buildings and constitute an unsafe condition. All such unsafe
buildings or conditions are hereby declared to be public nuisances and shall be abated by repair,
rehabilitation, improvement, removal, or demolition, in whole or part, in accordance with the
procedures specified in this section.

(b) Fire Hazard. No person, including but not limited to the state and its political
subdivisions, operating any occupancy subject to these regulations shall permit any fire hazard, as
defined in this section, to exist on premises under their control, or fail to take immediate action to
abate a fire hazard when requested to do so by the enforcing agency.

NOTE: “Fire hazard" as used in these regulations means any condition, arrangement or act
which will increase, or may cause an increase of the hazard or menace of fire to a greater degree
than customarily recognized as normal by persons in the public service of preventing, suppressing or
extinguishing fire; or which may obstruct, delay or hinder, or may become the cause of obstruction,
delay or hindrance to the prevention, suppression or extinguishment of fire.

() Inspection. The Building Official shall examine or cause to be examined every

Page 6 of 34



building or structure or portion thereof or other condition reported as unsafe, dangerous, damaged, or
otherwise constituting a hazard as set forth in subsection (a) of this section. Said examination shall be
conducted in accordance with the provisions of this Code, other applicable statutes, and the
ordinances, rules, and regulations of the County of Orange.

(d) Notice of Defects. In any case where this section is made applicable by reference or
if any building, structure, or part thereof is found to be an unsafe building as defined in this section,
the Building Official shall give notice, setting forth the defects found, to the owner, other responsibie
person, or authorized representative, hereinafter referred to as "owner," of such building or structure.
The notice shall also set forth the right of the owner to be present at an administrative hearing, at his
option, and introduce such relevant evidence on the issues as he desires. The notice shall also set
forth the requirements of commencement and completion of work and the effect of failure to so do as
set forth in subsections (g) and (h) of this section.

(e) Time and Place of Hearing, Evidence. The notice shall set forth the time and place a
hearing shall be had before the Building Official. At the time and place so specified, evidence shall be
submitted as to the facts of any such defects as to reasonably establish their existence and the
Building Official shall determine whether the facts so established constitute an unsafe building.
Evidence may further be submitted as to the repairs, rehabilitation, improvements, removal or
demolition considered necessary to correct said defects.

() Order, Finality, Appeal.

(1) Atthe hearing and upon the determination of the existence of defects, the
Building Official shall determine whether such defects are subject to repair, rehabilitation, or
improvement, or whether they are of such a nature as to require removal or demolition of a part of or
the whole of any such building or structure, and he shall order such repairs, rehabilitation,
improvements, or demolition as is considered necessary in the case.

(2) The determination and order may be made orally at the hearing and shall be

written and transmitted to the owner within a reasonable time; the determination and order shall

Page 7 of 34



become final within five (5) days, excluding Saturday, Sunday, and holidays, from the time it is first
rendered, or in the event that the owner was not present at the hearing, within five (5) days of the
mailing of the order to the last known address of said owner, responsible party, or representative,
whichever first occurs.

(3) Appeal. The owner shall, if he desires to do so, at any time prior to the
determination and order becoming final as heretofore set forth, appeal the decision of the Building
Official to the Hearing Officer, and shall thereupon make a determination and order affirming,
reversing, or modifying the determination and order of the Building Official as the Hearing Officer may
deem proper. The order of the Hearing Officer shall be immediately final.

(g) Commencement and Completion of Work. The owner shall, upon the expiration of
five (5) days, excluding Saturday, Sunday, and holidays, following the finality of the determination and
order of the Building Official (or, if appealed, the determination and order of the Hearing Officer)
commence the repairs, rehabilitation, improvements, removal, or demolition ordered, and such work
shall be completed within the time specified by the Building Official (or the Hearing Officer, if
appealed.

(h) Failure of Commencement of Work. If the owner neglects or fails to commence,
within the time provided therefore, activity and the corrective work deemed necessary and as ordered,
the Building Official may cause the ordered repairs, rehabilitation, or improvements to be performed
forthwith and any cost thereof shall be a charge and expense against the owner personally and
collectible by an action at law.

() Right to Demolish. In case the owner shall fail, neglect, or refuse to comply with the
notice or order to remove or demolish said building or structure or portion thereof, the Board of
Supervisors of the County of Orange may order the Building Official to proceed with the work specified
in the notice or order. A statement of the cost of such work shall be transmitted to the Board of
Supervisors, who shall cause the same to be paid and levied as a speclal assessment against the

property. The Building Official may apply to the Board of Supervisors for an order under this

Page 8 of 34



subsection to proceed with the work specified in subsection (h) above where such work is not deemed
by him to require emergency action.

(j) Costs incurred under subsections (h) and (i) shall be paid by the County. Such costs
shall be charged to the owner of the premises involved. The Building Official may apply to the Board
of Supervisors to cause the costs for such work specified in subsection (h), and shall make such
application for costs incurred under subsection (i), to be paid and levied as a special assessment
against the property and collected in the manner provided for special assessments.

(k) Vacation of Premises, posting of signs. If necessary, the notice shall require the
building or structure or portion thereof or other site to be vacated forthwith, and within the time
specified, in the interest of immediate public safety pending the finality of any determination and
order.

The Buillding Official shall cause to be posted at each entrance to such building a notice to
prohibit occupancy.

Such notices shall remain posted until the corrected conditions, required repairs, rehabilitation,
removal or demolition are completed and a Certificate of Occupancy is issued as set forth in this Code.

Such posted notices shall not be removed without written permission of the Building Official,
and no person shall enter the building except for the purpose of making the required repairs or of
demolishing the building. The notice required by this section may be served either:

(1) By delivering a copy to the owner or authorized representative as designated on
papers, applications, or permits on file with the Building Official, personally; or

(2) If either or both be absent from his place of residence and from his usual or
designated place of business, by leaving a copy with some person of suitable age and discretion at
elither place, and sending a copy of certified mail, receipt requested, addressed to the owner or
authorized representative at his place of residence; or

(3) If such place of residence and business cannot be ascertained, or a person of

suitable age or discretion there cannot be found, then by affixing a copy in a conspicuous place on the

Page 9 of 34



property, building structure, and also delivering copy to a person there residing, if any; to the person
in charge, if any; and also sending a copy by certified mail, return receipt requested, addressed to the
owner at the place where the property, building, or structure is situated, or to the owner at his last
known or designated address, or both.

Section 7-1-17, SECTION 105.2 OF DIVISION II OF CHAPTER 1 AMENDED.

Section 105.2 of Division II of Chapter 1 of the 2022 California Building Code is hereby
amended to replace items 1 and 2, and add item 14 as follows:

(1) One-story detached accessory buildings used as tool and storage sheds, play houses
and similar uses, provided the floor area does not exceed 120 square feet, and the structure is at least
3 feet from property line and 6 feet from other buildings or structures located on the same property.
It is permissible that these structures still be regulated by Section 710A, despite exemption from
permit.

(2) Fences not over six (6) feet high. Exception: Walls and fences less than six (6) feet
in height which are required as a condition of project approval to have permits.

(14) Other incidental structures and improvements of a minor nature may be exempt

from the provisions of this Code upon the determination of the Building Official.
Note: The balance of Section 105.2 is implemented as written.
Section 7-1-18. SECTION 105.3 OF DIVISION II OF CHAPTER 1 AMENDED.
Section 105.3 of Division II of Chapter 1 of the 2022 California Building code is hereby amended
to read as follows:
Section 105.3 Application for permit. A separate permit shall be required for each building or
structure. To obtain a permit, the applicant shall first file an application therefore in writing on a form

furnished by the GC Public Works for that purpose. Such application shall:
1. Identify and describe the work to be covered by the permit for which application is made.

2. Describe the land on which the proposed work Is to be done by legal description, street

address or similar description that will readily identify and definitely locate the proposed

Page 10 of 34



building or work.

3. Indicate the use and occupancy for which the proposed work is intended.

4. Be accompanied by construction documents and other information as required in Section
107.

5. State the valuation of the proposed work.

6. Be signed by the applicant, or the applicant’s authorized agent.

7. Give such other data and information as required by the Building Official.

Note: The balance of Section 105.3 is implemented as written, except Section 105.3.2 is deleted.

Section 7-1-19. SECTION 105.5 OF DIVISION II OF CHAPTER 1 REPLACED.

Section 105.5 of Division II of Chapter 1 of the 2022 California Building Code is hereby replaced

as follows:

PERMIT EXPIRATION
Section 105.5 Expiration. Every permit Issued by the Building Official under the provisions of

this Code shall expire by limitation and become null and void if the building or work authorized by
such permit is not commenced within 12 months from the date of such permit, or if the building or
work authorized by such permit is suspended or abandoned at any time after the work is commenced
for a period of one hundred eighty (180) days. Before such work can be commenced or
recommenced, a permit shall first be extended or re-issued.

1) Requesting extension of an unexpired permit: Any permittee holding an unexpired permit
or a permit which has expired for less than 180 days may apply for an extension of time within which
permittee may commence work under that permit when he/she is unable to commence or
recommence work within the time required by this section for good and satisfactory reasons. The
Building Official may extend the time for action by the permittee for a period not exceeding one
hundred eighty (180) days upon written request by the permittee showing that circumstances beyond
the control of the permittee have prevented action from being taken. Permits extended In this manner

shall not be subject to new regulations adopted after issuance of the permit. Fees for time extension
Page 11 of 34



shall be as established by the Board of Supervisors.

(2) Requesting re-issuance of a permit which has been expired for 180 days or more: Any
permittee holding a permit which has been expired for 180 days or more may apply for re-issuance of
the permit subject to compliance with current regulations and payment of full plan check and permit
fees. Plans must be re-submitted for plan check. Portions of the structure which have been built under
the expired permit shall not be subject to current regulations.

(3) For the purpose of permit extension, multiple permits of the same structure such as
building, foundation, retaining wall, plumbing, mechanical, and electrical permits shall be considered
as one permit. Extension of building permit shall include extension of ancillary permits of the same
structure, Each separate permit with work completed inspected and approved entirely prior to
suspension or abandonment shall not be subject to extension or re-issuance.

Section 7-1-20. SECTION 105.8 OF DIVISION II OF CHAPTER 1 ADDED.

Section 105 of Division II of Chapter 1 of the 2022 California Building Code is hereby amended
by adding Section 105.8 to read as follows:

Section 105.8 Change of Contractor or of Ownership. A permit issued hereunder shall expire
upon a change of ownership or a change of contractor regarding the building, structure or grading for
which said permit was issued if the work thereon has not been completed, and a new permit shall be
required for the completion of the work. If the provisions of section 105.5 above are not applicable
and If no changes have been made to the plans and specifications last submitted to the Building
Official, no charge, other than a “name change” and the permit issuance fee, shall be made for the
issuance of the new permit under such circumstances. If, however, changes have been made to the
plans and specifications last submitted to the Building Official, fees as established by the Board of
Supervisors shall be charged to the permit application.

Section 7-1-21. SECTION 109 OF DIVISION II OF CHAPTER 1 REPLACED.

Section 109 of Division II of Chapter 1 of the 2022 California Building Code Is hereby replaced

to read as follows:

Page 12 of 34



Section 109. FEES AND PLAN REVIEW

Section 109.1 General. A fee as established by the Board of Supervisors shall be paid for each
permit at time of issuance.

Section 109.2 Permit Fees. The determination of value or valuation under any of the provisions
of this Code shall be as established by the Board of Supervisors. The valuation shall be the total value
of all construction work for which the permit is issued, as well as all finish work, painting, roofing,
electrical, plumbing, heating, air conditioning, elevators, fire-extinguishing systems and any other
permanent equipment.

Failure to pay fees and obtain a permit before commencing work shall be deemed a violation of
this Code, except when it can be proven to the satisfaction of the Building Official that an emergency
existed which made it impractical to first obtain the permit. A violation shall result in an assessment of
double fees for work done prior to permit issuance. Payment of a double fee shall not relieve any
person from fully complying with the requirements of this Code nor from any other penalties
prescribed herein.

Section 109.3 Plan Review Fees. When a plan or other data Is required to be submitted for plan
review, a plan-checking fee shall be paid at the time of submitting plans and specifications for
checking. Said plan-checking fee shall be established by the Board of Supervisors.

Section 109.4 Expiration of Plan Review. Application for which no permit is issued within 180
days following the date of application shall expire by limitation and plans and other data submitted for
review may thereafter be returned to the applicant or destroyed by the Building Official. The Building
Official may extend the time for action by the applicant for a pericd of 180 days on request by the
applicant showing that circumstances beyond the control of the applicant have prevented action from
being taken. No application shall be extended more than once. In order to renew action on an
application after expiration, the applicant shall resubmit plans and pay a new plan review fee.
Extension or renewal of building permit application shall include extension or renewal of ancillary

permit applications of the same structure.

Page 13 of 34



Section 109.5 Investigation Fee. An investigation fee as established by the Board of Supervisors
may be charged by the Building Official whenever work for which a permit is required by this Code has
been commenced without first obtaining sald permit. This fee shall be paid and the investigation shall
be made prior to the issuance of any permit for said work. An investigation fee may be charged for
any investigation of a building, structure, work reports, certification or any other related work
requested by an owner or authorized agent of such owner.

Section 109.6 Fee Refunds. The Building Official may authorize refunding of fee which was
erroneously paid or collected.

Section 109.7 Additional Plan Review Fees. Where plans are incomplete or changed so as to
require additional plan checking, an additional plan checking fee as established by the Board of
Supervisors shall be paid. Said fee may be waived when in the opinion of the Building Official the
additional fee is not warranted.

Section 109.8 Conversion Inspection Fee. A fee as established by the Board of Supervisors shall
be paid when a conversion inspection is required by the Building Official.

Note: The conversion fees do not include the fees for the building permit, nor fees for electrical,
plumbing or heating and ventilating permits covering the alterations and/or repairs of the conversion.

Section 7-1-22. SECTION 111 OF DIVISION II OF CHAPTER 1 AMENDED.

Section 111 of Division II of Chapter 1 of the 2022 California Bullding Code is hereby amended
to read as follows:

Section 111. CERTIFICATE OF OCCUPANCY

Section 111.1 Use and Occupancy. No building or structure shall be used or occupied, nor shall
the gas or electrical systems be energized, until the Building Official has determined compliance with
this Code, all other applicable ordinances and laws and the conditions of the building permit, and has
authorized occupancy of such building or structure by the issuance of a Certificate of Occupancy
therefore as provided herein. No change in the existing occupancy classification of a building or

structure or portion thereof shall be made until the Building Official has issued a Certificate of

Page 14 of 34



Occupancy therefore as provided herein.

Exception: Gas and electrical systems may be energized prior to the issuance of a Certificate of

Occupancy when properly authorized by the Building Official for the purpose of testing systems

or equipment.

111.2 Certificate Issue. After the Building Official inspects the building or structure and finds no
violation of the provisions of this Code or other applicable laws and regulations, the Building Official
shall issue a Certificate of Occupancy.

Issuance of a Certificate of Occupancy shall not be construed as an approval of a violation of
the provisions of this Code or of other ordinances of the jurisdiction. Certificates presuming to give
authority to violate or cancel the provisions of this Cade or other ordinances of the jurisdiction shall
not be valid.

Note: Sections 111.3 and 111.4 are implemented as written.

Section 7-1-23. SECTION 113 OF DIVISION II OF CHAPTER 1 REPLACED.

Section 113 of Division II of Chapter 1 of the 2022 California Building Code is hereby replaced
to read as follows:

HEARING OFFICER

Section 113.1 General. In order to determine the suitability of alternate materials and methods
of construction and to provide for reasonable interpretations of this Code, there shall be and is hereby
created a Hearing Officer. Hearing Officer shall be appointed by the Director of OC Public Works.

Section 7-1-24. SECTION 114 OF DIVISION II OF CHAPTER 1 AMENDED.

Section 114 of Division II of Chapter 1 of the 2022 California Building Code Is hereby amended
to read as follows:

VIOLATIONS AND PENALTIES.

Section 114.1. It shall be unlawful for any person, firm, or corporation to erect, construct,
enlarge, alter, repair, move, improve, remove, convert or demolish, equip, use, occupy, or maintain

any building or structure in the unincorporated area of the County of Orange, or cause or permit the

Page 15 of 34



same to be done in violation of this Code.

Any person, firm, corporation viclating any of the provisions of this Code shall be deemed guilty
of a misdemeanor, and each such person shall be deemed guilty of a separate offense for each and
every day or portion thereof during which any violation of any of the provisions of this Code is
committed, continued, or permitted, and upon conviction of any such violation such person shall be
punished by a fine of not more than Five Hundred Dollars ($500) or by imprisonment for not more
than six (6) months, or by both such fine and imprisonment.

In addition to any such fine or imprisonment, the court may also require such party to correct

of mitigate the building violation to the satisfaction of the Building Official.
Section 114.1.1 In addition to the provisions of the subsections above, a notice of violation of

this Code may be recorded in accordance with the following procedures.
1. Notice of intent
A written notice of intent to record a notice of violation shall be served on the current
owner of record of the property. Such notice shall describe the property, the violation and the action
necessary to correct or mitigate the violation. The notice shall inform the owner that a notice of
violation will be recorded if the owner does not, within 20 days of receipt thereof, either correct the
violation or request a meeting with the Building Officials as set forth below. The notice shall include a
copy of this subsection 114.1.1 and be substantially as follows:
Notice of Continuing Violation of the California and Orange County Building Code.
Notice Is hereby given that the County of Orange has determined that a violation of the above
Code exists on the following described property (description). The violation consists of (description).
While a violation of the above Code exists, the County of Orange may refuse to approve
building or occupancy permits, subdivision maps, use permits, and other discretionary permits and
development approvals.”
2. Correction of Violation
If, within 20 days of receipt of a notice of intent, the owner corrects the violation, no notice

Page 16 of 34



of violation shall be recorded. The Building Official may grant extensions of time for good cause.

3. Meeting

If the owner requests a meeting, the Building Official shall schedule a meeting. Notice of

the meeting shall be served on the owner not less than 15 days prior thereto. The Building Official
may reschedule the meeting from time to time for a good cause with adequate notice to the
landowner. At the meeting, the owner may be represented by counsel and may present any relevant
evidence that violations do not exists.

4, Decision, Notice

Within 30 days following completion of the meeting, the Building Official shall issue and
serve on the owner his determination as to whether or not a notice of violation will be recorded. This
determination shall be supported by appropriate findings on all material issues raised at the meeting.
The decision of the Building Official shall be final with respect to recordation of a notice of violation,
but shall not affect other proceedings under Section 114.1.1.

5. Recordation

If the Building Official determines that a notice will be recorded, such notice shall be
recorded 15 days or more days after service of notice of the decision.

6. Release of Notice

When a violation is corrected or mitigated to the satisfaction of the Building Official, if a
notice of violation had been recorded, the Building Official shall cause a release to be recorded. Said
release shall refer to the notice of violation and shall state that the violation described therein has been
corrected.
Note: The balance of Section 114 Is implemented as written, except Section 114.4 is deleted.

Section 7-1-25. SECTION 117, 118, 119, and 120 OF DIVISION II OF CHAPTER 1 ADDED.

Division II of Chapter 1 of the 2022 California Building Code is hereby amended by adding Sections

117, 118, 119, and 120 to read as follows:

Page 17 of 34



PLASTERING PERMITS, FEES
Section 117. Tt shall be unlawful for any person, firm or corporation, whether acting as
principal, agent or employee, to do or cause or permit to be done any plastering work, Interior or
exterior, within the area covered by this Code without first obtaining a permit therefore from the
Building Official, and further:
1.  Every applicant for a permit to plaster shall state, in writing on the application form
provided for that purpose, the character of the work proposed to be done and the amount and kind,

together with such information pertinent thereto, as may be required.

2. Such applicant shall pay for each permit issued a fee as established by the Board of
Supervisors.

3. Any person who shall commence on plastering work for which a permit is required
by this Code without having first obtained a permit therefore, shall, if subsequently permitted to obtain
a permit, pay double the fees fixed by this Code for such work.

Emergency Measures

Section 118. Section 116 of Division II of chapter 1 of 2022 California Existing Building Code is
added to be Section 118 of Division II of Chapter 1 of 2022 California Building Code.
Demolition

Section 119. Section 117 of Division II of chapter 1 of 2022 California Existing Building Code is
added to be Section 119 of Division II of Chapter 1 of 2022 California Building Code.

Electrical Charging stations:

Section 120. An expedited review and permit issuance process is provided for Electrical
Charging Stations and simplified forms for submittal are available on the County’s website per
Assembly Bill AB1236, California Government Code Section 65850.7.

Section 7-1-26. SECTION 1507.3 AMENDED.

Section 1507.3 of the 2022 California Building Code is hereby amended to add Section

Page 18 of 34



1057.3.11 as follows:

Section 1507.3.11. For the design of fasteners for tile roofing materials, the unincorporated
area of the County shall be considered as a "Special Wind Region" with a basic wind speed over
nominal 95 miles per hour.

Note: The balance of Section 1507.3 is implemented as written.

Section 7-1-27. SECTION 1507 AMENDED

Section 1507 of the 2022 California Building Code is hereby amended to add Section 1507.18 as
follows:

Section 1507.18. The roof covering or roof assembly on any structure regulated by this Code
shall be as specified and classified in Chapter 15.

Exceptions:

1. All new buildings and additions shall be minimum Class B roof.

2. Re-roofing, repairs or replacements on buildings shall be of the same classification as the

original roof except that non-rated and Class C roofs shall be a minimum Class C.

3. When any re-roofing, repair or replacement to an existing roof exceeds 40 percent of the

roof area, the entire roof shall be replaced with minimum class B roof.

4, Roofing on buildings located within Wildland — Urban Interface Fire Area shall be Class A

and meet additional requirements of Chapter 7A of the California Building Code.

Note: The balance of Section 1507 is implemented as written.

Section 7-1-28. SECTION 1612.3 AMENDED.

Section 1612.3 of the 2022 California Building Code is hereby amended to insert:

NAME OF JURISDICTION:Orange County, California- Unincorporated
DATE OF ISSUANCE: March 21, 2019

NOTE: The balance of Section 1612.3 is implemented as written.
Section 7-1-29. SECTION 1704.2.1 AMENDED.
SPECIAL INSPECTIONS
Page 19 of 34



Section 1704.2.1 of the 2022 California Building Code is hereby amended to add Section
1704.2.1.1 as follows:

Section 1704.2.1.1 Special Inspector. The special inspector shall be a qualified person who shall
demonstrate competence, to the satisfaction of the Building Official, for inspection of the particular
type of construction or operation requiring special inspection.

Each person applying for listing as a special inspector for the OC Public Works of the County of
Orange shall provide evidence of experience and possess a valid Certification as a Special Inspector
issued by the International Code Council (ICC) or equivalent as determined by the Building Official for
each classification for which the person is applying.

A County of Orange registration card, which identifies the person as a special inspector in the
appropriate category, shall be issued to each such person that has successfully completed the
application and examination process as determined by the Building Official and upon payment of a
registration fee as established by the Board of Supervisors.

The annual renewal of the registration cards shall occur on renewal date of ICC certiﬁcation or
equivalent for the classification being renewed. A renewal fee established by the Board of Supervisors
for each inspection category shall be charged. The application and renewal fee shall be accompanied
by appropriate evidence that the person's ICC or equivalent special inspector’s certification is valid,

The Building Official may revoke any County of Orange special inspector’s registration card at
any time for due cause by written notice. This notice shall set forth the time and place a hearing shall
be held before the Building Official at which time and place evidence would be submitted to show
cause why the registration card should not be withdrawn. Failure to appear at such hearing by the

special inspector may result in immediate revocation of said special inspector's registration card.
Note: The balance of Section 1704.2.4 is implemented as written.

Section 7-1-30. Appendix J of 2022 California Building Code hereby amended by the OC
Grading and Excavation Code, latest edition. In the event of any conflict between the OC Grading and

Excavation Code and Appendix J, the more restrictive condition shall prevail.

Page 20 of 34



Section 7-1-31. Not Used.

Section 7-1-32. Not Used.

Section 7-1-33. SECTION 903.2 AMENDED

Section 903.2 of the 2022 California Building Code Is hereby amended to read as foliows:

[F] Section 903.2 Where required. Approved automatic sprinkler systems in buildings and
structures shall be provided in the following locations:

1. New Buildings: Notwithstanding any applicable portions of Sections 903.2.1 through
903.2.19, an automatic fire-extinguishing system shall also be installed in all
occupancies when the total building area, as defined in Section 202, exceeds 5,000
square feet (465 m?), or more than two stories in height, regardless of fire areas or
allowable area.

Exception: Group R-3 occupancies. Group R-3 occupancies shall comply with Section
903.2.8.

2. Existing building. Notwithstanding any applicable provisions of this Code, an automatic
sprinkler system shall be provided in an existing building when an addition occurs and
when one of the following conditions exist.

a. When the addition is 33% or more of the existing building area and the resulting
building area, exceeds 5,000 square feet (465m?); or

b. When the addition exceeds 2,000 (185.81m?) square feet and the resulting
building area, exceeds 5,000 square feet (465m?2); or

c. An additional story is added above the second floor regardless of fire areas or
allowable area.

Note: The balance of Section 903.2 beginning with Section $03.2.1 is implemented as

written with exception that Section 03.2.8 is amended.

Section 7-1-34. SECTION 903.2.8 AMENDED.

Page 21 of 34



Section 903.2.8 of the 2022 California Building Code is hereby amended to read as follows:
[F] Section 903.2.8 Group R. An automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with
Section 903.3 shall be provided throughout all buildings with a Group R fire area as follows:
1. New Buildings: An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed throughout all new
buildings.
2. Existing buildings: All existing buildings shall be equipped with an automatic sprinkler
when the alteration or addition meets the following conditions:

a. Alteration: When the area of the existing structure is greater than 5,500 square
feet and the area of alteration within any two year period exceeds 50% of area
of the existing structure.

Exception: ~ When the cost of installing an approved automatic fire sprinkler
exceeds 5% of the cost of the alteration, with the approval of the Fire Code Official,
the required automatic fire sprinkler system may be omitted,

b. Addition: The addition and existing building shall be equipped with an
automatic sprinkler system when the total square footage of the structure,
including any addition greater than 550 square feet, is 5,500 square feet or
greater.

Exception: When the cost of installing an approved automatic sprinkler system
exceeds 5% of the cost of the addition, with the approval of the Fire Code Official,
the required automatic sprinkler system may be omitted.

Note: The balance of Section 903.2.8, beginning with Exceptions, is implemented
as written.

Section 7-1-35. SECTION 903.3 AMENDED
Section 903.3 of the 2022 California Building Code is hereby amended to add Section 903.3.5.3:
[F] Section 903.3.5.3

Hydraulically calculated systems. The design of hydraulically calculated fire sprinkler systems shall not

Page 22 of 34



exceed 90% of the water supply capacity.
Exception: When static pressure exceeds 100 psi, and required by the Fire Code Official, the

fire sprinkler system shall not exceed water supply capacity specified by Table 903.3.5.3

TABLE 903.3.5.3
Hydraulically Calculated Systems
Design %
75—
80—
85—
30 | ] | ]

100 110 120 130 140 150 Psi

Note: The balance of Section 903.3 is implemented as written.

Section 7-1-36. Not Used.

Section 7-1-37. Not Used.

Section 7-1-38. Not Used.

Section 7-1-39. Not Used.

Section 7-1-40. Not Used.

Section 7-1-41. Not Used.

Section 7-1-42. Not Used.

Section 7-1-43. Deleted

Section 7-1-44 CHAPTER 35 AMENDED

Chapter 35 of the 2022 California Building Code and the 2021 International Building Code Is
hereby amended to read as follows:

Chapter 35 Referenced Standards is hereby adopted and revised as follows:

Page 23 of 34



NFPA 13, 2022 Edition, Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systems is hereby amended as
follows:

Section 16.12.3.3 is hereby revised as follows:

Section 16.12.3.3. Fire department connections (FBC) shall be of an approved type. The
location shall be approved and be no more than 150 feet from a public hydrant, The FDC may be
located within 150 feet of a private fire hydrant when approved by the fire code official. The size of
piping and the number of 2Y2" inlets shall be approved by the fire code official. If acceptable to the
water authority, it may be installed on the backflow assembly. Fire department inlet connections shall
be painted OSHA safety red or as approved. When the fire sprinkler density design requires more than
500 gpm (including inside hose stream demand), or a standpipe system is included, four 2 Y2 inch
inlets shall be provided.

Section 9.4.3.1 is hereby revised as follows:

Section 9.4.3.1. When the fire sprinkler systems are installed in shell buildings of undetermined
use (Spec Buildings) other than warehouses (S occupancies), fire sprinklers of the quick-response type
shall be used. Use is considered undetermined if a specific tenant/occupant is not Identified at the
time the fire sprinkler plan is Submitted Sprinklers in light hazard occupancies shall be one of the
following.

1. Quick-response type as defined in 3.6.4.8

2. Residential sprinklers in accordance with the requirements of 8.4.5.

3. Quick Response CMSA sprinklers

4, ESFR sprinklers

5. Standard-response sprinklers used for modifications or additions to existing light hazard
systems equipped with standard-response sprinklers

6. Standard-response sprinkiers used where individual standard-response sprinklers are

replaced in existing high hazard systems

Page 24 of 34



Section 9.2.1.7 is hereby revised as follows:
9.2.1.7 Concealed spaces filled with noncombustible insulation shall not require sprinkler
protection when approved by fire code official.
NFPA 13D 2022 Edition, Standard for the installation of sprinkler systems in one and two-family
dwellings and manufactured homes is hereby amended as follows:
Section 7.1.2 is hereby revised as follows:
Section 7.1.2. The sprinkier system piping shall not have a separate control valves installed
unless supervised by a central station, proprietary or remote station alarm service.
NFPA 14, 2019 Edition, Installation of Standpipe and Hose Systems is hereby amended as
follows:
Section 7.3.1.1 is hereby deleted in its entirety:
NFPA 24, 2019. Edition, Standard for the installation of private fire service mains and their
appurtenances is hereby amended as follows:
Section 6.2.8.1 is hereby added as follows:
Section 6.2.8.1. All indicating valves controlling fire suppressicn water supplies shall be painted
OSHA red.
Exceptions:
1. Brass or bronze valves on sprinkler risers mounted to the exterior of the building may be left
unpainted.
2. Where OS&Y valves on the detector check assembly are the only control valves, at least one
OS&Y valve shall be painted red.
Section 6.2.9 is hereby revised as follows:
Section 6.2.9. All connections to private fire service mains for fire protection systems shall be
arranged in accordance with one of the following so that they can be isolated:

(1) A post indicator valve installed not less than 40 ft (12 m) from the building

Page 25 of 34



(@)  For buildings less than 40 ft (12 m) in height, a post indicator valve shall be
permitted

to be installed closer than 40 ft (12 m) but at least as far from the building as the height
of the wall facing the post indicator valve.

(2) A wall post indicator valve

(3) An indicating valve in a pit, installed in accordance with Section 6.4

(4) A backflow preventer with at least one indicating valve not less than 40 ft (12 m) from

the building

(@)  For buildings less than 40 ft (12 m) in height, a backflow preventer with at least one
indicating valve shall be permitted to be installed closer than 40 ft (12 m) but at least as far
from the building as the height of the wall facing the backflow preventer.

(5) Control Valves installed in a fire-rated room accessible from the exterior.

(6) Control Valves in a fire-rated stair enclosure accessible from the exterior.

Section 10.1.5 is hereby added as follows:

Section 10.1.5. All ferrous pipe and joints shall be polyethylene encased per AWWA C150,
Method A, B, or C. All fittings shall be protected with a loose 8-mil polyethylene tube or sheet. The
ends of the tube or sheet shall extend past the joint by a minimum of 12 inches and be sealed with a
2 inch wide tape approved for underground use. Galvanizing does not meet the requirements of this
section.

Exception: 304 or 316 Stainless steel pipe and fittings.

Section 10.4.1.1 is hereby revised as follows:

Section 10.4.1.1 All bolted joint accessories shall be cleaned and thoroughly coated with
asphalt or other corrosive-retarding material after installation.

Exception: Bolted joint accessories made from 304 or 316 stainless steel.

Section 1 0.4.1.1.1. is hereby added as follows:

Page 26 of 34



Section 10.4.1.1.1. All bolts used in pipe-joint assembly shall be 316 stainless steel.

Section 10.4.3.2 is hereby Deleted:

Section 7-1-45. SECTION 3109 ADOPTED AND AMENDED

Section 3109 of the 2022 California Building Code is hereby adopted and amended to read as
follows:

Section 3109 SWIMMING POOLS , SPAS and HOT TUBS

Section 3109.1 General. The design and construction of private swimming pools, spas and hot
tubs shall comply with the 2022 California Residential Code, Appendix AX, Swimming Pool, Spa, Hot tub
Safety as adopted and amended.

Section 7-1-46 Not Used.

Section 7-1-47. TABLE R301.2 (1) AMENDED

Table R301.2 (1) of the 2022 California Residential code is revised to read:

WIND DESIGN SUBJICT TO DAMAGE FROM
Spocd sasmic ¥ ARNA
GROuD OESIGN s | poon AIR FREEZING MEAN ARNAUL
toao® Topogragh | ST CATEFORY 1 woottatnge | Prostioe | qogrmiier eNT HAZARDS oz TENR
leoffoct® | o depth REQUIRED?
{mph) Ocixls
000"
Zaro 5 NO ° NO p2ore Nogilgible 1334 “‘:,', No Soa Tabls A 0 6
MANUAL 3 OESIGN CRITERIA®
prw— "AGtado ot " Tadoor winter dasign Ay~ Tndoor winter design | OGt2oor winicr dasign dsy-bush Hoating teperatire
o factar butb butb dry-buld difforenc
54 - [ 70 - » i
tndoor summes dast Indoor summer tndocs summes Sasign Outdoor summer design dry= Coollng tomperstisre
Lattude Deltyrenga ot bty o Y » toth fferenco
) ] 75 [ 10

a. Where weathering requires a higher strength concrete or grade of masonry than
necessary to satisfy the structural requirements of this Code, the frost line depth
strength required for weathering shall govern. The weathering column shall be filled
in with the weathering index (i.e. “negligible”, “moderate” or “severe”) for concrete as
determined from Figure R301.2(1)]. The grade of masonry units shall be determined

from the ASTM C 34, C 55, C 62, C 73, C 90, C 129, C 145, C 216 or C 652,
Page 27 of 34



. Where the frost line depth requires deeper footings than indicated in Figure R403.1
(1),the frost line depth strength required for weathering shall govern. The jurisdiction
shall fill in the frost line depth column with the minimum depth of footing below finish
grade.

. The jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table to indicate the need for protection
depending on whether there has been a history of jocal subterranean termite damage.
. The jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with the wind speed from the basic
wind speed map [Figure R301.2(2)] Wind exposure category shall be determined on a
site-specific basis in accordance with Section R301.2.1.4.

. The jurisdiction shall fill in this section of the table to establish the design criteria using

Table 10A from ACCA Manual J or established criteria determined by the jurisdiction.

. The jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with the seismic design category

determined from Section R301.2.2.1.

. The jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with: the date of the jurisdiction’s
entry into the National Flood Insurance Program (date of adoption of the first code or
ordinance for management of flood hazard areas); and the title and the date of the
currently effective Flood insurance Study or other flood hazard study and maps
adopted by the authority having jurisdiction, as amended.

. In accordance with Sections R905.1.2, R905.4.3.1, R905.5.3.1, R905.6.3.1, R905.7.3.1
and R905.8.3.1, where there has been a history of local damage from the effects of
ice damming, the jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with “YES”. Otherwise,
the jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with "NO”.

The jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with the 100-year return period air
freezing index (BF-days) from Figure R403.3 (2) or from the 100-year (99%) value on

the National Climatic Data Center data table “Air Freezing Index-USA Method (Base

Page 28 of 34



32°F) at www.ncdc.noaa.qov/fpsf.html.

The jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with the mean annual temperature
from the National Climatic Data Center data table “Air Freezing Index-USA Method
(Base 32°F)" at www.ncdc.noaa.gov/fpsf.html.

In accordance with Section R301.2.1.5 where there is local historical data
documenting structural damage to buildings due to topographic wind speed-up effects,
the jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with “YES"., Otherwise, the jurisdiction
shall indicate “"NO” in this part of the table.

In accordance with Figure R301.2(2), where there is local historical data documenting
unusual wind conditions, the jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table “YES" and
identify any specific requirements. Otherwise, the jurisdiction shall indicate "NO" in

this part of table.

. In accordance with Section R301.2.1.2, the jurisdiction shall indicate the wind-borne

debris wind zone(s). Otherwise, the jurisdiction shall indicate "NO” in this part of table.

n. The jurisdiction shall fill in these sections of the table to establish the design criteria
using Table 1a or 1b from ACCA Manual J or established criteria determined by the
jurisdiction.

0. The jurisdiction shall fill in this section of the table using the Ground Snow Loads in
Figures R301.2(3) and R301.2(4).

TABLE A
Initial Initial Most Recent Firm
NFIP Firm Panel Date

Community Communit Located on Panels Map Date

Name y Number Date

Orange 060212 28,29, 33, 34¢, 38,42,55, 58, 1/10/75 9714779 03/21/2018

County 591,
Unincorpora 61, 62,63,64,66,67!,68,69,9
ted Areas

0,95,108,112,113,114,116,1
17,118,
129,136,137,138,151,153,15

1,
156,157,158,159,162,164,16
6,
167,168,169,180,185,190,19

Page 29 of 34




5,
2251,226,227,229,231,233,2
34,
241,242,251,256,264,267,26
9,
277,278,281,282,286,294,30

S,
306,307,308!,309,315,316,3
17,
326,327,328,329!,335,336,3
37,
338,339,345,375',377,404,4
06',407,408,409,412,416,41
7,419,
426,428,432,434,436,438,44
1,
442,444,451,452,453,454, 46
o,
465,470, 500,526,527, 529},
5352

1 PANEL NOT PRINTED — NO SPECIAL FLOOD HAZARD AREAS
Section 7-1-48, SECTION R313.1 AMENDED
Section R313.1 of the 2022 California Residential Code is hereby amended to read as follows:
Section R313.1. Townhouse Automatic Fire Sprinkler Systems. Fire sprinkler systems shall be
provided as required under Section 903.2.8 of the California Building Code with amendments by
County Ordinance.
Note: The balance of Section R313.1, beginning with Section R313.1.1. is implemented as
written.
Section 7-1-49. SECTION R313.2 AMENDED
Section R313.2 of the 2022 California Residential Code is hereby amended to read as follows:
Section R313.2. One and Two Family Dwellings Automatic Fire Sprinkler Systems. Fire
sprinkler systems shall be provided as required under Section 903.2.8 of the California Building Code
with amendments by the County Ordinance.
Note: The balance of Section R313.2, beginning with Section R313.2.1 is implemented as
written.
Section 7-1-50. SECTION R403.1.3 AMENDED

Section R403.1.3 of the 2022 California Residential Code is hereby amended to delete section

Page 30 of 34



R403.1.3.6.

Note: The balance of Section R403.1.3, beginning with Section R403.1.3.1 is implemented as

written,

Section 7-1-51. SECTION R405.1 AMENDED

Section R405.1 of the 2022 California Residential Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section R405.1 Concrete or masonry foundations. Drains shall be provided around all concrete
or masonry foundations that retain earth and enclose habitable or usable spaces located below grade.
Drainage tiles, gravel, or crushed stone rains, perforated pipe or other approved systems or materials
shall be installed at or below the area to be protected and shall discharge by gravity or mechanical
means into an approved drainage system. Gravel or crushed stone drains shall extend at least 1 foot
(305mm) beyond the outside edge of the footing and 6 inches (152mm) above the top of the footing
and be covered with an approved fllter membrane material. The top of open joints of drain tiles shall
be protected with strips of building paper, and the drainage tiles or perforated pipe shall be placed on
a minimum of 2 inches (51mm) of washed gravel or crushed rock at least one sieve size larger than
the tile joint opening or perforation and covered with not less that 6 inches (152mm) of the same
material.

Note: The balance of Section 405.1, beginning with Section 405.1.1 is implemented as written.

Section 7-1-52. SECTION R902.1 REPLACED

Section R902.1 of the 2022 California Residential Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section R902.1 Roofing covering materials. Roofs shall be covered with materials as set forth
in Section R904 and R905. A minimum Class A, B or C roofing shall be installed in areas designated
by this section. Classes A, B and C roofing required by this section to be listed shall be tested in
accordance with UL 790 or ASTM E 108.

Exceptions:

1. All new buildings and additions shall be minimum Class B roof.

Page 31 of 34



2. Re-roofing, repairs or replacements on buildings shall be of the same classification as the

original roof except that non-rated and Class C roofs shall be a minimum Class C.

3. When any re-roofing, repair or replacement to an existing roof exceeds 40 percent of the
roof area, the entire roof shall be replaced with a minimum Class B roof.

4. Roofing on buildings located within Wildland — Urban Interface Fire Area shall be Class A
and meet additional requirements of Chapter 7A of the California Building Code.

For the design of fasteners for tile roofing materials, the unincorporated area of the County
shall be considered as a “Special Wind Region” with a basic wind speed over nominal 95 miles per
hour.

Note: The balance of Section R902.1, beginning with Section R902.1.1 is implemented as

written.

Section 7-1-53. CHAPTER 44 AMENDED
Chapter 44 Referenced Standards of the 2022 California Residential Code is hereby adopted in
its entirety with the same amendments for Chapter 35 Reference Standards of the 2022 California

Building Code.

Section 7-1-54. SECTION 105.2 OF DIVISION II OF CHAPTER 1 AMENDED.
Section 105.2 of Division II of Chapter 1 of the 2022 California Residential Code is hereby
amended to replace items 1 and 2, and add item 11 as follows:

(1) One-story detached accessory buildings used as tool and storage sheds, play
houses and similar uses, provided the floor area does not exceed 120 square feet, and the structure
is at least 3 feet from property line and 6 feet from other buildings or structures located on the same
property. It is permissible that these structures still be regulated by Section 710A, despite exemption

from permit.
(2) Fences not over six (6) feet high. Exception: Walls and fences less than six (6) feet

in height which are required as a condition of project approval to have permits.

(11) Other incidental structures and improvements of a minor nature may be exempt

Page 32 of 34



from the provisions of this Code upon the determination of the Building Official.

Note: The balance of Section 105.2 is implemented as written,

Section 7-1-55. SECTION 202 AMENDED

Section 202 of the 2022 California Green Building Standards Code is hereby amended to add a
definition to read as follows:

Sustainability. Consideration of present development and construction impacts on the

community, the economy, and the environment without compromising the needs of the future.

Section 7-1-56. Appendix AX ADOPTED AND AMENDED.

Section AX100 of Appendix AX of the 2022 California Residential Code is hereby adopted with
amendments in Sections 115922, 115922(a)1, 115922(a)2 and 115923 (e) to read as follows:

Section 115922(a): Except as provided in Section 115925, when a building permit is issued for
the construction of a new swimming pool or spa or the remodeling of an existing swimming pool or
spa at a private single-family home, the respective swimming pool or spa shall be equipped with item
1 and at least one additional item from 2 through 7 as drowning prevention safety features:

Section 115922(a) item 1: An enclosure that meets the requirements of 115923 and isolates
the swimming pool or spa from the private single-family home. Any walls of the residential structure
or accessory structure used to complete the isolation enclosure shall have door openings equipped
with protection as required in 115922(a) item 4 or 5. Any such door protection device provided for this
purpose shall not be used to comply with the second drowning prevention safety

Section 115922(a) item 2: Removable mesh fencing that meets American Society for Testing
and Materials (ASTM) Specifications F2286 standards in conjunction with a gate that is self-closing and
self-latching and can accommodate a key lockable device. This mesh fencing shall not be located less

than 20 inches from water’s edge.
Section 115923 item (e): An outside surface free of protrusions, cavities or other physical

characteristics that would serve as handholds or footholds that could enable a child below the age of

Page 33 of 34



five years to climb over. In order to be considered non-climbable, the following standards shall be met
where applicable: a clear zone of 3 feet measured horizontally from the enclosure, and chain link must
have maximum opening dimension of 1 % Inches, and horizontal elements which would serve as

handholdss or footholds must be separated by 48 inches or more.

Page 34 of 34



This ordinance shall take effect and be in full force thirty days from and after its passage. This

ordinance shall be published once in an adjudicated newspaper in the County of Orange within fifteen
days of its passage.

THE FOREGOING was PASSED and ADOPTED by the following vote of the Orange County
Board of Supervisors on December 06, 2022, to wit:

AYES: Supervisors:  LISA A, BARTLETT, ANDREW DO, KATRINA FOLEY
DOUG CHAFFEE

NOES:

EXCUSED: DONALD P. WAGNER

ABSTAINED:

CHAIRMAN

STATE OF CALIFORNIA )
) ss:
COUNTY OF ORANGE )
1, Valerie Sanchez, Chief Deputy Clerk of the Board of Orange County, California, hereby certify
that a copy of this document has been delivered to the Chairman of the Board and that the above and

foregoing Ordinance was duly and regularly adopted by the Orange County Board of Supervisors.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, [ have hereto set my hand and seal.

VALERIE SANCHEZ
Chief Deputy Clerk of the Board.
County of Orange, State of California

Ordinance No.: 22-004
Agenda Date:  12/06/2022
[tem No.: 28

o] [ certify that the foregoing is a true and correct copy of the
g;ﬁifﬁ'i‘- Ordinance adopted by the Board of Supervisors , Orange County,
" £

e State of California

Valerie Sanciez, ChigFDeputy Clerk of the Board of Supervisors.
By:

J i Deputy




ORANGE COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS
MINUTE ORDER
December 06, 2022

Submitting Agency/Department. OC PUBLIC WORKS

Public Hearing to consider adopting resolutions and second readings and adoption of "An Ordinance of the County of
Orange, California, Repealing the International Building Code, 2018 Edition; the California Building Code, 2019 Edition;
the California Residential Code, 2019 Edition; the California Energy Code, 2019 Edition; the California Green Building
Standards Code, 2019 Edition; the California Historical Building Code, 2019 Edition; the California Existing Building
Code, 2019 Edition; Repealing Ordinance 19-006 and Adopting by Reference the California Building Code, 2022 Edition;
the

Continued on attached page...

The following is action taken by the Board of Supervisors:
APPROVED AS RECOMMENDED & OTHER O

Unanimous O (1) DO: Y (2) FOLEY: Y (3) WAGNER: X (4) CHAFFEE: Y (5) BARTLETT: Y
Vote Key: Y=Yes; N=No; A=Abstain; X=FExcused: B.O.=Board Order

Documents accompanying this matter:

Bd Resolution(s) 22-149 - 22-153
Bd Ordinances(s) 22-004 - 22-008
O Contract(s)

[tem No. 238
Special Notes:
Copies sent to:

OCPW: ASR Coordinator Team
12/8/22

\ N h /
o Bedy/
\1:_,,"-‘5%{;?/

1 certify that the foregoing is a true and correct copy of the Minute Order adopted
by the Board of Supervisors , Orange County, State of California.

Robin Stieler, Clerk of the Board

By:
7Y%pul)'
1




ORANGE COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS
MINUTE ORDER
December 06, 2022

The following is action taken by the Board of Supervisors:
APPROVED AS RECOMMENDED & OTHER O

Unanimous O (1) DO: Y (2) FOLEY: Y (3) WAGNER: X (4) CHAFFEE: Y (5) BARTLETT: Y
Vote Key: Y=Yes: N=No; A=Abstain; X=Excused; B.O.=Board Order

International Building Code, 2021 Edition; the California Residential Code, 2022 Edition; the California Energy Code,
2022 Edition; the California Green Building Standards Code, 2022 Edition; the California Historical Building Code,
2022 Edition; the California Existing Building Code, 2022 Edition; with Amendments Thereto"; "An Ordinance of the
County of Orange, California, Repealing the 2018 Edition of the Uniform Plumbing Code, Repealing the 2019 Edition of
the California Plumbing Code Repealing Ordinance 19-009, and Adopting by Reference the Uniform Plumbing Code,
2021 Edition and the California Plumbing Code, 2022 Edition, Including Appendices, with Amendments Thereto"; "An
Ordinance of the County of Orange, California Repealing the 2018 Edition of the Uniform Mechanical Code, Repealing
the 2019 Edition of the California Mechanical Code, Repealing Ordinance 19-008 and Adopting by Reference the
Uniform Mechanical Code, 2021 Edition, and the California Mechanical Code, 2022 Edition, Amendments Thereto";
"An Ordinance of the County of Orange, California Repealing the National Electrical Code, 2017 Edition, Repealing the
California Electrical Code, 2019 Edition, Repealing Ordinance 19-009 and Adopting by Reference the National
Electrical Code, 2020 Edition and the California Electrical Code, 2022 Edition with Amendments Thereto"; "An
Ordinance of the County of Orange, California Repealing the California Fire Code, 2019 Edition Ordinance 19-010 and
Adopting by Reference the California Fire Code, 2022 Edition with Appendix B, BB, C, CC, and H and Amendments
Thereto"; and order further reading of the Ordinances be waived - All Districts (Continued from 11/29/22, Item 52)

Item No. 28

I certify that the foregoing is a true and correct copy of the Minute Order adopted
by the Board of Supervisors , Orange County, State of California.
Robin Stieler, Clerk of the Board

Y W
/ Deputy

2



Agenda Item

AGENDA STAFF REPORT
ASR Control 22-000934
MEETING DATE: 11/29/22
LEGAL ENTITY TAKING ACTION: Board of Supervisors

BOARD OF SUPERVISORS DISTRICT(S):  All Districts

SUBMITTING AGENCY/DEPARTMENT: OC Public Works (Approved)

DEPARTMENT CONTACT PERSON(S): Amanda Carr (714) 955-0601
Hadi Tabatabaee (714) 667-8843

SUBJECT: Approve and Adopt 2022 Orange County Building Codes and Fire Codes

CEO CONCUR COUNTY COUNSEL REVIEW CLERK OF THE BOARD

Concur Approved Resolution(s) and Ordinance(s) Public Hearing
3 Votes Board Majority _

Budgeted: N/A Current Year Cost: N/A Annual Cost: N/A

Staffing Impact: No # of Positions: Sole Source: N/A

Current Fiscal Year Revenue: N/A

Funding Source: N/A County Audit in last 3 years: No

Prior Board Action: 11/5/2019 #20, 11/22/2016 #32

RECOMMENDED ACTION(S):

1. Find the proposed project is statutorily exempt from CEQA pursuant to Section 21080 of the Public
Resources Code and Section 15268 of the CEQA Guidelines.

2. Read the title of the Ordinances; "2022 Building Standards, Plumbing Code, Mechanical Code,
Electrical Code and Fire Code."

3. Order further reading of the Ordinances be waived.

4. Direct the Ordinances and Resolutions be placed on the agenda of the next regularly scheduled Board
of Supervisors meeting as a public hearing pursuant to Government Code Section 50022.3 for
adoption.

5. At the next regularly scheduled Board of Supervisors meeting, consider the matter and adopt the
Ordinances and Resolutions.

SUMMARY:

Adoption of the proposed Ordinances, "2022 Building Standards, Plumbing Code, Mechanical Code,
Electrical Code and Fire Code" and Resolutions amending Title 7 (Building Regulations) and Title 3 (Fire
Page 1



Protection and Explosives) of the County of Orange Codified Ordinances will meet the State of California
mandates and support construction of safe private and public structures and facilities

BACKGROUND INFORMATION:

The State of California (State) Health and Safety Code (HSC), Section 17958 (Attachment V) mandates
that the California Building Standards Commission (CBSC) adopt and publish the California Code of
Regulations (CCR), Title 24, also referred to as the California Building Standard Codes, every three
years. The same section of the HSC also allows local governments to amend the most recent editions of
the California Construction Codes (CCC) with more restrictive requirements based on local climatic,
topographical and geological conditions. The CCC include the: Building Code; Residential Code; Energy
Code; Green Building Standards Code; and Plumbing, Mechanical, Electrical and Fire Codes. The County
of Orange (County) is required by the State to adopt the latest editions of the CBSC after the State adopts
the codes. These codes will become effective January 1, 2023, as mandated by state law. The proposed
ordinances and the most recent editions of the CCC, with the applicable County amendments, will apply
to all unincorporated areas of the County and County-owned facilities.

The 2022 Edition of the CCR, Title 24, which incorporates the CCC and Model Codes (MCs) listed
below, have been adopted by the CBSC. MCs are developed and published by non-profit organizations
such as the International Code Councils (ICC), International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical
Officials (IAPMO) and National Fire Protection Association (NFPA).

California Building Construction Codes Referenced Model Codes

2022 California Building Code 2021 International Building Code (ICC)
2022 California Historical Building Code Not Applicable

2022 California Existing Building Code Not Applicable

2022 California Residential Code 2021 International Residential Code (ICC)
2022 California Energy Code Not Applicable

2022 California Green Building Standards Code Not Applicable

2022 California Plumbing Code 2021 Uniform Plumbing Code (IAPMO)
2022 California Mechanical Code 2021 Uniform Mechanical Code (IAPMO)
2022 California Electrical Code 2020 National Electrical Code (NFPA)
2022 California Fire Code 2021 International Fire Code (ICC)

On November 22, 2016, the Board of Supervisors (Board) adopted the 2016 CCC and related MCs with
County amendments. On November 5, 2019, the Board adopted the 2019 CCC and related MCs with
County amendments.

The above listed CCC and related MCs are proposed for adoption with amendments that are necessary
due to local climatic, topographical and geological conditions. Findings are required to justify the code
modifications. Resolutions containing a summary of the code amendments and required findings are
attached.

Upon approval, the proposed ordinances would amend Title 7 (Building Regulations) and Title 3 (Fire
Protection and Explosives) of the County's Codified Ordinances. The proposed ordinances would differ
slightly from the State code in that they would include the continuation of existing County amendments
that are currently in effect including certain existing administrative amendments. These administrative
amendments allow for local administration of building regulations such as permit issuance, permit appeal
process, underground utilities, permit expiration/renewal and special inspection and violation/penalty

Page 2



provisions. Local fire protection provisions are based on recommendations from the Orange County Fire
Authority.

The proposed ordinances would also include the continuation of existing County amendments as follows:

a. Specific design criteria related to wind speed, seismic design category, flood hazard zones, etc.,
b. Steel reinforcement requirements in footings of residential dwellings to resist earthquakes,

c. Placement of drainage devices at retaining walls to reduce water pressure on the walls, and

d. Clarification of the term "Sustainability" in the Green Building Standards Code.

The proposed amendments would provide additional protection for residents of the unincorporated areas
of the County related to building and fire requirements. The proposed amendments are consistent with
those endorsed by the ICC Chapter of the County’s Code Uniformity Group and have been reviewed by
the Development Processing Review Committee, Rancho Mission Viejo and the Building Industry
Association as well as a number of local constituent groups. Most incorporated cities in the County are
adopting requirements with local amendments similar to those proposed by the County.

Compliance with CEQA: The proposed project is statutorily exempt from review under CEQA, pursuant
to Public Resources Code Section 21080(b)(1) and Section 15268(c) of the CEQA Guidelines, as a
ministerial action.

FINANCIAL IMPACT:
N/A

STAFFING IMPACT:
N/A

ATTACHMENT(S):

Attachment A - CEQA Notice of Exemption

Attachment B - 2022 Building Code, Redline Version
Attachment C - 2022 Building Code Adoption Summary
Attachment D - 2022 Plumbing Code, Redline Version
Attachment E - 2022 Plumbing Code Adoption Summary
Attachment F - 2022 Mechanical Code, Redline Version
Attachment G - 2022 Mechanical Code Adoption Summary
Attachment H - 2022 Electrical Code, Redline Version
Attachment I - 2022 Electrical Code Adoption Summary
Attachment J - 2022 Fire Code, Redline Version

Attachment K - 2022 Fire Code Adoption Summary
Attachment L - Proposed Building Standards Code Ordinance
Attachment M - Resolution for Building Standards Code Amendments
Attachment N - Proposed Plumbing Code Ordinance
Attachment O - Resolution for Plumbing Code Amendments
Attachment P - Proposed Mechanical Code Ordinance
Attachment Q - Resolution for Mechanical Code Amendments
Attachment R - Proposed Electrical Code Ordinance

Page 3



Attachment S - Resolution for Electrical Code Amendments
Attachment T - Proposed Fire Code Ordinance

Attachment U - Resolution for Fire Code Amendments
Attachment V - Health and Safety Code Section 17958
Attachment W - Public Resources Code Section 21080 (b)(1)
Attachment X - Government Code Section 50022.3
Attachment Y - Public Resources Code Section 15268(c)

Page 4



